

1 PATRICIA A. CUTLER, Assistant U.S. Trustee (#50352)
STEPHEN L. JOHNSON, Trial Attorney (#145771)
2 EDWARD G. MYRTLE, Trial Attorney (DC#375913)
MARGARET H. McGEE, Trial Attorney (#142722)
3 U.S. Department of Justice
Office of the United States Trustee
4 250 Montgomery Street, Suite 1000
San Francisco, CA 94104
5 Telephone: (415) 705-3333
Facsimile: (415) 705-3379

6 Attorneys for United States Trustee
7 Linda Ekstrom Stanley

8 **UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT**
9 **NORTHERN DISTRICT OF CALIFORNIA**
10

11 In re

12 PACIFIC GAS AND ELECTRIC
13 COMPANY,

14 Debtor.

No. 01-30923 DM

Chapter 11

Date: October 22, 2001

Time: 1:30 p.m.

15 Ctrm: Hon. Dennis Montali
235 Pine Street, 22nd Floor
16 San Francisco, California

17
18 **[CORRECTED]^y**

19 **DECLARATION OF PATRICIA A. MARTIN IN SUPPORT OF UNITED STATES**
20 **TRUSTEE'S OBJECTION TO PROFESSIONAL FEE APPLICATIONS**

21 I, Patricia A. Martin, declare:

22 1. I am a Bankruptcy Analyst employed by the United States Department of
23 Justice, Office of United States Trustee for the Northern District of California. I am the U.S.
24 Trustee bankruptcy analyst who has been assigned to review and monitor the professional
fees in the Chapter 11 Pacific Gas and Electric Company case.

25 2. Pursuant to the court's Order Establishing Interim Fee Application and
26 Expense Reimbursement Procedure, entered July 26, 2001, the Office of the U.S. Trustee

27 _____
28 ^y Some copies of the original of this document contained exhibits which were illegible
and omitted a portion of Exhibits I and N. The document is otherwise unchanged.

1 has received electronic transmissions of various professionals' monthly invoices and formal
2 fee applications. These electronic transmissions have been uploaded into a database, data
3 from which can then be downloaded into an Excel spreadsheet which allows an in-depth
4 analysis of each fee application using a variety of methods.

5 **3. Overview Analyses.** Based upon the firms' electronic transmissions and
6 using Excel software, I have prepared overviews of various firms' first fee applications which
7 are attached as follows:

- 8
- 9 Exhibit A Howard, Rice
- 10 Exhibit B Heller, Ehrman
- 11 Exhibit C Ernst & Young
- 12 Exhibit D Skadden, Arps
- 13 Exhibit E Cooley, Godward
- 14 Exhibit F Milbank, Tweed
- 15 Exhibit G Pricewaterhouse
- 16

17 **4.** In additional to the overview analyses, I also reviewed and prepared further
18 analyses, as necessary and appropriate, to identify areas in which fees being charged may
19 be questionable or require further clarification by the professional - e.g., duplicative of other
20 firm's services, administrative or overhead in nature, contrary to the court's fee guidelines,
21 or no apparent benefit to the estate.

22 **5. Heller, Ehrman (HEWM).**

23 By my calculations, HEWM is charging the estate for 1,769.4 hour or \$206,808 in
24 paralegal, law student and staff time as follows: (a) paralegals - 1173 hours, \$134,948; (b)
25 law students/summer associates - 184.9 hours, \$21,653; and (c) staff - 411.5, \$50,207.
26 See Exhibit B - Heller, Ehrman, by Professional. Of the \$206,808 in fees, \$82,522 can be
27 characterized as indexing files, reviewing and updating files and organization of files. These
28 administrative charges fees are attributable to the following individuals - Luster, Nwoso,

1 Stone, Constantine, Morris, and Gordon - and their itemized time entries are set forth in
2 Exhibit H.

3 **6. Ernst & Young Corporate Finance LLP ("Ernst & Young").**

4 In its category "firm retention", Ernst & Young charged the estate for time spent
5 checking conflicts and connections. Of the 121.2 hours or \$50,000 charge in this category,
6 I have identified 82.2 hours or \$29,705 attributable to conflicts/connections checks. This
7 number was obtained by reviewing the itemized entries under "firm retention" in Ernst &
8 Young's Exhibit D for any reference to conflicts and/or connection checks or discussions.

9 **7. Skadden, Arps ("Skadden").**

10 Skadden seeks \$7,287 for travel time at normal billing rates as follows: (a) Gohlke,
11 4/6/01, 6 hours at \$330/hr. or \$1,980; (b) Christie, 4/6/01, 6.6 hours at \$580/hr. or \$3,828,
12 and (c) Runyon, 7/23/01, 5.1 hours at \$290/hr. or \$1,479. The 4/06/01 time entry for
13 Christie indicates travel was from San Francisco to London. Skadden's expense
14 reimbursement figure of \$17,990 includes a request for \$9,255 in April. See Exhibit D -
15 Skadden Overview.

16 **8. Milbank, Tweed ("Milbank") Regulatory.**

17 A critical analysis of Milbank's fee application was difficult because the firm
18 interspersed its services related to regulatory matters through three categories: business
19 operations, other litigation, and business analysis. In an attempt to understand the firm's
20 efforts and potential benefit to the estate in the regulatory area, I printed Milbank's time
21 entries in these three categories, identified those professionals who worked primarily on
22 regulatory matters, and identified in general terms the nature of the regulatory work.

23 Exhibit I is a summary of the three categories containing fees related to
24 regulatory/legislative matters. It shows that of the 2651.3 hours or \$1,033,445 fees in these
25 three categories, at least 1813.4 hours or \$659,810 is related to regulatory/legislative work.
26 This special analysis also points out that in the category Business Operations, Exhibit I -
27 Page 2, \$51,408 in fees are being charged for summer associates billed at \$160/hour.
28 Moreover, the analysis shows that there were eight lawyers with billing rates exceeding

1 \$375 per hour billing time to regulatory matters: Mr. Kramer (\$470/hr.), Ms. Urquhart
2 (\$385/hr.), Mr. Feo (\$595/hr.), Mr. Neufeld (\$435/hr.), Mr. Sorochinsky (\$420/hr.), Mr.
3 McSpadden (\$415/hr.), Mr. Johnson (\$420/hr.) and Mr. Marks (\$450/hr.) Several of these
4 lawyers billed more than 150 hours to regulatory/legislative matters: Mr. Kramer, Ms.
5 Urquhart, Mt. Marks, Mr. Feo, and Mr. McSpadden.

6 **9. Milbank Commodities Trading Motion.**

7 Most of Milbank's charges for the securities and trading motion are found in the
8 business operations category. (There are also charges found in the creditor committee
9 category; however, they are interspersed with services related to the committee's by-laws
10 and confidentiality agreements.) The securities and trading motion cost the estate
11 approximately 250 hours or \$104,624. The trading or commodities portion cost 151 hours or
12 \$57,447 assuming you use 6/12/01 as the bifurcating date. Exhibit J sets forth the fees
13 related to the securities and trading motion.

14 **10. Milbank's Services Related to Rogers and Associates Employment.**

15 Exhibit K sets forth Milbank's fees associated with the committee's effort to employ a
16 public relations firm, Rogers & Associates. The entries, which were identified by reviewing
17 the firm's charges in its fee/employment category, totaled 33.9 hours or \$14,736. (This
18 figure included incremental hours related to other fee/employment matters. A rough
19 estimate of the Rogers & Associates related fees is \$13,000.)

20 **11. Milbank's Management of Pleadings, Intake and Distribution.**

21 Exhibit L sets forth the time entries for an individual who primarily tracked and distributed
22 pleadings for a total of 64.5 hours or \$27,090 in fees.

23 **12. Milbank's Request for Reimbursement for a Printer.**

24 Exhibit M is an itemization of Milbank's expenses based on its electronic
25 transmission(s) to the Office of the U.S. Trustee, from largest expense item to smallest. On
26 5/21/01, there is an entry of \$3,275.03 for a printer expense.

27 **13. PricewaterhouseCoopers ("PWC") Multiple Professionals.**

28 A review of PWC's time entries indicated that a considerable portion of the firm's

1 hours included conferences, meetings, and calls involving multiple professionals. For that
 2 reason, I prepared a special analysis which isolated time entries involving multiple
 3 professionals. Of the total 4,544 hours or \$1,799,553 in fees being sought by PWC, at least
 4 685 hours or \$361,233 in fees involve instances of multiple professionals. In an attempt to
 5 propose a reasonable adjustment to the multiple professional fees given the complexity of
 6 the case, I calculated that an adjustment of \$167,851 in fees or 46.5% of the fees being
 7 sought was a reasonable adjustment based on the following:

	As Requested	Sugg.Adj.
9 Creditor Committee Meetings	178.8 hrs	\$89,774.00
10 PwC in House Meetings	76.8 hrs	35,191.00
11 Comm.Conference Calls	225.8 hrs.	118,012.00
12 Calls/Mtgs-Other Prof.	44.4 hrs.	24,942.00
13 Meetings/Calls with PGE	135.9 hrs.	73,915.00
14 Court hearings	37.7 hrs.	19,399.00
15 Total	685.1	\$361,233.00
		\$167,941.00


16 The suggested adjustment would allow two professionals to attend creditor committee
 17 meetings, committee conferences, meeting with other professionals and meetings with the
 18 debtor. All in-house conferencing would be disallowed. Court and other hearings would
 19 only be attended by one person. Exhibit N is the special analysis of PWC's multiple
 20 professionals' hours.

21 **14. PWC - Creation of Time and Expense Billing System.**

22 Exhibit O is a summary of the time entries related to PWC's fee application category.
 23 A review of the time entries for Ortwein (92 hours or \$18,400) and Perfit (126.6 hours or
 24 \$25,320) indicate that the firm is charging the estate roughly \$43,720 in fees creating a
 25 customized billing and time-reporting system.

26 ≡
 27 ≡
 28 ≡

1 I declare under penalty of perjury of the laws of the State of California that the
2 foregoing is true and correct. Executed this 16th day of October, 2001, at San Francisco,
3 California.

4
5 
6 Patricia A. Martin

7
8
9
10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24
25
26
27
28

Howard Rice First Fee Application (By Matter)
 Pacific Gas & Electric
 April - July, 2001

	PROFESSIONAL HOURS					% of Hours	PROFESSIONAL FEES					% of Fees
	Apr-01	May-01	Jun-01	Jul-01	Cumulative		Apr-01	May-01	Jun-01	Jul-01	Cumulative	
14199.003 Case Administration	848.7	807.0	811.2	704.8	3,174.7	19.80%	217,027	181,336	150,010	112,675	661,048	14.99%
	Attorney admin hours						Attorney admin dollars					
	Paralegal admin hours						Paralegal admin dollars					
14199.020 Litigation-Generators	82.7	856.8	359.0	332.6	1,631.1	10.18%	29,327	193,203	92,412	93,364	408,305	9.26%
14199.024 TURN Acc'd Adversary	525.7	640.3	84.5	65.9	1,316.5	8.22%	132,230	195,381	25,242	15,730	368,583	8.36%
14199.019 Litigation-Cal ISO	148.4	36.1	270.8	284.4	739.7	4.62%	39,802	10,639	89,955	86,051	226,446	5.13%
14199.028 Cal ISO	93.0	426.8	0.0	0.0	519.8	3.25%	23,297	122,631	0	0	145,928	3.31%
14199.009 Pers. Property Leases	271.2	253.7	66.6	49.5	641.0	4.00%	63,942	67,699	20,718	15,458	167,817	3.80%
14199.056 PSE Appeal	0.0	0.0	89.5	547.8	637.3	3.98%	0	0	28,865	125,626	154,491	3.50%
14199.005 General Operations	145.5	144.8	190.3	103.4	584.0	3.65%	46,420	47,292	53,389	31,600	178,700	4.05%
14199.004 Prof. Emp & Comp	38.5	111.1	178.1	240.3	568.0	3.55%	13,815	32,242	45,993	69,760	161,810	3.67%
14199.012 RS Motions	119.6	246.2	127.8	72.9	566.5	3.54%	27,275	78,260	39,842	19,349	164,725	3.73%
14199.023 DWR Servicing Agreement	179.3	222.9	113.4	30.5	546.1	3.41%	47,514	65,503	35,490	10,997	159,504	3.62%
14199.030 DWR Payment Action	15.4	66.0	43.2	105.5	230.1	1.44%	3,773	18,208	14,144	34,670	70,795	1.60%
14199.022 Cred. Ralpyr. Cr Comm Mtrs	83.9	208.8	135.8	90.0	518.5	3.24%	30,314	67,924	50,487	44,402	193,127	4.38%
	Creditor Committee Hours						Creditor Committee Work - Fees					
	Ratepayer Committee Hours						Ratepayer Committee - Fees					
	Other Creditor Matters Hours						Other Creditor Matters - Fees					
14199.048 2004 Exams - ISO & PX	31.0	174.4	180.3	116.7	502.4	3.14%	7,360	48,431	52,881	33,747	142,419	3.23%
14199.015 Plan & Disc. Stmt.	24.4	42.5	65.9	230.1	362.9	2.27%	10,370	23,354	31,926	85,309	150,958	3.42%
14199.016 Adv. Proceedings	244.2	65.0	40.1	11.4	360.7	2.25%	78,660	13,307	10,427	4,373	106,787	2.42%
14199.051 E-Meter Contract	0	27.8	149.4	132.2	309.4	1.93%	0	10,430	45,745	40,278	96,453	2.19%
14199.049 Sempira Dispute & Lit.	0	57.0	240.3	11.7	309.0	1.93%	0	16,090	60,355	4,254	80,699	1.83%
14199.013 Claims & Objections	8.0	104.5	52.8	138.4	303.7	1.90%	2,748	23,486	15,623	41,836	83,692	1.90%
14199.025 Environmental Issues	69.7	165.0	35.1	10.8	280.6	1.75%	23,467	50,912	13,525	4,136	92,039	2.09%
14199.007 Regulatory Matters	64.0	37.4	30.3	107.7	232.4	1.49%	18,678	14,582	12,329	28,872	74,461	1.69%
14199.027 Reclamation Issues	38.6	73.3	68.0	52.1	232.0	1.45%	8,549	15,679	13,122	11,844	49,193	1.12%
14199.008 Real Property Leases	14.0	89.8	69.5	11.3	184.6	1.15%	5,227	27,171	18,001	3,962	54,360	1.23%
14199.006 Employee Comp & Mtrs	18.4	61.8	74.9	5.7	160.8	1.00%	5,484	20,962	28,514	2,442	57,411	1.30%
14199.010 Cash Collateral	86.5	26.1	15.9	11.4	139.9	0.87%	28,720	9,861	5,484	3,876	47,941	1.09%
14199.047 POSDEF	7.3	41.9	67.6	0.4	117.2	0.73%	11,811	11,811	19,465	166	33,413	0.76%
14199.029 Sierra Pac. Litigation	42.6	49.9	5.1	2.5	100.1	0.62%	11,308	17,694	2,031	1,038	32,070	0.73%
14199.017 Litigation-CPUC & FERC	50.9	32.8	14.0	0.0	97.7	0.61%	17,618	14,762	5,095	0	37,475	0.85%
14199.031 Sch & Statements	4.0	28.1	54.9	6.0	93.0	0.58%	1,400	11,503	20,540	2,310	35,753	0.81%
14199.018 Litigation-CalPX	45.6	22.6	1.8	10.2	80.2	0.50%	11,558	6,747	612	3,678	22,595	0.51%
14199.011 Post-Pet Financing	32.5	8.5	5.9	24.3	71.2	0.44%	13,005	3,522	2,570	10,013	29,109	0.66%
14199.042 E-Commerce Legal Issues	4.3	64.5	0	0	68.8	0.43%	1,140	19,240	0	0	20,380	0.46%
14199.050 Co-Defendant Employees	0	57.5	2.4	0	59.9	0.37%	0	14,789	612	0	15,401	0.35%
14199.058 Oildale Appeal	0	0	0	59.7	59.7	0.37%	0	0	0	16,223	16,223	0.37%

14199.026	Real Property Sales	9.3	11.1	2.0	37.2	59.6	0.37%	3,825	4,514	763	14,271	23,373	0.53%
14199.053	Mirant Dispute Lit	0	12.8	32.2	2.5	47.5	0.30%	0	4,132	7,968	610	12,710	0.29%
14199.054	Enron Dispute	0	0	1.1	35.1	36.2	0.23%	0	0	357	8,439	8,796	0.20%
14199.055	Oldale Energy	0	0	26.4	1.0	27.4	0.17%	0	0	7,996	368	8,364	0.19%
14199.057	Three Mountain	0	0	0	17.7	17.7	0.14%	0	0	0	6,638	6,638	0.15%
14199.014	Asset Sales	5.0	5.8	0	0	10.8	0.07%	2,125	2,664	0	0	4,789	0.11%
14199.052	Access Agreement	0.0	0	7.9	0	7.9	0.05%	0	0	3,674	0	3,674	0.08%
14199.044	Silicon Energy Contract	3.8	0	0	0	3.8	0.02%	1,605	0	0	0	1,605	0.04%
14199.032	Intellectual Property	0	2.7	0	0	2.7	0.02%	0	747	0	0	747	0.02%
14199.046	Modesto Irrigation	0	1.0	0	0	1.0	0.01%	0	395	0	0	395	0.01%
14199.040	Diablo Canyon	0.3	0	0	0	0.3	0.00%	140	0	0	0	140	0.00%
14199.033	Corporate Service Dept	0.1	0	0	0	0.1	0.00%	18	0	0	0	18	0.00%
	TOTAL	3,356.4	5,284.3	3,713.9	3,663.7	16,018.3	100.00%	929,738	1,467,096	1,026,157	988,360	4,411,351	100.00%
	Voluntary Fee Reduction											(9,232)	
	Fees Requested											4,402,119	

HOWARD RICE First Fee Application - BY ATTORNEY
Pacific Gas & Electric
April - July, 2001

	PROFESSIONAL HOURS					PROFESSIONAL FEES					
	Hly Rates	Apr-01	May-01	Jun-01	Jul-01	Cumulative	Apr-01	May-01	Jun-01	Jul-01	Cumulative
LOPES	425/550	270.1	288.4	214.2	219.3	992.0	114,793	158,620	117,810	120,615	511,838
LAFFERTY	350/360	213.4	301.7	232.8	225.7	973.6	74,690	108,612	83,772	81,245	348,319
KAPLAN	325/340	188.1	219.6	213.0	158.2	778.9	61,133	74,664	71,803	53,788	261,387
SCHAFFER	400/415	169.2	197.2	130.6	137.4	634.4	67,680	81,838	54,403	57,021	260,942
NEXON	370/385	194.5	191.1	190.7	166.7	743.0	71,965	73,574	73,420	64,180	283,138
MARGOLIN	290/300	266.3	171.1	104.0	220.4	761.8	77,227	51,330	31,200	66,120	225,877
SCHON	410/430	79.2	152.8	105.1	57.2	394.3	32,472	65,704	45,193	24,596	167,965
COUSSON	270/280	92.6	266.6	220.1	174.8	754.1	25,002	74,648	61,656	48,972	210,278
ZAPPARONI	230/240	120.9	229.6	175.5	146.6	672.6	27,807	55,104	42,120	35,184	160,215
FALK	475/550	83.1	83.2	0.7	0.7	195.3	39,473	45,760	15,565	385	101,183
KING	255/265	161.7	179.8	86.7	92.7	520.9	41,234	47,647	22,976	24,566	136,422
BLISS	210/215	86.4	197.2	103.2	147.2	534.0	18,144	42,398	22,188	31,648	114,378
FULLER	230/240	31.0	148.7	161.9	105.5	447.1	7,130	35,898	38,856	25,320	106,994
DROBAC	245/255	97.5	145.7	52.3	44.1	339.6	23,888	37,154	13,337	11,246	85,623
SILBER	245/255	80.2	128.2	35.9	26.8	269.1	19,649	32,181	9,155	6,834	67,819
SCHULMAN	370/385	4.5	39.0	51.4	41.8	136.7	1,685	15,015	19,789	16,093	52,562
NEALE	360/375	50.1	66.0	12.3	28.3	159.7	18,036	25,875	4,613	10,613	59,136
MAYER	430/475	18.9	56.6	0.6	0.3	76.4	8,127	26,885	285	143	35,440
ABBOTT	445/465	4.1	33.5	51.3	38.0	126.9	1,825	15,578	23,855	17,670	58,927
HERSHENSON	360/375	20.9	71.8	53.4	13	159.1	7,524	26,925	20,025	4,875	59,349
GUPTA	215	0.0	74.7	43.7	43.2	161.6	0	16,061	9,396	9,288	34,744
GREENDORFER	255/285	96.3	38.7	0	0	135.0	24,557	10,256	0	0	34,812
KATZEN	215	0	108.7	54.4	30.4	193.5	0	23,371	11,696	6,536	41,603
MOORE	255/265	47.5	58.7	70.6	98.5	275.3	12,113	15,556	18,709	26,103	72,480
SHIN	175/180	130.6	53.1	19.1	4.4	207.2	22,855	9,558	3,438	1,056	36,907
SUTTON	175/180	35.8	69.9	19.8	42.1	167.6	6,265	12,982	3,564	7,999	30,410
STEWART	395	0	1	49.5	127.1	177.6	0	395	19,553	50,205	70,152
CALANDE	370/385	1.1	15.1	21.8	0	39.0	407	6,199	8,393	0	14,999
FRANKEL	320	0	49.6	0	0	49.6	0	15,872	0	0	15,872
SHEFT	380	0	49	0	0	49.0	0	13,720	0	0	13,720
DAWSARI	210/215	9.6	51.8	2.9	0	64.3	2,016	11,137	624	0	13,777
PROCTOR	210/215	13.9	75.3	0.7	0	89.9	2,919	16,190	151	0	19,259
OTHER ATTYS	Various	10.7	20.2	19.2	47.9	98.0	3,173	5,086	7,173	14,185	29,617
Total Attorneys		2,578.2	3,635.6	2,325.0	2,438.3	11,377.1	813,765	1,251,179	854,713	816,482	3,736,138
Paralegals		778.3	1448.81	1185.5	1225.4	4,638.0	116,431	215,925	170,175	171,878	674,409
Total		3,356.5	5,284.4	3,710.5	3,663.7	16,015.1	930,196	1,467,104	1,024,888	988,360	4,410,547
Per Cover Sheet Applications		3358.2	5283.4	3711.6	3666.98	16,020.2	929,738	1,466,701	1,025,746	989,167	4,411,352
Difference		1.7	(1.0)	1.1	3.3	5.1	(458)	(403)	858	807	805

Heller, Ehrman - By Matter
 Pacific Gas and Electric Case
 First Fee Application - April through July, 2001

Billing Categories	April, 2001		May, 2001		June, 2001		July, 2001		Heller, Ehrman Total, April - July, 2001			
	Hours	Fees	Hours	Fees	Hours	Fees	Hours	Fees	Hours	Fees	% Hours	% Fees
63 FERC Docket EL00-95 & Related Dockets/Matters (Seeking FERC intervention into Ca. market)	192.0	57,187	390.8	104,612	629.0	143,083	920.6	236,665	2,132.4	541,547	27.58%	24.99%
64 Federal Filed Rate Case	280.7	64,954	493.0	126,701	416.2	94,536	265.2	65,113	1,455.1	351,304	18.82%	16.21%
65 Richard D. Wilson v. PGE & PGE Corp.	12.8	2,363	0.4	101	0.0	0	0.0	0	13.2	2,464	0.17%	0.11%
67 FERC Docket ER01-889 (Creditworthiness)	46.9	20,872	91.3	35,545	18.9	7,012	31.5	9,467	188.6	72,896	2.44%	3.36%
68 Qualifying Facility Proceedings/Issues	6.2	2,325	119.8	38,898	259.7	85,784	33.7	11,384	419.4	138,391	5.42%	6.39%
69 FERC Docket RP00-241 (CPUC v. El Paso)	301.3	79,994	690.5	197,770	410.9	113,104	266.1	61,930	1,668.8	452,738	21.58%	20.89%
70 FERC Dockets RP01-484&486 (El Paso Capacity Related Complaints)	0	0	0	0	0	0	14.0	4,202	14.0	4,202	0.18%	0.19%
71 FERC Order 637 & Dockets RP99-507, RP00-139, RP00-336 (El Paso Compliance Filing)	0	0	2.6	833	0	0	18.5	6,161	21.1	6,994	0.27%	0.32%
72 FERC Docket RP97-288 (Transwestern Pipeline Co.)	0	0	0	0	0	0	0.4	133	0.4	133	0.01%	0.01%
73 Other FERC Gas Dockets/Matters	0	0	1.8	560	0.8	249	2.9	996	5.5	1,805	0.07%	0.08%
74 Scller/Generator Issues	14.9	4,860	84.1	27,332	28.1	8,788	7.2	2,406	134.3	43,386	1.74%	2.00%
75 General Corporate Issues	6.9	3,045	0.0	0	5.0	1,883	0.7	311	12.6	5,239	0.16%	0.24%
76 CPUC Docket 01-03-082	380.9	114,836	80.1	27,002	316.6	95,156	0.4	142	778.0	237,136	10.06%	10.94%
77 CPUC OH Proceeding	15.8	4,271	25.8	9,904	23.3	9,579	1.0	364	65.9	24,118	0.85%	1.11%
78 Other CPUC and California State Law Matters	10.3	4,047	51.0	16,143	61.3	21,085	11.1	5,064	133.7	46,339	1.73%	2.14%
79 Other Advice, Consult, Research re Energy Issues	0	0	22.1	8,115	0.6	275	1.2	521	23.9	8,911	0.31%	0.41%
80 CPUC Prudence Review	2.8	1,254	6.7	2,843	66.9	23,688	221.6	72,756	298.0	100,541	3.85%	4.64%
81 Ancillary BK Services Related to Other Matters and Administration	48.6	14,793	58.5	22,441	158.1	52,098	8.2	1,793	273.4	91,125	3.54%	4.20%
82 Bankruptcy Employment and Fee Applications	22.9	10,040	22.0	9,073	6.8	2,542	41.7	16,409	93.4	38,064	1.21%	1.76%
Totals	1,343.0	\$384,781	2,140.5	\$627,873	2,402.2	\$658,862	1,846.0	\$495,817	7,731.7	\$2,167,333	100.00%	100.00%

PG&E - Heller Ehrman First Fee Application

April - July, 2001

Total, April - July, 2001

By Professional		April, 2001		May, 2001		June, 2001		July, 2001		Total	Total	Percentage of			
		Hours	Fees	Hours	Fees	Hours	Fees	Hours	Fees	Hours	Fees	Hrs./Group	Hrs./Total	Fees/Total	
Professional	Position														
Fiala	Shareholder	95.7	40,268	195.6	81,070	141.5	60,747	108	47,500	540.8	229,585	23.51%	6.99%	10.59%	
Berman	Shareholder	98.1	40,197	156	63,355	153.7	56,894	202.4	73,876	610.2	234,322	26.53%	7.89%	10.81%	
Reiber	Shareholder	82.5	29,370	111.2	39,587	140.4	49,982	67.3	23,959	401.4	142,898	17.45%	5.19%	6.59%	
Cole	Shareholder	139.9	46,923	49.4	16,012	86.9	28,212	11.7	3,605	287.9	94,752	12.52%	3.72%	4.37%	
Stosser	Shareholder	1	405	33.7	11,833	107.5	41,997	8.5	3,442	150.7	57,677	6.55%	1.95%	2.66%	
Benvenuto	Shareholder	30.5	12,791	37.5	15,775	41.4	17,099	4.2	1,693	113.6	47,358	4.94%	1.47%	2.19%	
Rushforth	Shareholder	8.9	3,524	17.5	6,930	33.9	13,424	0	0	60.3	23,878	6.2%	0.78%	1.10%	
Hayden	Shareholder	0.5	198	12.2	4,831	31.6	12,513	49.8	19,720	94.1	37,262	4.09%	1.22%	1.72%	
Popofsky	Shareholder	4.2	2,185	8.1	3,894	18	8,514	1.7	804	32	15,397	1.39%	0.41%	0.71%	
Popovic	Shareholder	4.3	1,471	0	0	0	0	0	0	4.3	1,471	0.19%	0.06%	0.07%	
Charlson	Shareholder	3.4	1,438	0	0	0	0	0	0	3.4	1,438	0.15%	0.04%	0.07%	
Weise	Shareholder	0	0	1.2	702	0	0	0	0	1.2	702	0.05%	0.02%	0.03%	
Brown	Shareholder	0	0	0.5	192	0	0	0	0	0.5	192	0.02%	0.01%	0.01%	
Total Shareholders		469	178,770	622.9	244,181	754.9	289,382	453.6	174,599	2300.4	886,932	100.00%	29.75%	40.92%	
Kim	Sp. Counsel	43.5	13,529	207.5	64,532	117.7	36,605	145.4	45,219	514.1	159,885	57.05%	6.65%	7.38%	
Borrasca	Sp. Counsel	18.1	5,702	70.3	22,145	96	30,240	70.3	22,145	254.7	80,232	28.26%	3.29%	3.70%	
Stelck	Sp. Counsel	0	0	5.8	1,699	64.5	18,898	27	7,911	97.3	28,508	10.80%	1.26%	1.32%	
Bratton	Sp. Counsel	0	0	0	0	32.8	11,086	0	0	32.8	11,086	3.64%	0.42%	0.51%	
Johnson	Sp. Counsel	0	0	0	0	1.7	498	0	0	1.7	498	0.19%	0.02%	0.02%	
Todderud	Sp. Counsel	0	0	0	0	0.6	176	0	0	0.6	176	0.07%	0.01%	0.01%	
Total Special Counsel		61.6	19,231	283.6	88,376	313.3	97,503	242.7	75,275	901.2	280,385	100.00%	11.66%	12.94%	
Mohler	Associate	148	49,284	296.6	98,767	177.6	59,140	66.8	22,244	689	229,435	24.96%	8.91%	10.59%	
Fagan	Associate	107.3	35,730	238.3	79,353	105.2	35,032	208.4	69,397	659.2	219,512	23.88%	8.53%	10.13%	
Collanton	Associate	123.2	35,482	113.6	32,717	180.3	51,926	109.9	31,651	527	151,776	19.09%	6.82%	7.00%	
Gould	Associate	66.2	11,651	30.9	5,438	85.2	14,995	33.6	5,914	215.9	37,998	7.82%	2.79%	1.75%	
Sheen	Associate	48.6	13,559	46.3	12,918	18.6	5,189	1.2	335	114.7	32,001	4.15%	1.48%	1.48%	
Gordon	Associate	29.7	7,484	30.3	7,636	30.7	7,736	3	756	93.7	23,612	3.39%	1.21%	1.09%	
Adams-Duma	Associate	0	0	0	0	66.2	18,470	0	0	66.2	18,470	2.40%	0.86%	0.85%	
Andrea	Associate	0	0	26.2	4,244	19.9	3,224	96.7	15,665	142.8	23,133	5.17%	1.85%	1.07%	
Hocken	Associate	0	0	24.2	5,227	0	0	38.5	8,316	62.7	13,543	2.27%	0.81%	0.62%	
Grace	Associate	0	0	0	0	0	0	103.7	21,466	103.7	21,466	3.76%	1.34%	0.99%	
Jolish	Associate	0	0	0	0	0	0	61	15,372	61	15,372	2.21%	0.79%	0.71%	
Wunderli	Associate	0	0	7.2	2,398	0	0	0	0	7.2	2,398	0.26%	0.09%	0.11%	
Llaurado	Associate	7.1	1,789	0	0	0	0	0	0	7.1	1,789	0.26%	0.09%	0.08%	
Jaffe	Associate	2.1	529	0.4	101	1.8	454	0	0	4.3	1,084	0.16%	0.06%	0.05%	
Glass	Associate	0	0	0	0	3.7	1,132	0.5	153	4.2	1,285	0.15%	0.05%	0.06%	
Switzer	Associate	0	0	1.9	334	0	0	0	0	1.9	334	0.07%	0.02%	0.02%	
Total Associates		532.2	155,508	815.9	249,133	689.2	197,298	723.3	191,269	2760.6	793,208	100.00%	35.71%	36.60%	
Luster	Paralegal	85.6	11,984	122.5	17,150	93.6	13,104	67.9	9,506	369.6	51,744	31.51%	4.78%	2.39%	
McLaughlin	Paralegal	77.6	7,682	134.5	13,316	102.4	10,138	49.5	4,901	364	36,037	31.03%	4.71%	1.66%	
Nwoso	Paralegal	21.3	2,407	28.3	3,198	39.3	4,441	11	1,243	99.9	11,289	8.52%	1.29%	0.52%	
Contino	Paralegal	1.9	232	18.8	2,294	63.9	7,796	0	0	84.6	10,322	7.21%	1.09%	0.48%	
Temporary Paralegal	Paralegal	58.1	5,229	41.6	3,744	20.4	1,836	0	0	120.1	10,809	10.24%	1.55%	0.50%	
Whitehead	Paralegal	16	2,240	10.7	1,498	9.9	1,366	13.5	1,890	50.1	7,014	4.27%	0.65%	0.32%	
Tempelis	Paralegal	0	0	0	0	28.3	2,547	19.6	1,764	47.9	4,311	4.08%	0.62%	0.20%	
Stone	Paralegal	0	0	0	0	21.4	1,926	5.4	486	26.8	2,412	2.28%	0.35%	0.11%	
Holzer	Paralegal	0	0	0	0	8.9	881	0.6	59	9.5	940	0.81%	0.12%	0.04%	
Williams	Paralegal	0	0	0	0	0.5	70	0	0	0.5	70	0.04%	0.01%	0.00%	
Total Paralegals		280.5	29,774	356.4	41,200	388.6	44,125	167.5	19,849	1173	134,948	100.00%	15.17%	6.23%	
Kolek	Summ. Assoc.	0	0	0	0	0	0	24.5	3,651	24.5	3,651	13.25%	0.32%	0.17%	
Davidson	Law Student	0	0	6.3	712	66.2	9,741	62.5	7,063	155	17,516	83.83%	2.00%	0.81%	
Gruhl	Law Student	0	0	0	0	5.4	486	0	0	5.4	486	2.92%	0.07%	0.02%	
Total Law Students, Sum. Assoc.		0	0	6.3	712	91.6	10,227	87	10,714	184.9	21,653	100.00%	2.39%	1.00%	
Stewart	Staff	0	0	0	0	0	0	2	180	2	180	0.49%	0.03%	0.01%	
Leon	Staff	0	0	0	0	70	12,600	105.5	18,990	175.5	31,590	42.65%	2.27%	1.46%	
Constantine	Staff	0	0	11	990	50.9	4,581	23.3	2,098	85.2	7,669	20.70%	1.10%	0.35%	
Morris	Staff	15	1,020	28.7	1,952	35.5	2,414	40	2,721	119.2	8,107	28.97%	1.54%	0.37%	
Gordon	Staff	0	0	9.9	802	6.5	529	0	0	16.4	1,331	3.99%	0.21%	0.06%	
Simcox	Staff	1.2	151	1.5	190	1.2	151	0.9	114	4.8	606	1.17%	0.06%	0.03%	
Leasy	Staff	2	136	3.6	246	0.2	14	0.1	7	5.9	403	1.43%	0.08%	0.02%	
Alderman	Staff	1.5	191	0.7	92	0.3	38	0	0	2.5	321	0.61%	0.03%	0.01%	
Total Staff		19.7	1,498	55.4	4,272	164.6	20,327	171.8	24,110	411.5	50,207	100.00%	5.32%	2.32%	
Total, April - July, 2001		1343	\$384,781	2140.5	\$627,874	2402.2	\$658,862	1845.9	\$495,816	7731.6	\$2,167,333	100.00%		100.00%	

ERNST & YOUNG FIRST FEE APPLICATION
Pacific Gas & Electric
For Period April - June, 2001*

* Note ending billing date differs from other professionals.

Ernst & Young Billing Categories	Nachinsson \$650/hour		Carlson, E. \$575/hour		Thomas \$475/hour		Allsworth \$375/hour		Frazier \$340/hour		Carlson, O. \$275/hour		Others		Ernst & Young Total, Apr - July, 2001	
	Hrs.	Fees	Hrs.	Fees	Hrs.	Fees	Hrs.	Fees	Hrs.	Fees	Hrs.	Fees	Hrs.	Fees	Hrs.	Fees
Review Newly Received Documents	12.3	7,995	3.6	2,070			6.1	2,288							22.0	12,353
Gen. Communications w/Creditors			10.3	5,923			5.8	2,156							16.1	8,079
Prep/Review Information Requests	7.7	4,973	17.1	9,833	12.1	5,749	5	1,875	1.3	444	34.6	9,516		77.8	32,390	
Analyst/Prep BK Sct. & Stmt.	8.8	5,590	46.3	26,623	61.4	24,416	8.5	3,188			13.5	3,713		128.3	63,529	
Analyze Intercompany Claims					8.3	3,923					22.3	6,133		30.6	10,056	
Analysis of Other Claims	1.8	1,170	0.5	288	1.7	808								4.0	2,265	
Claims Management Process	20.2	13,130	27	15,525	55.4	26,315			80.6	27,404	152.8	42,020		338.0	124,394	
Preparation for 341 Meeting	1.5	975	2.8	1,610	6.7	3,183					3.3	908		14.3	6,675	
Prep/Part in Migs/Calls w/PGE & Counsel	2.1	13,650	38.6	22,195	1.5	713	5.9	2,194						47.8	29,278	
Prep/Part in Old Com. Migs/Calls	23.6	15,363	24.2	13,915										79.1	48,460	
Participate in Other Financing Matters	64.9	42,185	5.1	2,933	4.2	1,996					4.9	1,348		112.5	70,753	
Participation in Negot/Formulation of Plan	88.4	57,485	20.2	11,615	1.9	903	2	750			12.5	3,439	49	17,724		
Firm Retention	2	1,300	15.9	9,143	28.7	13,633	12.7	4,763			14.1	3,878		120.9	50,000	
Preparation of Misc. Financial Analysis	5.3	3,445	1.5	863	15.5	7,365			2	680				38.4	16,228	
Vendor Management & Related Matters	4.9	3,185	4.1	2,358										9.0	5,543	
Analyst/Prep S-T Cash Flow Projections	24	15,600	11.5	6,613	9	4,275	23.1	8,625			8.8	2,420		76.4	37,533	
Totals	286.2	\$186,046	228.7	\$131,503	196.4	\$93,273	69.1	\$25,838	83.9	\$28,528	266.8	\$73,372	49.1	\$17,724	1,180.2	\$556,283
Professional % of Hours	24.25%		19.38%		15.64%		5.85%		7.11%		22.61%		4.18%		100.00%	
Professional % of Fees		33.44%		23.64%		16.77%		4.64%		5.13%		13.19%		3.19%		100.00%

Nachinsson, Carlson (E), Thomas
 Total Hours at \$475/hr & higher 711.3
 Total Fees at \$475/hr & higher \$410,921
 Total % of Hours at \$475/hr & higher 60.27%
 Total % of Fees at \$475/hr & higher 73.85%

EXHIBIT C

Skadden, Arps, Slate, Meagher & Flom First Fee Application
 Special Regulatory Counsel
 Pacific Gas & Electric
 April - July, 2001

Billing Categories	April, 2001		May, 2001		June, 2001		July, 2001		Total April - July, 2001			
	Hours	Fees	Hours	Fees	Hours	Fees	Hours	Fees	Hours	Fees	% Hours	% Fees
WAPA Dispute												
Trans Asset Divestiture	205.5	72,978	21.9	8,132	217.0	57,106	487.1	125,518	704.1	182,824	53.81%	47.69%
Transco					1.6	464	15.2	4,660	244.2	86,234	18.66%	22.52%
Trans Owner Tariffs			6.7	1,910	13.4	5,385	160.0	53,104	173.4	58,489	13.25%	15.27%
WEPEX			0.3	114	29.1	6,371	135.0	41,480	170.8	49,761	13.06%	12.99%
Contract Termination							8.6	3,010	8.9	3,124	0.68%	0.82%
Totals	205.5	\$72,978	28.9	\$10,156	261.1	\$69,326	812.9	\$230,502	1,308.4	\$382,962	100.00%	100.00%

Total April - July, 2001

Professionals	Range of Hourly Rates	Hours	Fees	% Hrs.	% Fees
Partners	\$450 - \$580	241.3	112,571	18.44%	29.40%
Counsel	\$380 - \$390	38.7	14,993	2.96%	3.92%
Associates	\$235 - \$380	844.53	233,794	64.55%	61.06%
Paraprofessionals	\$65 - \$150	183.9	21,555	14.06%	5.63%
		1308.43	\$382,913	100.00%	100.00%

Description of services performed in billing categories:

WAPA Dispute Rate filing before FEREC to revise & recover energy, scheduling, & transmission rates from Western Power Administration and to revise transmission-related rates for Delta and Clites contracts.

Transmission Assets Divestiture [Note: this category includes 26.4 hrs. or \$7,656 related to professional's employment & fee matters.] Narrative describes services as being related to possible sale of transmission assets, interconnection agreements.

Transco FPA Section 205, RTO West

Trans Owner Tariffs Litigation pending before FEREC regarding utility's recovery of its based transmission rates, grid management changes, scheduling coordinator services costs and reliability services costs.

WEPEX Miscellaneous matters related to California's electric market restructuring

Contract Termination FEREC proceedings to terminate interconnection agreements with Northern California Power Agency, Silicon Valley Power.

Travel Time Charged

Date	Activity	Hours	Fees
04/06/2001 (Trans. Asset)	Gofhike	6	1,980
04/06/2001 (Trans. Asset)	Christie	6.6	580
07/23/2001 (WAPA)	Runyon	5.1	290
		18	\$7,287

Travel Expenses (Per Cover Sheet Application, dated 8/30/01)

Month	Expenses	Total
April	9,255 (Only billing category: trans-asset divestiture)	
May	146	
June	5,660	
July	2,929	
		\$17,990

EXHIBIT D

Matters	Note	April, 2001		May, 2001		June, 2001		July, 2001		Total April - July, 2001		% Hrs.	% Fees
		Hrs.	Fees	Hrs.	Fees	Hrs.	Fees	Hrs.	Fees	Hrs.	Fees		
Litigation (Block Forward Contract Seizure)	A	74.4	22,382	68.4	24,278	29.1	7,964	49.6	14,046	221.5	68,670	24.07%	23.33%
Energy Crisis - Business Operations	B	107.4	35,995							107.4	35,995	11.67%	12.23%
~ Research re State Supremacy & BK laws	C			96.3	29,696	2.75	908	433.4	140,544	96.3	29,696	10.47%	10.09%
~ CPUC Order re FERC RTO Requirements	D					2	403	10.8	3,274	436.2	141,452	47.40%	48.05%
~ CPUC DWR Matters								493.8	\$157,864	58.8	18,539	6.39%	6.30%
Employment/Fee Application Issues		39.4	12,326	6.6	2,536					920.2	\$294,352	100.00%	100.00%
Totals		221.2	\$70,703	171.3	\$56,510	33.85	\$9,274	493.8	\$157,864	920.2	\$294,350	100.00%	100.00%

Attorneys	HR Rate	Hrs.	Fees	Hrs.	Fees	Hrs.	Fees	Hrs.	Fees	Hrs.	Fees	% Hrs.	% Fees
Stephen Neal (looks like client contact work)	600	3.3	1,980	5.5	3,300			21.9	13,140	30.7	18,420	3.34%	6.26%
Michael Kelly (Employment)	475	9.4	4,465	4.8	2,280	0.5	238	1.3	618	16.0	7,600	1.74%	2.58%
Marlin Schenker (Legal Strategy)	435	15.9	6,917	19.7	8,570	1.3	566	36.3	15,791	73.2	31,843	7.96%	10.82%
Peter Carson (Px lien on BFM claim)	430		0	0.5	215	2.4	1,032			2.9	1,247	0.32%	0.42%
Robert Eisenbach (Px lien ...)	420	0.5	252	2.2	924					2.8	1,176	0.30%	0.40%
John C. Dwyer (Primarily Block Forw Contract Issues)	370	56.3	20,831	52.8	19,536	6	2,220	54.1	22,181	54.1	22,181	5.88%	7.54%
Linda Callison (Research, BK enjoin Strag action)	365	19.3	7,045		0			58.6	20,314	173.7	62,901	18.88%	21.37%
Charles Schrabie (Research, BK enjoin Strag action)	355		0		0					19.3	7,045	2.10%	2.39%
James C. Maroulis (Draft DWR Rev, Req Petition)	350		0		0			55.4	19,667	55.4	19,667	6.02%	6.68%
Gregg S. Keiner (Krudsen & Fees)	300		0		0			6.1	2,135	6.1	2,135	0.65%	0.73%
J. Timothy Nardell (Research re CPUC ratemaking)	270	61.5	16,605	53.6	14,472	1.75	473	15.5	4,650	15.5	4,650	1.88%	1.59%
Clay Wheeler (Draft FERC, research DWR)	270		0		0			62.9	16,933	179.8	48,533	19.53%	16.49%
Cory E. Manning (Research)	270		0		0			54.4	14,688	54.4	14,688	5.91%	4.99%
Monica Hoppe (Research)	240	31.2	7,488	10.3	2,472	18.3	4,392	7.9	1,896	67.7	16,248	7.36%	5.52%
Meaurio Alger (Research)	240		0	14.7	3,528		0	68.5	16,440	83.2	19,968	9.04%	6.78%
Michele Moreland (Research)	240		0		0		0	15.1	3,624	15.1	3,624	1.64%	1.23%
Susan Ruebush (Employment & Fee Issues)	225	21.9	4,926	2.3	493		0	1.3	293	25.5	5,713	2.77%	1.94%
Paralegals		1.8	183	4.9	721	3.6	354	34.5	5,445	44.8	6,713	4.87%	2.28%
Totals		221.2	\$70,703	171.3	\$56,510	33.85	\$9,274	493.8	\$157,864	920.2	\$294,350	100.00%	100.00%

Notes

A - Litigation (Block Forward Contracts). Cooley filed a claim with the State's Victim Rights Board related to the state's seizure of PG&E's block forward contracts. Reading of the time entries implies that the Cal Px and/or its participants allege a security interest. Southern California Edison, the PX, and 29 PX participants also filed admin claims. On 9/6/01, ALJ issued a ruling setting a hearing for 10/19/01. Cooley filed PG&E's Inverse Condemnation Complaint against the state on 7/16/01, in SF Superior Court. The PX and a PX participant filed similar suits against the state in LA Superior Court. The PX filed a motion to coordinate the cases. A hearing re consolidation is set in LA for 9/21/01. State filed motions to dismiss all three complaints saying plaintiffs have not joined all indispensable parties & that they have not fully exhausted administrative remedies.

B - Initial Research. Cooley attorneys spent considerable time at commencement of case researching the conflict between state and federal bankruptcy jurisdiction related to CPUC issues.

C - Western Region RTO. On 5/24/01, the CPUC ordered PG&E to comply with its order that the ISO and the three California utilities submit their draft RTO proposals to the CPUC first so that the state can make a consistent proposal to the FERC, pursuant to the FERC's order that the ISO and California utilities file an RTO proposal by 6/1/01. The CPUC's 5/24/01 order set off a flurry of activity at Cooley Godward. Apparently, PGE is taking the position that the RTO matter raises 1st Amendment issues. PGE's DS states that proposed new entity, Etrans, intends to join Western RTO when it is established by FERC.

D - DWR. PGE disputes the DWR's revenue requirement and its projections. On 8/21/01, Cooley filed a Petition for Writ of Mandate or Writ of Administrative Mandamus in Sacramento County Superior Court. The petition requests the court to order DWR to withdraw its determination that its revenue requirement is just and reasonable until it complies with federal and state laws and holds a public hearing to determine if their power costs are "just and reasonable." Cooley may also have been the firm that filed a petition with the Ca. Supreme Court on 9/10/01 to overturn the CPUC's 3/27/01 decision requiring the utility to pay the DWR 9.471 cents per kWh on an interim basis prior to the implementation of the DWR's revenue requirement.

EXHIBIT 5

Milbank First Fee Application - By Matter

Pacific Gas & Electric
April - July, 2001

	PROFESSIONAL HOURS						Cumulative	% of Hours	PROFESSIONAL FEES						Cumulative	% of Fees
	Apr-01	May-01	Jun-01	Jul-01	Apr-01	May-01			Jun-01	Jul-01						
BUSINESS OPERATIONS	98.9	305.6	434.6	475.7	1,314.8	24.33%	49,692	122,360	164,663	152,419	489,134	22.04%				
OTHER LITIGATION	296.4	482.8	205.6	132.7	1,117.5	20.67%	109,642	211,739	95,470	60,857	477,728	21.52%				
STAY LITIGATION	44.5	312.2	84.6	41.6	482.9	8.93%	25,214	150,173	41,249	20,868	237,504	10.70%				
CASE ADMINISTRATION/ U.S. TRUSTEE COMPLIANCE	204.8	248.3	223.3	162.8	839.2	15.53%	94,748	87,056	49,459	31,813	263,076	11.85%				
MEETING OF CREDITORS (Committee)	132.6	162.7	129.0	92.0	516.3	9.55%	74,519	85,178	69,254	52,018	280,969	12.66%				
PLAN & DISCLOSURE STATEMENT	0.0	4.9	64.7	228.0	297.6	5.51%	0	2,916	36,294	121,908	161,118	7.26%				
BUSINESS ANALYSIS	33.4	102.5	34.8	48.4	219.1	4.05%	14,256	26,692	10,005	15,628	66,581	3.00%				
FEE/EMPLOYMENT APPLICATION	26.2	32.5	64.7	40.6	164.0	3.03%	10,703	13,535	22,558	17,748	64,544	2.91%				
ASSET ANALYSIS AND RECOVERY	0.0	35.0	23.5	42.5	101.0	1.87%	0	8,621	5,678	9,855	24,154	1.09%				
ASSET DISPOSITION (EXECUTORY CONTRACTS)	15.2	41.3	15.6	28.5	100.6	1.85%	6,756	14,717	5,792	14,508	41,773	1.88%				
NON-WORKING TRAVEL	11.4	30.6	15.2	34.8	92.0	1.70%	5,666	12,982	6,169	12,439	37,256	1.68%				
FEE/EMPLOYMENT OBJECTIONS	0.0	13.1	18.5	21.9	53.5	0.99%	0	5,755	10,323	9,241	25,319	1.14%				
LITIGATION CONSULTING	0	35.6	0.0	0.0	35.6	0.66%	0	13,706	0	0	13,706	0.62%				
EMPLOYEE BENEFITS/PENSIONS	0.6	3.0	20.8	0.3	24.7	0.46%	357	1,418	10,425	179	12,379	0.56%				
FINANCING (CASH COLLATERAL)	11.2	10.1	0.0	0.0	21.3	0.39%	6,025	4,967	0	0	10,992	0.50%				
CLAIMS ADMINISTRATION AND OBJECTIONS	1.7	7.1	2.8	2.6	14.2	0.26%	1,012	3,992	1,666	1,162	7,832	0.35%				
DATA ANALYSIS	0.0	0.0	0.0	5.8	5.8	0.11%	0	0	0	2,610	2,610	0.12%				
TAX ISSUES	0	0.0	0.0	4.7	4.7	0.09%	0	0	0	2,719	2,719	0.12%				
INSIDER ANALYSIS	0.0	0.0	0.0	0.2	0.2	0.00%	0	0	0	119	119	0.01%				
Total	876.9	1,827.3	1,337.7	1,363.1	5,404.9	100.00%	398,590	765,827	529,005	526,091	2,219,513	100.00%				
<i>Per Cover Sheet Applications</i>	<i>876.9</i>	<i>1,827.3</i>	<i>1,337.7</i>	<i>1,363.1</i>	<i>5,405.0</i>		<i>398,587</i>	<i>765,822</i>	<i>529,002</i>	<i>526,086</i>	<i>2,219,497</i>					
<i>Difference (insignificant amount)</i>	<i>0.0</i>	<i>0.0</i>	<i>0.0</i>	<i>0.0</i>	<i>-0.1</i>		<i>3.0</i>	<i>5.0</i>	<i>3.0</i>	<i>5.0</i>	<i>16.0</i>					

EXHIBIT F

Milbank First Fee Application - By Attorney

Pacific Gas & Electric
April - July, 2001

	Hrly Rates	PROFESSIONAL HOURS					Cumulative	Total Hrs.	% of	PROFESSIONAL FEES					Cumulative	Total Fees	% of
		Apr-01	May-01	Jun-01	Jul-01	Jul-01				Apr-01	May-01	Jun-01	Jul-01	Jul-01			
Moore, Partner	595	147.2	180.5	193.5	148.2	669.4	12.38%	87,584	107,398	115,133	88,179	398,293	17.95%				
Sorochinsky, Assoc.	420	60.5	165.0	163.8	163.2	552.5	10.22%	25,410	66,300	68,796	68,544	232,050	10.46%				
Marks, Partner	450	47.9	208.4	105.3	110.7	472.3	8.74%	21,555	93,780	47,385	49,815	212,535	9.58%				
Aronzon, Partner	595	94.7	124.0	90.4	140.2	449.3	8.31%	56,347	73,780	53,788	83,419	267,334	12.04%				
Kramer, Of Counsel	470	40.4	121.8	68.5	61.7	292.4	5.41%	18,988	57,246	32,195	28,999	137,428	6.19%				
Feo, Partner	595	65.3	90.9	73.6	62.3	292.1	5.40%	38,854	54,086	43,792	37,039	173,770	7.83%				
Urguhart, Assoc.	385	31.2	109.0	62.5	66.4	269.1	4.98%	12,012	41,965	24,063	25,564	103,604	4.67%				
McSpadden, Assoc.	415	28.3	69.6	64.8	100.5	263.2	4.87%	11,745	28,884	26,892	41,708	109,228	4.92%				
Gooding, Assoc.	385	58.8	119.3	7.0	2.5	187.6	3.47%	22,638	45,931	2,695	963	72,226	3.25%				
Neufeld, Assoc.	435	68.6	64.4	33.0	7.1	173.1	3.20%	29,841	28,014	14,355	3,089	75,299	3.39%				
Schwarz, Other	185	13.7	83.3	26.1	23.8	146.9	2.72%	2,535	15,411	4,829	4,403	27,177	1.22%				
Diamond, Partner	595	2.0	46.0	28.0	36.0	112.0	2.07%	1,190	27,370	16,860	21,420	66,840	3.00%				
Cho, Assoc.	350	59.9	17.4	0.0	0.0	77.3	1.43%	20,965	6,090	0	0	27,055	1.22%				
Coy, Assoc.	350	0	46.4	18.2	8	72.6	1.34%	0	16,240	6,370	2,800	25,410	1.14%				
Ostrow, Of Counsel	490	33.3	30.3	30	2.4	65.7	1.22%	0	16,317	14,700	1,176	32,193	1.45%				
Kraeller, Assoc.	420	17.5	20.9	15.1	11.0	64.5	1.19%	7,350	8,778	6,342	4,620	27,090	1.22%				
Dhillon, Assoc.	420	0	52.5	1.7	0	54.2	1.00%	0	22,050	714	0	22,764	1.03%				
Muthurni, Assoc.	325	0	44.8	0	0	44.8	0.83%	0	14,544	0	0	14,544	0.66%				
Michalchuk, Assoc.	295	38.7	0	0	0	38.7	0.72%	11,417	0	0	0	11,417	0.51%				
Kaplan, Assoc.	295	33.1	0	0	0	33.1	0.61%	9,765	0	0	0	9,765	0.44%				
Jackson, Assoc.	385	29.9	1.6	0.0	0.0	31.5	0.58%	11,512	616	0	0	12,128	0.55%				
Paschall, Assoc.	295	0	22.7	0	0	22.7	0.42%	4,697	6,682	0	0	6,682	0.30%				
Gautier, Assoc.	385	12.2	0.0	1.0	0.0	13.2	0.24%	0	0	385	0	5,082	0.23%				
Dayen, Assoc.	420	0	11	2	0	13.0	0.24%	0	4,620	840	0	5,460	0.25%				
Oliveira, Assoc.	240	0	3.6	5.7	2.8	12.1	0.22%	0	864	1,368	672	2,904	0.13%				
Liles, Other	330	0	1	2.3	4.8	8.1	0.15%	0	330	759	0	1,564	0.12%				
Friedman, Partner	575	3.9	3.9	3.9	3.9	15.6	0.07%	0	0	0	0	2,243	0.10%				
Johnson, Of Counsel	420	0	0	0	3.6	3.6	0.07%	0	0	0	4,512	0.07%					
Song, Assoc.	350	0	0	0	1	1.0	0.02%	0	0	0	350	0.02%					
Ponikvar, Partner	595	0	0	0	0.8	0.8	0.01%	0	0	0	476	0.02%					
Total Attorneys		849.9	1,637.3	992.5	960.9	4,440.6	82.16%	394,402	740,294	482,060	468,573	2,085,328	93.96%				
Summer Associates	15 Summer	0	72.2	197.4	286.7	556.3	10.29%	0	11,552	31,584	45,672	89,008	4.01%				
Legal Assistants	3 Aasis	27	49.25	14.4	2.6	93.3	1.73%	4,185	7,127	2,018	351	13,681	0.62%				
Case Clerk		0	68.5	133.4	112.9	314.8	5.82%	0	6,850	13,340	11,290	31,480	1.42%				
Total		876.9	1,827.3	1,337.7	1,363.1	5,405.0	100.00%	398,587	765,822	529,002	526,086	2,219,497	100.00%				
Per Cover Sheet Applications		876.9	1,827.25	1,337.7	1,363.1	5,405.0		398,587	765,822	529,002	526,086	2,219,497					
Difference		0	0	0	0	0		0	0	0	0	1					

PACIFIC GAS & ELECTRIC

Pricewaterhouse Application 1st Fee Application

Financial Advisor to Creditors' Committee

Covering April - July, 2001

P.Martin, 10/5/01

	April, 2001		May, 2001		June, 2001		July, 2001		Total, Apr - July, 2001		% of Total Hours	% of Total Fees
	Hours	Fees	Hours	Fees	Hours	Fees	Hours	Fees	Hours	Fees		
Asset Sales/Valuation Issues	41.5	18,638	162.3	67,631	46.2	18,324	86.5	32,406	336.5	136,999	7.40%	7.61%
Executive Contracts Analysis	39.0	15,966	258.8	112,134	51.6	23,248	77.0	28,896	426.4	180,244	9.38%	10.02%
Coordinating with Debtor	19.0	10,366	27.4	13,898	27.6	12,150	43.7	22,108	117.7	58,522	2.59%	3.25%
Emp. Issues-Ben./Retention			12.4	5,300	1.3	774			13.7	6,074	0.30%	0.34%
Legislative Review	32.2	12,344	39.8	21,457	4.6	1,920	22.9	5,457	99.5	41,178	2.19%	2.29%
FERC Review	4.8	1,668	13.4	6,145	17.8	4,974	10.3	5,939	46.3	18,726	1.02%	1.04%
CPUC Review	10.0	4,869	28.4	10,133	31.9	11,689	180.3	77,948	250.6	104,639	5.51%	5.81%
DWR Contracts/Analysis	1.5	1,190	6.2	2,282	20.1	8,953	209.4	76,250	237.2	88,675	5.22%	4.93%
Bankruptcy Reporting	11.3	4,246	114.8	36,190	83.6	31,018	75.9	23,363	285.6	94,817	6.28%	5.27%
Cash Flow Analysis	11.4	5,579	25.4	8,868	32.2	11,271	50.4	16,160	119.4	41,878	2.63%	2.33%
Financial Grid Load Modeling	26.9	9,564	319.3	102,516	217.9	77,350	58.7	21,065	622.8	210,495	13.70%	11.70%
Financial Statements	46.6	19,569	36.1	11,955	5.7	1,853	1.3	260	89.7	33,637	1.97%	1.87%
Financial Statement Modeling			97.1	29,758	97.6	39,710	12.4	5,063	207.1	74,531	4.56%	4.14%
Extra-net Web Site	60.6	19,960	100.6	27,095	42.4	11,775	18.4	5,448	222.0	64,278	4.88%	3.57%
Committee Matters	176.2	92,365	138.9	73,947	89.0	43,063	65.5	33,704	469.6	244,079	10.33%	13.56%
Sub-committee Matters	2.1	1,040	62.5	30,900	89.0	41,268	26.8	14,628	180.4	87,836	3.97%	4.88%
Plan of Reorganization			4.8	2,915	34.0	20,091	151.6	80,369	190.4	103,375	4.19%	5.74%
Claims Analysis	0.8	318	8.9	3,329	22.5	10,053	19.5	7,433	51.7	21,133	1.14%	1.17%
Other Matters	23.9	7,734	15.3	4,253	3.6	1,407	8.2	3,290	51.0	16,684	1.12%	0.93%
Professional Employment	47.1	21,465	43.7	17,963	27.4	14,296	7.2	1,863	125.4	55,587	2.76%	3.09%
Fee Matters & Applications	4.9	1,438	15.4	3,958	50.0	10,228	199.6	48,226	269.9	63,850	5.94%	3.55%
Travel Time	14.8	6,771	42.5	17,529	18.3	8,588	56.4	19,428	132.0	52,316	2.90%	2.91%
Total	574.6	256,090	1,574.0	610,156	1,014.3	404,003	1,382.0	529,304	4,544.9	1,799,553	100.00%	100.00%

EXHIBIT G

Law Student	Davidson, Sarah J.	2.3	113	259.9	Meeting with Mr. Strosser, Ms. Borrassa, Ms. Kim, Ms. Stelek, Ms. McLaughlin re monitoring FERC filings and issuances re electric market failure issues (80); research daily FERC filings and issuances re electric market failure issues (1.50).
Law Student	Davidson, Sarah J.	4	113	452	Research daily FERC filings and issuances.
Law Student	Davidson, Sarah J.	5	113	565	Research daily FERC filings and issuances re electric market failure issues.
Law Student	Davidson, Sarah J.	5	113	565	Research daily FERC filings and issuances re electric market failure issues.
Law Student	Davidson, Sarah J.	6	113	678	Research daily FERC filings and issuances re electric market failure issues.
Law Student	Davidson, Sarah J.	5	113	565	Research daily FERC filings and issuances re electric market failure issues.
Law Student	Davidson, Sarah J.	2.5	113	282.5	Research daily FERC filings and issuances re electric market failure issues.
Law Student	Davidson, Sarah J.	5.4	113	610.2	Prepare draft Motion to Intervene in FERC Docket No. ER01-2071 (1.00); research FERC filings, issuances and submittals re electric market failure (4.40).
Law Student	Davidson, Sarah J.	0.3	113	33.9	Research daily FERC filings and issuances re electric market failure issues.
Law Student	Davidson, Sarah J.	2.8	113	316.4	Research daily FERC filings and issuances.
Law Student	Davidson, Sarah J.	4.5	113	508.5	Research daily FERC filings and issuances re electric market failure issues.
Law Student	Davidson, Sarah J.	3.5	113	395.5	Research daily FERC filings and issuances re electric market failure issues.
Law Student	Davidson, Sarah J.	5.4	113	610.2	Research daily FERC filings and issuances re electric market failure issues.
Law Student	Davidson, Sarah J.	5.5	113	621.5	Research daily FERC filings and issuances re electric market failure issues.
Law Student	Davidson, Sarah J.	0.3	113	33.9	Research daily FERC filings and issuances re electric market failure issues.
Law Student	Davidson, Sarah J.	5.8	113	655.4	Research daily FERC filings and issuances re electric market failure issues.
Law Student	Davidson, Sarah J.	1	113	113	Review DC Circuit and Federal Appellate Rules and filing fees and conform Petition for Review cover letter for Mr. Fagan (40); research daily FERC filings and issuances re electric market failure issues (60).
Law Student	Davidson, Sarah J.	4.4	113	497.2	Research daily FERC filings and issuances re electric market failure issues (3.4); review DC Circuit and Federal Appellate Rules and conform Petition for Review and Disclosure Statement for Mr. Fagan (1.0).
Law Student	Davidson, Sarah J.	2.8	113	316.4	Research daily FERC filings and issuances re electric market failure issues (2.8).
Law Student	Davidson, Sarah J.	0.6	113	67.8	Research daily FERC filings and issuances re electric market failure issues.
Law Student	Davidson, Sarah J.	1.5	113	169.5	Research daily FERC filings and issuances re electric market failure issues.
Law Student	Davidson, Sarah J.	6.6	113	745.8	Research and organize daily FERC filings and issuances re electric market failure issues.
Law Student	Davidson, Sarah J.	3.3	113	372.9	Research and organize daily FERC filings and issuances re electric market failure issues.
Law Student	Davidson, Sarah J.	1	113	113	Research daily FERC filings and issuances re electric market failure issues.
Law Student	Davidson, Sarah J.	2.6	113	293.8	Research daily FERC filings and issuances re electric market failure issues.
Law Student	Davidson, Sarah J.	4.6	113	519.8	Research daily FERC filings and issuances and compile documents re market failure issues.
Law Student	Davidson, Sarah J.	4.3	113	485.9	Research daily FERC filings and issuances re electric market failure issues.
Law Student	Davidson, Sarah J.	5.5	113	621.5	Research daily FERC filings and issuances re electric market failure issues.
Law Student	Davidson, Sarah J.	5.3	113	598.9	Research daily FERC filings and issuances re electric market failure issues (2.7); research, compile, and update list of PG&E filings (2.6).
Law Student	Davidson, Sarah J.	2.8	113	316.4	Research daily FERC filings and issuances re electric market failure issues.
Law Student	Davidson, Sarah J.	3.9	113	440.7	Research daily FERC filings and issuances re electric market failure issues.
Law Student	Davidson, Sarah J.	3.7	113	418.1	Research FERC orders, filings and issuances re electric market failure issues (2.5); prepare documents for distribution (1.2).
Law Student	Davidson, Sarah J.	2.1	113	237.3	Research daily FERC filings and issuances re electric market failure issues.
Law Student	Davidson, Sarah J.	5.5	113	621.5	Research daily FERC filings and issuances re electric market failure issues.
Law Student	Davidson, Sarah J.	4	113	452	Research daily FERC filings and issuances re electric market failure issues.

EXHIBIT

#

Law Student	Davidson, Sarah J.	3.1	113	350.3	Research daily FERC filings and issuances re electric market failure issues.
Law Student	Davidson, Sarah J.	2.1	113	237.3	Research daily FERC filings and issuances re electric market failure issues.
Law Student	Davidson, Sarah J.	0.5	113	56.5	Obtain and distribute Cogeneration Council's brief.
Law Student	Davidson, Sarah J.	2	113	226	Research re QF issues.
Law Student	Davidson, Sarah J.	2	113	226	Legal research re avoided cost issues for Ms. Borrasca.
Law Student	Davidson, Sarah J.	1	113	113	Legal research re avoided cost issues for Ms. Borrasca.
Law Student	Davidson, Sarah J.	2	113	226	Obtain requested court case and research underlying PSC orders.
Law Student	Davidson, Sarah J.	2	113	226	Summarize court case and underlying PSC orders and prepare draft memorandum to Ms. Reid re same.
Law Student	Davidson, Sarah J.	2.7	113	305.1	Meet with Mr. Strosser re court case memorandum and research (20); research re same (2.50).
Law Student	Davidson, Sarah J.	1.6	113	180.8	Research court case and prepare draft memorandum to Ms. Reid re same.
Law Student	Davidson, Sarah J.	0.4	113	45.2	Meet with Mr. Strosser re requested research on appeals court case (20); revise memorandum to Ms. Reid re same (20).
Law Student	Davidson, Sarah J.	6.8	113	768.4	Meeting with Ms. Kim re CRUC request of FERC proceedings (10); phone call to Mr. Hayden re FERC docket (10); further telephone conference with Mr. Hayden re same (10); compile requested documents; prepare list re same; send to Mr. Hayden (6.5).
Law Student	Gruhl, Jonathan	5.4	90	486	Index and organize hearing file
Paralegal	Whitehead, Ann C.	2.9	140	406	Organize and index first day pleadings (2.30); Pacer search re same (6)
Paralegal	Whitehead, Ann C.	2	140	280	On-line search re copies of current pleadings (1.30); confer with Mr. Bratton re request for special notice and draft same (70).
Paralegal	Whitehead, Ann C.	2.4	140	336	Index pleadings (1.40); Pacer search re same (40); memo re claims bar date and date of meeting of creditors (40); e-mail to debtor's counsel re special notice list (20).
Paralegal	Whitehead, Ann C.	3.3	140	462	Prepare request for special notice service list (2.5); e-mail to counsel for debtor re same (40); Pacer search re same (40).
Paralegal	Whitehead, Ann C.	1.3	140	182	Finalize request for special notice for court filing and service.
Paralegal	Whitehead, Ann C.	0.4	140	56	Pacer search re adversary proceeding (20); confer with Mr. Luster re same (20).
Paralegal	Whitehead, Ann C.	1.5	140	210	Organize documents for filing; Pacer search re adversary proceeding status; telephone and e-mail with Mr. Ferrer re same; confer with Mr. Luster re same.
Paralegal	Whitehead, Ann C.	1.8	140	252	Organize documents for filing (1.40); confer with Mr. Luster and Mr. Bratton re background of litigation and adversary proceeding (40).
Paralegal	Whitehead, Ann C.	0.2	140	28	Organize documents for filing.
Paralegal	Whitehead, Ann C.	0.2	140	28	Case Administration.
Paralegal	Whitehead, Ann C.	2.2	140	308	Organize documents for filing (1.60); review docket re filing of schedules and statement of affairs (.60).
Paralegal	Whitehead, Ann C.	1.2	140	168	Organize documents for filing.
Paralegal	Whitehead, Ann C.	0.5	140	70	Case administration.
Paralegal	Whitehead, Ann C.	1.5	140	210	Organize documents for filing.
Paralegal	Whitehead, Ann C.	0.7	140	98	Organize documents for filing.
Paralegal	Whitehead, Ann C.	2.6	140	364	Various searches in PqDE main and adversary dockets re 2004 request for discovery and related issues (1.50); case administration (1.10).
Paralegal	Whitehead, Ann C.	0.5	140	70	Case administration.
Paralegal	Whitehead, Ann C.	0.3	140	42	Organize documents for filing.
Paralegal	Whitehead, Ann C.	0.2	140	28	Organize documents for filing.
Paralegal	Whitehead, Ann C.	0.3	140	42	Organize documents for filing.
Paralegal	Whitehead, Ann C.	1.6	140	224	Attend meeting with clients to discuss bankruptcy aspect of case.

Paralegal	Whitehead, Ann C.	0.3	140	42	Organize documents for filing.
Paralegal	Whitehead, Ann C.	0.4	140	56	Organize documents for filing.
Paralegal	Whitehead, Ann C.	0.3	140	42	Organize documents for filing.
Paralegal	Whitehead, Ann C.	4.3	140	602	Organize documents for filing.
Paralegal	Whitehead, Ann C.	0.4	140	56	Organize documents for filing.
Paralegal	Whitehead, Ann C.	0.4	140	56	Organize documents for filing.
Paralegal	Whitehead, Ann C.	0.3	140	42	Organize bankruptcy pleadings for filing.
Paralegal	Whitehead, Ann C.	1.6	140	224	Organize bankruptcy pleadings for filing.
Paralegal	Whitehead, Ann C.	0.4	140	56	Organize bankruptcy pleadings for filing.
Paralegal	Whitehead, Ann C.	0.4	140	56	Organize bankruptcy pleadings for filing.
Paralegal	Whitehead, Ann C.	0.4	140	28	Organize bankruptcy pleadings for filing (20); Pacer search re document production order (20).
Paralegal	Whitehead, Ann C.	0.2	140	28	Organize bankruptcy pleadings for filing (50); prepare master proof of service (90).
Paralegal	Whitehead, Ann C.	1.4	140	196	Organize bankruptcy pleadings for filing.
Paralegal	Whitehead, Ann C.	0.4	140	56	Organize bankruptcy pleadings for filing.
Paralegal	Whitehead, Ann C.	1.1	140	154	Prepare application, declaration and proof of service to employ Heller as litigation counsel for court filing and service.
Paralegal	Whitehead, Ann C.	0.9	140	126	Submit copies of Heller employment application and declaration to court.
Paralegal	Whitehead, Ann C.	0.6	140	84	Various on-line searches re status of order approving Heller employment.
Paralegal	Whitehead, Ann C.	0.3	140	42	Distribute order appointing Heller to team members.
Paralegal	Whitehead, Ann C.	0.3	140	42	Determine hearing date on motion for fee application procedures.
Paralegal	Whitehead, Ann C.	0.2	140	28	E-mail to Mr. Benvenuti re upcoming hearing.
Paralegal	Whitehead, Ann C.	1.1	140	154	Pacer search re Knudsen application (40); distribute copies of same (30); e-mail and telephone with Mr. Ferrer or Howard Rice re order on Knudsen application (40).
Paralegal	Whitehead, Ann C.	0.2	140	28	Pacer search re status of Knudsen order.
Paralegal	Whitehead, Ann C.	0.3	140	42	and Ms. Fiala re same (10).
Paralegal	Whitehead, Ann C.	0.5	140	70	Pacer search re status of Knudsen order (30); e-mail to Mr. Ferrer re same (20).
Paralegal	Whitehead, Ann C.	0.6	140	84	Telephone with Mr. Ferrer re Knudsen order (20); download Knudsen order and distribute same (40).
Paralegal	Whitehead, Ann C.	0.8	140	112	Review Knudsen order re procedures for filing fee cover sheets (60); conference with Ms. Fiala re same (20).
Paralegal	Whitehead, Ann C.	4.4	140	616	Prepare proofs of service re cover sheet applications (120); prepare cover sheet application and proofs of service for court filing and service (280); telephone with and e-mail to U.S. Trustee's office re same (40).
Paralegal	Whitehead, Ann C.	5	140	700	Retrieve material for attorney review (170); review and update case files (330).
Paralegal	Whitehead, Ann C.	4.4	140	616	Retrieve material for attorney review (170); review and update legal research files (170); review and update case files (130)
Paralegal	Luster, David R.	4.5	140	630	update case files (130)
Paralegal	Luster, David R.	5.5	140	770	Retrieve material for attorney review (200); review and organize case files (260); review and route articles re PG&E (80); review and update legal research (60)
Paralegal	Luster, David R.	6	140	840	articles re PG&E (80); review and update case files (140); review and forward articles re PG&E bankruptcy (50); review and update legal research (100)
Paralegal	Luster, David R.	4.5	140	630	Retrieve material for attorney review (150); review and update case files (38); review and route articles re PG&E (20).
Paralegal	Luster, David R.	5.5	140	770	re PG&E (20).

Paralegal	Luster, David R.	5.5	140	770	Retrieve material for attorney review (2.80); review and organize case files (2.20); review and route articles re PG&E (50)
Paralegal	Luster, David R.	4	140	560	Retrieve material for attorney review (2.00); review and organize case files (1.40); review and update legal research (60)
Paralegal	Luster, David R.	6.5	140	910	Retrieve material for attorney review (2.40); review and update case files (3.60); review and update legal research (50)
Paralegal	Luster, David R.	5.5	140	770	Retrieve material for attorney review (1.50); review and update case files (2.80); review and route articles re PG&E (70); review and update legal research (50)
Paralegal	Luster, David R.	4	140	560	Retrieve material for attorney review (1.30); review and organize case files (2.20); review and route articles re PG&E (50)
Paralegal	Luster, David R.	4.5	140	630	Retrieve material for attorney review (1.2); review and organize case files (2.8); review and route articles re PG&E (50)
Paralegal	Luster, David R.	5	140	700	Retrieve material for attorney review (1.0); cite check memo (1.3); review and organize case files (2.2); review and route articles re PG&E (5)
Paralegal	Luster, David R.	0.5	140	70	Review and update case files (5)
Paralegal	Luster, David R.	4	140	560	Retrieve material for attorney review (1.2); cite check memo (8); review and organize case files (1.5); review and route articles re PG&E (5)
Paralegal	Luster, David R.	5.6	140	784	Retrieve material for attorney review (1.2); review and organize case files (3.8); review and route articles re PG&E (6)
Paralegal	Luster, David R.	6.5	140	910	Retrieve material for attorney review (2.1); review and organize case files (3.7); review and route articles re PG&E (7)
Paralegal	Luster, David R.	5	140	700	Retrieve material for attorney review (1.5); review and update case files (2.8); review and route articles re PG&E (7)
Paralegal	Luster, David R.	6.5	140	910	Retrieve material for attorney review (1.2); review and update case files (3.8); review and route articles re PG&E (7); update legal research (8)
Paralegal	Luster, David R.	5	140	700	Retrieve material for attorney review (1.5); review and organize case files (3.0); review and route articles re PG&E (5)
Paralegal	Luster, David R.	7.5	140	1050	Retrieve material for attorney review (1.40); review and organize case files (3.60); review and route articles re PG&E (90); review and update legal research (1.60)
Paralegal	Luster, David R.	7.5	140	1050	Retrieve material for attorney review (1.10); attend meeting with Ms Fiala, Mr. Cole, Ms Gould, Mr. Sheen, Ms Gordon, Mr. Reiber and Ms Collanton re case status (1.50); review appellate rules and procedures (2.90); review and update case files (2.00)
Paralegal	Luster, David R.	6.5	140	910	Retrieve material for attorney review (60); cite check research memo (1.60); review and update case files (1.30); review and excerpt appellate rules and procedures (3.0)
Paralegal	Luster, David R.	7.5	140	1050	Retrieve material for attorney review (1.20); review and organize case files (2.3); review appellate rules and update chart re appellate time line and procedures (4.0)
Paralegal	Luster, David R.	6.5	140	910	Retrieve material for attorney review (1.3); review and organize case files (2.4); review and update chart re appellate procedures and time line (2.8)
Paralegal	Luster, David R.	6.5	140	910	Retrieve material for attorney review (1.80); review and organize case files (3.7); review and route articles re PG&E (1.0)
Paralegal	Luster, David R.	0.5	140	70	Review and organize case files (50)
Paralegal	Luster, David R.	7.5	140	1050	Retrieve material for attorney review (2.0); review and organize case files (4.4); review and route articles re PG&E (1.1)

Paralegal	Luster, David R.	5.5	140	770	Retrieve material for attorney review (1.7); review and organize case files (3.2); review and route articles re PG&E (6)
Paralegal	Luster, David R.	6	140	840	Retrieve material for attorney review (1.6); review and organize case files (3.7); review and route articles re PG&E (7)
Paralegal	Luster, David R.	5.5	140	770	Retrieve material for attorney review (1.8); review and organize case files (2.2); review and route articles re PG&E (7); review and update legal research (8)
Paralegal	Luster, David R.	6	140	840	Retrieve material for attorney review (1.5); review and organize case files (3.8); review and route articles re PG&E (7)
Paralegal	Luster, David R.	6.5	140	910	Retrieve material for attorney review (1.3); review and organize case files (4.2); review and organize articles re PG&E (7); review and update legal research (3)
Paralegal	Luster, David R.	7	140	980	Retrieve material for attorney review (1.7); review and organize case files (4.5); review and route articles re PG&E (8)
Paralegal	Luster, David R.	4	140	560	Retrieve material for attorney review (1.2); review and organize case files (2.2); review and route articles re PG&E (6)
Paralegal	Luster, David R.	4.5	140	630	Retrieve material for attorney review (1.3); review and organize case files (2.5); review and route articles re PG&E (7)
Paralegal	Luster, David R.	4.5	140	630	Retrieve material for attorney review (1.2); review and organize case files (2.7); review and route articles re PG&E (6.0)
Paralegal	Luster, David R.	4.5	140	630	Retrieve material for attorney review (1.8); review and update case files (3.0); review and route articles re PG&E (7)
Paralegal	Luster, David R.	5	140	700	Retrieve material for attorney review (1.5); review and organize case files (2.8); review and route articles re PG&E (7)
Paralegal	Luster, David R.	6	140	840	Retrieve material for attorney review (1.8); review and organize case files (4.4); review and route articles re PG&E (8)
Paralegal	Luster, David R.	6.5	140	910	Retrieve material for attorney review (1.3); review and organize case files (3.5); cite check legal research memo (1.2); review and route articles re PG&E (5)
Paralegal	Luster, David R.	5.5	140	770	Retrieve material for attorney review (1.3); review and organize case files (3.3); review and route articles re PG&E (9)
Paralegal	Luster, David R.	5.5	140	770	Retrieve material for attorney review (1.4); review and organize case files (3.2); review and route articles re PG&E (9)
Paralegal	Luster, David R.	6.5	140	910	Retrieve material for attorney review (1.8); review and organize case files (3.1); meet with Mr. Stone re Fala, Mr. Reiber, Mr. Cole, Ms Callanton, Mr. Sheen, Ms Gould, Ms Gordon, Mr. Bar-Ley and Mr. Bordon re Retrieve material for attorney review (1.0); review and route articles re PG&E (6)
Paralegal	Luster, David R.	7.5	140	1050	Retrieve material for attorney review (2.3); review and organize case files (2.2); case status; (4.4)
Paralegal	Luster, David R.	4.5	140	630	Retrieve material for attorney review (1.5); review and organize case files (3.3); review and route articles re PG&E (7); meet with Mr. Stone re case status (6)
Paralegal	Luster, David R.	6.1	140	854	Retrieve material for attorney review (2.3); review and organize case files (3.4); review and route articles re PG&E (8)
Paralegal	Luster, David R.	6.5	140	910	Retrieve material for attorney review (1.6); review and organize case files (4.6); review and route articles re PG&E (1.3)
Paralegal	Luster, David R.	7.5	140	1050	Retrieve material for attorney review (1.6); review and organize case files (4.6); review and route articles re PG&E (1.3)

Paralegal	Luster, David R.	6.5	140	910	Retrieve material for attorney review (1.4); review and organize case files (3.9); review and route articles re PG&E (1.2)
Paralegal	Luster, David R.	7.5	140	1050	Retrieve material for attorney review (1.6); review and organize case files (4.6); review and route articles re PG&E (1.3)
Paralegal	Luster, David R.	7	140	980	Retrieve material for attorney review (1.4); review and organize case files (4.5); review and route articles re PG&E (1.1)
Paralegal	Luster, David R.	4.5	140	630	Review and organize case files (2.50); retrieve material for attorney review (1.50); review and route articles re PG&E (50)
Paralegal	Luster, David R.	2.5	140	350	Review and organize case files (2.0); review and route articles re PG&E (50)
Paralegal	Luster, David R.	4	140	560	Retrieve material for attorney review (9); review and organize case files (2.4); review and route articles re PG&E (7)
Paralegal	Luster, David R.	3.5	140	490	Review and organize case files (2.7); retrieve material for attorney review (5); review and route articles re PG&E (3)
Paralegal	Luster, David R.	5	140	700	Retrieve material for attorney review (8); review and organize case files (3.7); review and route articles re PG&E (5)
Paralegal	Luster, David R.	4.4	140	616	Retrieve material for attorney review (9); review and organize case files (2.9); review and route articles re PG&E (6)
Paralegal	Luster, David R.	3.5	140	490	Retrieve material for attorney review (7); review and organize case files (2.2); review and route articles re PG&E (6)
Paralegal	Luster, David R.	4	140	560	Retrieve material for attorney review (1.2); review and organize case files (2.4); review and route articles re PG&E (4)
Paralegal	Luster, David R.	3.5	140	490	Retrieve material for attorney review (1.0); review and organize case files (1.8); review and route articles re PG&E (7)
Paralegal	Luster, David R.	2.5	140	350	Retrieve material for attorney review (7); review and organize case files (1.2); review and route articles re PG&E (6)
Paralegal	Luster, David R.	3	140	420	Retrieve material for attorney review (7); review and organize case files (1.6); review and route articles re PG&E (7)
Paralegal	Luster, David R.	5	140	700	Retrieve material for attorney review (1.2); review and organize case files (2.2); assemble and route material re Non-Disclosure Certificate (1.3); review and route articles re PG&E (3)
Paralegal	Luster, David R.	4.5	140	630	Retrieve material for attorney review (6); review and organize case files (3.2); review and route articles re PG&E (7)
Paralegal	Luster, David R.	3	140	420	Retrieve material for attorney review (5); review and organize case files (2.3); review and route articles re PG&E (2)
Paralegal	Luster, David R.	3.5	140	490	Retrieve material for attorney review (6); review and organize case files (2.3); review and route articles re PG&E (6)
Paralegal	Luster, David R.	3	140	420	Retrieve material for attorney review (6); review and organize case files (2.1); review and route articles re PG&E (3)
Paralegal	Luster, David R.	4.5	140	630	Retrieve material for attorney review (7); review and organize case files (3.0); review and route articles re PG&E (8)
Paralegal	Luster, David R.	4	140	560	Retrieve material for attorney review (1.7); review and organize case files (1.9); review and route articles re PG&E (4)
Paralegal	Luster, David R.	1.5	140	210	Retrieve material for attorney review (1.00); review and organize case files (50)
Paralegal	Luster, David R.	2	140	280	Prepare notice of stay for filing and service (2.00)

Paralegal	Luster, David R.	1	140	140	Retrieve material for attorney review (5.0); review and update case files (5.0).
Paralegal	Luster, David R.	1	140	140	Review and update case files (1.00).
Paralegal	Luster, David R.	1	140	140	Review and organize case files (1.0).
Paralegal	Luster, David R.	1	140	140	Review and update case files (1.00).
Paralegal	Luster, David R.	1	140	140	Review and organize case files (1.00).
Paralegal	Luster, David R.	0.5	140	70	Review and update case files.
Paralegal	Luster, David R.	0.5	140	70	Review and organize case files.
Paralegal	Contino, Joanne S.	5.9	122	719.8	Create notebooks regarding testimony before FERC.
Paralegal	Contino, Joanne S.	4	122	488	Complete notebooks re testimony before FERC.
Paralegal	Contino, Joanne S.	0.6	122	73.2	Search for and retrieve copy of Kubitz declaration; forward same to Mr. Cole (6).
Paralegal	Contino, Joanne S.	1.3	122	158.6	Assist with preparation of ex parte application for filing, service and distribution (1.3).
Paralegal	Contino, Joanne S.	3	122	366	Retrieve documents for attorney review (3); begin review of briefings for Pullman abstention and Rooker-Feldman issues (2.2); retrieval of Judge Law's decision for dismissal of case (1.0).
Paralegal	Contino, Joanne S.	2.5	122	305	Search files for information re court filings (1.0); retrieve briefing for attorney review (5); prepare and distribute copies of Judge Law's decision for dismissal of case (1.0).
Paralegal	Contino, Joanne S.	2.5	122	305	Attend meeting re appeal issues (1.5); follow-up tasks and document retrieval re same (1.0).
Paralegal	Contino, Joanne S.	0.9	122	109.8	Retrieve case authority referenced in memorandum brief (9).
Paralegal	Contino, Joanne S.	5.5	122	671	Monitor notice of appeal filings at courthouse (5.5).
Paralegal	Contino, Joanne S.	1.4	122	170.8	Retrieve case authority to legal research brief (1.1); research proper citations (4).
Paralegal	Contino, Joanne S.	0.7	122	85.4	Confirm case authority citations per attorney request (7).
Paralegal	Contino, Joanne S.	0.7	122	85.4	Retrieve additional case authority referenced in legal brief (7).
Paralegal	Contino, Joanne S.	2.7	122	329.4	Review adversary proceedings docket (2.7).
Paralegal	Contino, Joanne S.	1	122	122	Prepare copies of case authorities for review by Ms. Collanton (1.0).
Paralegal	Contino, Joanne S.	7	122	854	Citation check of memorandum re challenges state legislation (7.0).
Paralegal	Contino, Joanne S.	1.3	122	158.6	Begin cite check of legal research memorandum re CPUC decision (1.3).
Paralegal	Contino, Joanne S.	0.8	122	97.6	Continue cite check of legal research memorandum (8).
Paralegal	Contino, Joanne S.	5.5	122	671	Continue cite check of legal research memorandum (5.5).
Paralegal	Contino, Joanne S.	13	122	1586	Continue cite check of legal research memorandum (13.0).
Paralegal	Contino, Joanne S.	6	122	732	Continue cite check of legal research memorandum (6.0).
Paralegal	Contino, Joanne S.	4.3	122	524.6	Complete citation check of legal research memorandum (4.3).
Paralegal	Contino, Joanne S.	5.5	122	671	Begin cite check of revised memorandum re CPUC decision (5.5).
Paralegal	Contino, Joanne S.	8.5	122	1037	Complete cite check of revised memorandum re CPUC decision (8.5).
Paralegal	Contino, Joanne S.	0.6	90	54	Create additional witness files, including labels and witness identification (6).
Paralegal	Contino, Joanne S.	0.7	90	63	Assist with locating and retrieval of transcript (7).
Paralegal	Contino, Joanne S.	2.3	90	207	Review of correspondence and pleadings (1.0); organize same in chronology for file maintenance (1.0); update database re same (3.0).
Paralegal	Contino, Joanne S.	4.6	90	414	Review SCE's documents for database (4.0); mark same in chronology for file maintenance (6).
Paralegal	Contino, Joanne S.	7.5	90	675	Review Southern California Edison's documents database (6.0); cross-reference additional documents with same (1.5.0).
Paralegal	Contino, Joanne S.	7	90	630	Assist with search of Mr. Kubitz's declaration (5); review database for privilege and related document materials (6.5).
Paralegal	Contino, Joanne S.	5.3	90	477	Prepare subject folder and labels for SCE, PG&E and FERC/CPUC working files (2.0); apply tabs and organize documents in chronology (3.3.0).

Paralegal	Temp Case Asst, Ten	3.5	90	315	Supplement database and re-organize documents for file maintenance (3.5)
Paralegal	Temp Case Asst, Ten	7.8	90	702	Prepare notebook for complaints and multiple related suits (1.0); create database for some and reorganize pleadings database for attorney's information (6.80).
Paralegal	Temp Case Asst, Ten	6	90	540	Review existing database on FERC and CPUC Rulings and Regulations (4.0); cross reference with additional related documents (5); supplement database for additions (1.5)
Paralegal	Temp Case Asst, Ten	7.3	90	657	Review SCE database (3.0); cross reference file materials and related documents with same (4.3)
Paralegal	Temp Case Asst, Ten	5.5	90	495	Review of additional FERC/CPUC documents (2.0); cross reference same with existing indices (3.5)
Paralegal	Temp Case Asst, Ten	7.8	90	702	General review of SCE/FERC/CPUC documents (1.50); update database with additional related documents for attorney's reference (6.30)
Paralegal	Temp Case Asst, Ten	7.5	90	675	General review of PGE database and update with supplemental information (7.5)
Paralegal	Temp Case Asst, Ten	7.6	90	684	Create additional PGE working files for ex parte application and opposition (5.0); create database for same (2.6)
Paralegal	Temp Case Asst, Ten	3.8	90	342	Prepare working files for adversary proceedings and other related documents (1.80); update other related file folders for organization and validation (2.0)
Paralegal	Temp Case Asst, Ten	0.4	90	36	Assist in locating and retrieving court transcript for attorney's use (4)
Paralegal	Temp Case Asst, Ten				Supplement document database with recently received documents, including pleadings, correspondence and other related documents (1.2); arrange documents in chronological order; apply tabs and update database (2.0)
Paralegal	Temp Case Asst, Ten	3.2	90	288	General review and update of pleadings, including motions, replies and opposition (1.0); mark same for printing for attorney's working binder (1.50); generate subject working binder for printed documents (4.0); marked same in chronology for tab and label a
Paralegal	Temp Case Asst, Ten	7.8	90	702	Review and supplement attorney working notebooks re pleadings and other privileged documents (2.50); mark same in chronology and apply tabs (1.0)
Paralegal	Temp Case Asst, Ten	3.5	90	315	Prepare organization of accumulated responsive pleadings and related documents and create subject folders for same (4.3)
Paralegal	Temp Case Asst, Ten	4.3	90	387	Continue organization and file maintenance of responsive pleadings, as well as index of same (6.0)
Paralegal	Temp Case Asst, Ten	6	90	540	Review of FERC/CPUC document materials for file maintenance/organization and data entry disposition (7.6)
Paralegal	Temp Case Asst, Ten	7.6	90	684	Review of recently received responsive documents for file maintenance and database entry (5); organize same in chronology (5); apply tabs and begin database entry (1.5)
Paralegal	Temp Case Asst, Ten	2.5	90	225	Monitor FERC clips for daily releases/orders/notices issued in docket numbers EL00-97, EL00-95, EL00-98, EL01-1, EL01-2, EL01-3, EL01-10, EL01-35, EL01-29, ER01-1045, EL01-36 (1.50); monitor FERC clips, firms and Federal register for recent triennial market
Paralegal	McLaughlin, Natalie	2.1	99	207.9	Retrieve copies of triennial market power analysis filings (FSNM and Tenaska) for review (6.0)
Paralegal	McLaughlin, Natalie	0.6	99	59.4	Monitor FERC clips for daily releases/orders/notices issued in docket numbers EL00-97, EL00-95, EL00-98, EL01-1, EL01-2, EL01-3, EL01-10, EL01-35, EL01-29, ER01-1045, EL01-36 (5.0)
Paralegal	McLaughlin, Natalie	0.5	99	49.5	Monitor FERC clips for daily releases/orders/notices issued in docket numbers EL00-97, EL00-95, EL00-98, EL01-1, EL01-2, EL01-3, EL01-10, EL01-35, EL01-29, ER01-1045, EL01-36 (5.0)
Paralegal	McLaughlin, Natalie	0.5	99	49.5	Monitor FERC clips for daily releases/orders/notices issued in docket numbers EL00-97, EL00-95, EL00-98, EL01-1, EL01-2, EL01-3, EL01-10, EL01-35, EL01-29, ER01-1045, EL01-36 (5.0); research regarding dates for California ISO reports and filings (5.0)
Paralegal	McLaughlin, Natalie	1	99	99	

Paralegal	McLaughlin, Natalie I	0.5	99	49.5	Monitor FERC cips for daily releases/orders/notices issued in docket numbers EL00-97, EL00-95, EL00-98, EL01-1, EL01-2, EL01-3, EL01-10, EL01-35, EL01-29, ER01-1045, EL01-36 (.30); monitor FERC cips.
Paralegal	McLaughlin, Natalie I	0.5	99	49.5	Monitor FERC cips for daily releases/orders/notices issued in docket numbers EL00-97, EL00-95, EL00-98, EL01-1, EL01-2, EL01-3, EL01-10, EL01-35, EL01-29, ER01-1045, EL01-36 (.30); monitor FERC cips.
Paralegal	McLaughlin, Natalie I	0.5	99	49.5	prims and federal register for recent triennial market p
Paralegal	McLaughlin, Natalie I	0.6	99	59.4	Monitor FERC cips for daily releases/orders/notices issued in docket numbers EL00-97, EL00-95, EL00-98, EL01-1, EL01-2, EL01-3, EL01-10, EL01-35, EL01-29, ER01-1045, EL01-36.
Paralegal	McLaughlin, Natalie I	0.5	99	49.5	Monitor FERC cips for daily releases/orders/notices issued in docket numbers EL00-97, EL00-95, EL00-98, EL01-1, EL01-2, EL01-3, EL01-10, EL01-35, EL01-29, ER01-1045, EL01-36.
Paralegal	McLaughlin, Natalie I	0.9	99	89.1	Monitor FERC cips for daily releases/orders/notices issued in docket numbers EL00-97, EL00-95, EL00-98, EL01-1, EL01-2, EL01-3, EL01-10, EL01-35, EL01-29, ER01-1045, EL01-36 (.30); prepare attachments for discovery response numbers 12 and 50 (.40).
Paralegal	McLaughlin, Natalie I	0.5	99	49.5	Monitor FERC cips for daily releases/orders/notices issued in docket numbers EL00-97, EL00-95, EL00-98, EL01-1, EL01-2, EL01-3, EL01-10, EL01-35, EL01-29, ER01-1045, EL01-36.
Paralegal	McLaughlin, Natalie I	0.5	99	49.5	Monitor FERC cips for daily releases/orders/notices issued in docket numbers EL00-97, EL00-95, EL00-98, EL01-1, EL01-2, EL01-3, EL01-10, EL01-35, EL01-29, ER01-1045, EL01-36.
Paralegal	McLaughlin, Natalie I	0.5	99	49.5	Monitor FERC cips for daily releases/orders/notices issued in docket numbers EL00-97, EL00-95, EL00-98, EL01-1, EL01-2, EL01-3, EL01-10, EL01-35, EL01-29, ER01-1045, EL01-36.
Paralegal	McLaughlin, Natalie I	1	99	99	Monitor FERC cips for daily releases/orders/notices issued in docket numbers EL00-97, EL00-95, EL00-98, EL01-1, EL01-2, EL01-3, EL01-10, EL01-35, EL01-29, ER01-1045, EL01-36.
Paralegal	McLaughlin, Natalie I	0.5	99	49.5	Monitor FERC cips for daily releases/orders/notices issued in docket numbers EL00-97, EL00-95, EL00-98, EL01-1, EL01-2, EL01-3, EL01-10, EL01-35, EL01-29, ER01-1045, EL01-36.
Paralegal	McLaughlin, Natalie I	0.7	99	69.3	Monitor FERC cips for daily releases/orders/notices issued in docket numbers EL00-97, EL00-95, EL00-98, EL01-1, EL01-2, EL01-3, EL01-10, EL01-35, EL01-29, ER01-1045, EL01-36 (.30); research regarding distribute copy of FERC order issued in docket numbers EL00-9
Paralegal	McLaughlin, Natalie I	0.6	99	59.4	Monitor FERC cips for daily releases/orders/notices issued in docket numbers EL00-97, EL00-95, EL00-98, EL01-1, EL01-2, EL01-3, EL01-10, EL01-35, EL01-29, ER01-1045, EL01-36 (.30); research regarding interventions filed in docket numbers ER98-1127 and ER9
Paralegal	McLaughlin, Natalie I	2.3	99	227.7	Monitor FERC cips for daily releases/orders/notices issued in docket numbers EL00-97, EL00-95, EL00-98, EL01-1, EL01-2, EL01-3, EL01-10, EL01-35, EL01-29, ER01-1045, EL01-36 (.30); retrieve market-based rate applications in docket numbers ER98-11
Paralegal	McLaughlin, Natalie I	0.5	99	49.5	Monitor FERC cips for daily releases/orders/notices issued in docket numbers EL00-97, EL00-95, EL00-98, EL01-1, EL01-2, EL01-3, EL01-10, EL01-35, EL01-29, ER01-1045, EL01-36.
Paralegal	McLaughlin, Natalie I	0.5	99	49.5	Monitor FERC cips for recent triennial market power analysis upda
Paralegal	McLaughlin, Natalie I	0.5	99	49.5	Monitor FERC cips for recent triennial market power analysis upda
Paralegal	McLaughlin, Natalie I	0.5	99	49.5	Monitor FERC cips for daily releases/orders/notices issued in docket numbers EL00-97, EL00-95, EL00-98, EL01-1, EL01-2, EL01-3, EL01-10, EL01-35, EL01-29, ER01-1045, EL01-36, EL01-68.
Paralegal	McLaughlin, Natalie I	0.5	99	49.5	Monitor FERC cips for daily releases/orders/notices issued in docket numbers EL00-97, EL00-95, EL00-98, EL01-1, EL01-2, EL01-3, EL01-10, EL01-35, EL01-29, ER01-1045, EL01-36, EL01-68.
Paralegal	McLaughlin, Natalie I	0.5	99	49.5	Monitor FERC cips for recent triennial market power a

Paralegal	McLaughlin, Natalie F	0.5	99	49.5	198, EL01-1, EL01-2, EL01-3, EL01-10, EL01-29, ER01-1045, EL01-36, EL01-68 (50)
Paralegal	McLaughlin, Natalie F	1.1	99	108.9	Monitor FERC cips for daily releases/orders/notices issued in docket numbers EL00-97, EL00-95, EL00-98, EL01-1, EL01-2, EL01-3, EL01-10, EL01-35, EL01-29, ER01-1045, EL01-36, EL01-68 (50); retrieve and fax copy of CPUC intervention/protest filed in docket
Paralegal	McLaughlin, Natalie F	1	99	99	Monitor FERC cips for daily releases/orders/notices issued in docket numbers EL00-97, EL00-95, EL00-98, EL01-1, EL01-2, EL01-3, EL01-10, EL01-35, EL01-29, ER01-1045, EL01-36, EL01-68, EL01-64, EL01-47 (50); retrieve and fax copies of CPUC intervention/pr
Paralegal	McLaughlin, Natalie F	0.5	99	49.5	Monitor FERC cips for daily releases/orders/notices issued in docket numbers EL00-97, EL00-95, EL00-98, EL01-1, EL01-2, EL01-3, EL01-10, EL01-35, EL01-29, ER01-1045, EL01-36, EL01-68, EL01-64, EL01-47
Paralegal	McLaughlin, Natalie F	0.5	99	49.5	Monitor FERC cips for daily releases/orders/notices issued in docket numbers EL00-97, EL00-95, EL00-98, EL01-1, EL01-2, EL01-3, EL01-10, EL01-35, EL01-29, ER01-1045, EL01-36, EL01-68, EL01-64, EL01-47
Paralegal	McLaughlin, Natalie F	3.1	99	306.9	Monitor FERC cips for daily releases/orders/notices issued in docket numbers EL00-97, EL00-95, EL00-98, EL01-1, EL01-2, EL01-3, EL01-10, EL01-35, EL01-29, ER01-1045, EL01-36, EL01-68, EL01-64, EL01-47 (50); monitor FERC cips for recent notices of triennial
Paralegal	McLaughlin, Natalie F	1.2	99	118.8	Monitor FERC cips for daily releases/orders/notices issued in docket numbers EL00-97, EL00-95, EL00-98, EL01-1, EL01-2, EL01-3, EL01-10, EL01-35, EL01-29, ER01-1045, EL01-36, EL01-68, EL01-64, EL01-47 (50); monitor FERC cips for recent notices regarding
Paralegal	McLaughlin, Natalie F	1.9	99	188.1	Monitor FERC cips for daily releases/orders/notices issued in docket numbers EL00-97, EL00-95, EL00-98, EL01-1, EL01-2, EL01-3, EL01-10, EL01-35, EL01-29, ER01-1045, EL01-36, EL01-68, EL01-64, EL01-47 (50); monitor FERC cips for recent notices regarding
Paralegal	McLaughlin, Natalie F	2.2	99	217.8	Monitor FERC cips for daily releases/orders/notices issued in docket numbers EL00-97, EL00-95, EL00-98, EL01-1, EL01-2, EL01-3, EL01-10, EL01-35, EL01-29, ER01-1045, EL01-36, EL01-68, EL01-64, EL01-47 (50); monitor FERC cips for recent notices regarding
Paralegal	McLaughlin, Natalie F	1.7	99	168.3	Monitor FERC cips for daily releases/orders/notices issued in docket numbers EL00-97, EL00-95, EL00-98, EL01-1, EL01-2, EL01-3, EL01-10, EL01-35, EL01-29, ER01-1045, EL01-36, EL01-68, EL01-64, EL01-47 (50); retrieve copy of order issued in docket number
Paralegal	McLaughlin, Natalie F	0.8	99	79.2	Monitor FERC cips for daily releases/orders/notices issued in docket numbers EL00-97, EL00-95, EL00-98, EL01-1, EL01-2, EL01-3, EL01-10, EL01-35, EL01-29, ER01-1045, EL01-36, EL01-68, EL01-64, EL01-47 (50); monitor FERC cips for notices pertaining to aut
Paralegal	McLaughlin, Natalie F	1.2	99	118.8	Monitor FERC cips for daily releases/orders/notices issued in docket numbers EL00-97, EL00-95, EL00-98, EL01-1, EL01-2, EL01-3, EL01-10, EL01-35, EL01-29, ER01-1045, EL01-36, EL01-68, EL01-64, EL01-47 (50); monitor FERC cips for notices pertaining to aut
Paralegal	McLaughlin, Natalie F	2.8	99	277.2	Monitor FERC cips for daily releases/orders/notices issued in docket numbers EL00-97, EL00-95, EL00-98, EL01-1, EL01-2, EL01-3, EL01-10, EL01-35, EL01-29, ER01-1045, EL01-36, EL01-68, EL01-64, EL01-47 (50); monitor FERC cips for notices pertaining to aut
Paralegal	McLaughlin, Natalie F	1.2	99	118.8	Monitor FERC cips for daily releases/orders/notices issued in docket numbers EL00-97, EL00-95, EL00-98, EL01-1, EL01-2, EL01-3, EL01-10, EL01-35, EL01-29, ER01-1045, EL01-36, EL01-68, EL01-64, EL01-47 (50); monitor FERC cips for notices pertaining to aut

Paralegal	McLaughlin, Natalie F	1.2	99	118.8	(50); monitor FEREC cips for recent notices regarding	98, EL01-1, EL01-2, EL01-3, EL01-10, EL01-35, EL01-29, ER01-1045, EL01-36, EL01-68, EL01-64, EL01-47
Paralegal	McLaughlin, Natalie F	1.5	99	148.5	(50); monitor FEREC cips for notices pertaining to aurt	98, EL01-1, EL01-2, EL01-3, EL01-10, EL01-35, EL01-29, ER01-1045, EL01-36, EL01-68, EL01-64, EL01-47
Paralegal	McLaughlin, Natalie F	0.9	99	89.1	(40); monitor FEREC cips for notices pertaining to aurt	98, EL01-1, EL01-2, EL01-3, EL01-10, EL01-35, EL01-29, ER01-1045, EL01-36, EL01-68, EL01-64, EL01-47
Paralegal	McLaughlin, Natalie F	6.7	99	663.3	(150); retrieve copies of e-mails and attachments for	98, EL01-1, EL01-2, EL01-3, EL01-10, EL01-35, EL01-29, ER01-1045, EL01-36, EL01-68, EL01-64, EL01-47
Paralegal	McLaughlin, Natalie F	1.8	99	178.2	(0.70); retrieve copies of e-mails and attachments for	98, EL01-1, EL01-2, EL01-3, EL01-10, EL01-35, EL01-29, ER01-1045, EL01-36, EL01-68, EL01-64, EL01-47
Paralegal	McLaughlin, Natalie F	1.1	99	108.9	(0.50); retrieve copies of e-mails and attachments for	98, EL01-1, EL01-2, EL01-3, EL01-10, EL01-35, EL01-29, ER01-1045, EL01-36, EL01-68, EL01-64, EL01-47
Paralegal	McLaughlin, Natalie F	1.5	99	148.5	(0.70); retrieve copies of e-mails and attachments for	98, EL01-1, EL01-2, EL01-3, EL01-10, EL01-35, EL01-29, ER01-1045, EL01-36, EL01-68, EL01-64, EL01-47
Paralegal	McLaughlin, Natalie F	0.9	99	89.1	(0.50); monitor FEREC cips for notices pertaining to a	98, EL01-1, EL01-2, EL01-3, EL01-10, EL01-35, EL01-29, ER01-1045, EL01-36, EL01-68, EL01-64, EL01-47
Paralegal	McLaughlin, Natalie F	1.8	99	178.2	(0.30); monitor FEREC cips for notices pertaining to aurt	98, EL01-1, EL01-2, EL01-3, EL01-10, EL01-35, EL01-29, ER01-1045, EL01-36, EL01-68, EL01-64, EL01-47
Paralegal	McLaughlin, Natalie F	6.1	99	603.9	(0.30); monitor FEREC cips for notices pertaining to a	98, EL01-1, EL01-2, EL01-3, EL01-10, EL01-35, EL01-29, ER01-1045, EL01-36, EL01-68, EL01-64, EL01-47
Paralegal	McLaughlin, Natalie F	8.3	99	821.7	(0.30); monitor FEREC cips for notices pertaining to a	98, EL01-1, EL01-2, EL01-3, EL01-10, EL01-35, EL01-29, ER01-1045, EL01-36, EL01-68, EL01-64, EL01-47
Paralegal	McLaughlin, Natalie F	6.1	99	603.9	(0.30); monitor FEREC cips for notices pertaining to a	98, EL01-1, EL01-2, EL01-3, EL01-10, EL01-35, EL01-29, ER01-1045, EL01-36, EL01-68, EL01-64, EL01-47
Paralegal	McLaughlin, Natalie F	6.7	99	663.3	Organize and prepare volumes 1, 2, 3, 5 (of pleadings/orders from various proceedings) binders (5.20); prepare FEREC hearing exhibit for Mr. Watson (1.50); docket number RPO0-241.	98, EL01-1, EL01-2, EL01-3, EL01-10, EL01-35, EL01-29, ER01-1045, EL01-36, EL01-68, EL01-64, EL01-47

Paralegal	McLaughlin, Natalie I	5.3	99	524.7	Monitor FEREC clips for daily releases/orders/notices issued in docket numbers EL00-97, EL00-95, EL00-98, EL01-1, EL01-2, EL01-3, EL01-10, EL01-35, EL01-29, ER01-1045, EL01-36, EL01-68, EL01-64, EL01-47 (0.30); monitor FEREC clips for notices pertaining to a
Paralegal	McLaughlin, Natalie I	1.2	99	118.8	Retrieve and distribute copies of order on rehearing of monitoring and mitigation plan for the California wholesale electric markets, establishing west-wide mitigation, and establishing settlement conference, docket numbers EL00-95-031, EL00-98-030, -033.
Paralegal	McLaughlin, Natalie I	0.5	99	49.5	Monitor FEREC clips for daily releases/orders/notices issued in docket numbers EL00-97, EL00-95, EL00-98, EL01-1, EL01-2, EL01-3, EL01-10, EL01-35, EL01-29, ER01-1045, EL01-36, EL01-68, EL01-64, EL01-47 (0.30); monitor FEREC clips for notices pertaining to au
Paralegal	McLaughlin, Natalie I	0.6	99	59.4	Monitor FEREC clips for daily releases/orders/notices issued in docket numbers EL00-97, EL00-95, EL00-98, EL01-1, EL01-2, EL01-3, EL01-10, EL01-35, EL01-29, ER01-1045, EL01-36, EL01-68, EL01-64, EL01-47 (0.40); monitor FEREC clips for notices pertaining to au
Paralegal	McLaughlin, Natalie I	2.1	99	207.9	Monitor FEREC clips for daily releases/orders/notices issued in docket numbers EL00-97, EL00-95, EL00-98, EL01-1, EL01-2, EL01-3, EL01-10, EL01-35, EL01-29, ER01-1045, EL01-36, EL01-68, EL01-64, EL01-47 (0.10); review of transcript corrections noted during
Paralegal	McLaughlin, Natalie I	0.7	99	69.3	Retrieve attachments to response to supplemental pleadings and motion to lodge filed 6/25 in docket number EL01-72 for review (0.60); monitor FEREC clips for daily releases/orders/notices issued in docket number EL00-97, EL00-95, EL00-98, EL01-1, EL01-2, E
Paralegal	McLaughlin, Natalie I	3.2	99	316.8	Monitor FEREC clips for daily releases/orders/notices issued in docket numbers EL00-97, EL00-95, EL00-98, EL01-1, EL01-2, EL01-3, EL01-10, EL01-35, EL01-29, ER01-1045, EL01-36, EL01-68, EL01-64, EL01-47 (1.40); monitor FEREC clips for notices pertaining to au
Paralegal	McLaughlin, Natalie I	2	99	198	Monitor FEREC clips for daily releases/orders/notices issued in docket numbers EL00-97, EL00-95, EL00-98, EL01-1, EL01-2, EL01-3, EL01-10, EL01-35, EL01-29, ER01-1045, EL01-36, EL01-68, EL01-64, EL01-47 (0.30); monitor FEREC clips for notices pertaining to au
Paralegal	McLaughlin, Natalie I	0.9	99	89.1	Monitor FEREC clips for daily releases/orders/notices issued in docket numbers EL00-97, EL00-95, EL00-98, EL01-1, EL01-2, EL01-3, EL01-10, EL01-35, EL01-29, ER01-1045, EL01-36, EL01-68, EL01-64, EL01-47 (0.50); monitor FEREC clips for notices pertaining to au
Paralegal	McLaughlin, Natalie I	0.5	99	49.5	Monitor FEREC clips for daily releases/orders/notices issued in various docket numbers.
Paralegal	McLaughlin, Natalie I	1	99	99	Monitor FEREC clips for daily releases/orders/notices issued in docket numbers EL00-97, EL00-95, EL00-98, EL01-1, EL01-2, EL01-3, EL01-10, EL01-35, EL01-29, ER01-1045, EL01-36, EL01-68, EL01-64, EL01-47 (0.30); monitor FEREC clips for notices pertaining to au
Paralegal	McLaughlin, Natalie I	0.8	99	79.2	Monitor FEREC clips for daily releases/orders/notices issued in docket numbers EL00-97, EL00-95, EL00-98, EL01-1, EL01-2, EL01-3, EL01-10, EL01-35, EL01-29, ER01-1045, EL01-36, EL01-68, EL01-64, EL01-47 (0.60); monitor FEREC clips for notices re market-based
Paralegal	McLaughlin, Natalie I	0.4	99	39.6	Retrieve and prepare service list for docket number ER01-2353.
Paralegal	McLaughlin, Natalie I	2.2	99	217.8	Monitor FEREC clips for daily releases/orders/notices issued in docket numbers EL00-97, EL00-95, EL00-98, EL01-1, EL01-2, EL01-3, EL01-10, EL01-35, EL01-29, ER01-1045, EL01-36, EL01-68, EL01-64, EL01-47 (1.00); monitor FEREC clips for notices re market-based
Paralegal	McLaughlin, Natalie I	7	99	693	Monitor FEREC clips for daily releases/orders/notices issued in docket numbers EL00-97, EL00-95, EL00-98, EL01-1, EL01-2, EL01-3, EL01-10, EL01-35, EL01-29, ER01-1045, EL01-36, EL01-68, EL01-64, EL01-47 (0.30); monitor FEREC clips for notices re market-based

Paralegal	McLaughlin, Natalie F	0.6	99	59.4	98, EL01-1, EL01-2, EL01-3, EL01-10, EL01-35, EL01-29, ER01-1045, EL01-36, EL01-68, EL01-64, EL01-47 (0.40); monitor FERC clips for notices re market-based
Paralegal	McLaughlin, Natalie F	1.3	99	128.7	Monitor FERC clips for daily releases/orders/notices issued in docket numbers EL00-97, EL00-95, EL00-98, EL01-1, EL01-2, EL01-3, EL01-10, EL01-35, EL01-29, ER01-1045, EL01-36, EL01-68, EL01-64, EL01-47 (0.40); monitor FERC clips for notices re market-based
Paralegal	McLaughlin, Natalie F	2	99	198	Monitor FERC clips for daily releases/orders/notices issued in docket numbers EL00-97, EL00-95, EL00-98, EL01-1, EL01-2, EL01-3, EL01-10, EL01-35, EL01-29, ER01-1045, EL01-36, EL01-68, EL01-64, EL01-47 (0.80); monitor FERC clips for notices re market-based
Paralegal	McLaughlin, Natalie F	5.7	99	564.3	Cite check request for rehearing and clarification to be filed with FERC in docket numbers EL00-95-031, et al. (3.50); review edits (0.50); file request for rehearing and clarification in docket numbers EL00-95-031, et al. (1.20); monitor FERC clips for da
Paralegal	McLaughlin, Natalie F	0.9	99	89.1	Research re motion to dismiss FERC appeal (0.90).
Paralegal	McLaughlin, Natalie F	1.9	99	188.1	Retrieve docket sheet for 01-1286 for preparation of service list (0.3); research re FERC appeals (0.4); conference with Ms. Constantine, Ms. Nwosu and Mr. Tempelis re database issues (1.1); monitor FERC clips for daily releases/orders/notices issued in var
Paralegal	McLaughlin, Natalie F	2.5	99	247.5	Prepare draft intervention for FERC appeal (1.9); research re FERC appeals (0.6);
Paralegal	McLaughlin, Natalie F	0.8	99	79.2	Monitor FERC clips for daily releases/orders/notices issued in various docket numbers (0.6); research re FERC appeals (0.2).
Paralegal	McLaughlin, Natalie F	1.4	99	138.6	Research re FERC appeals (0.6); monitor FERC clips for daily releases/orders/notices issued in various docket numbers (0.8);
Paralegal	McLaughlin, Natalie F	1.8	99	178.2	Monitor FERC clips for daily releases/orders/notices issued in various docket numbers (1.8)
Paralegal	McLaughlin, Natalie F	1.4	99	138.6	Monitor FERC clips for daily releases/orders/notices issued in various docket numbers (0.7); retrieve and
Paralegal	McLaughlin, Natalie F	1.1	99	108.9	Retrieve documents from RIMS (0.6); research re contract issues (0.5)
Paralegal	McLaughlin, Natalie F	0.7	99	69.3	Conference regarding status of various QF proceedings.
Paralegal	McLaughlin, Natalie F	0.5	99	49.5	Monitor FERC clips and rims for QF documents and distribute.
Paralegal	McLaughlin, Natalie F	0.3	99	29.7	Monitor FERC clips for QF documents and distribute.
Paralegal	McLaughlin, Natalie F	0.4	99	39.6	Monitor FERC clips for QF documents and distribute (0.10); review of service copies of QF documents for duplicates (0.30)
Paralegal	McLaughlin, Natalie F	2.9	99	287.1	Retrieve and organize discovery received in docket number RP00-241 and distribute.
Paralegal	McLaughlin, Natalie F	0.6	99	59.4	Retrieve and organize discovery received in docket number RP00-241.
Paralegal	McLaughlin, Natalie F	3.1	99	306.9	Review and organize discovery for docket number RP00-241 (30); retrieve copy of initial section 5 complaint filed by CPUC in docket number RP00-241 (30); conference regarding additional preparations for upcoming hearing in docket number RP00-241 (30);
Paralegal	McLaughlin, Natalie F	2.3	99	227.7	Retrieve copies of pleadings filed in docket number RP00-241 in preparation of docket book.
Paralegal	McLaughlin, Natalie F	4.7	99	465.3	Retrieve and review discovery received in docket number RP00-241.
Paralegal	McLaughlin, Natalie F	4.4	99	435.6	Review and organize discovery received in docket number RP00-241 (40); review and organize pleadings binders; docket number RP00-241 (4.00).
Paralegal	McLaughlin, Natalie F	6.7	99	663.3	Review and organize discovery received in docket number RP00-241 (4.50); prepare discovery index and tabs (1.30); review and prepare discovery responses to be sent to other parties in docket number RP00-241 proceeding (90).

Paralegal	McLaughlin, Natalie F	8.8	99	871.2	Research regarding FERC Form 567, Form 2, Form 11 (2.40); retrieve copies of spreadsheets for Mr. Petersen's review (10); retrieve documents re docket number RPOO-241 (30); transport of hearing materials in docket number RPOO-241 to FERC (1.20); create
Paralegal	McLaughlin, Natalie F	5.5	99	544.5	Form 2s for pipelines (60); retrieve pleadings and Transport of hearing materials in docket number RPOO-241 to FERC (1.80); retrieve copies of FERC Form 2s (1.10); prepare exhibits for FERC hearing in docket number RPOO-241 (3.40); retrieve electronic copy of protective order issued in docket number RPOO-
Paralegal	McLaughlin, Natalie F	6.6	99	653.4	Retrieve demonstrative exhibits for FERC hearing in docket number RPOO-241 (60); prepare exhibits for FERC hearing in docket number RPOO-241 (90); transport of hearing materials in docket number RPOO-241 to FERC (1.20).
Paralegal	McLaughlin, Natalie F	2.7	99	267.3	Prepare exhibits for FERC hearing in docket number RPOO-241 (1.30); retrieve and copy FERC Form 2s (90); retrieve copies of documents for review (70); transport of hearing materials in docket number RPOO-241 to FERC (1.40).
Paralegal	McLaughlin, Natalie F	4.3	99	425.7	Retrieve transcripts from previous day of FERC hearing in docket number RPOO-241 for review (20); prepare exhibit for FERC hearing in docket number RPOO-241 (80); review information obtained from FERC Form 2s (80); retrieve copies of El Paso marketing
Paralegal	McLaughlin, Natalie F	4.4	99	435.6	Retrieve exhibit and prepare additional exhibits for FERC hearing in docket number RPOO-241 (2.90); prepare fax for Mr. Hall (10); retrieve e-mail attachment for Mr. Petersen's review (10); transport, review and organize exhibit for hearing in docket nu
Paralegal	McLaughlin, Natalie F	4.8	99	475.2	Retrieve exhibit for FERC hearing in docket number RPOO-241 (20); prepare and transport copies of presentation for filing in docket number PLO1-4 and hearing materials in docket number RPOO-241 to FERC (70); retrieve e-mail attachment (10); transport c
Paralegal	McLaughlin, Natalie F	6	99	594	Prepare exhibits for FERC hearing in docket number RPOO-241 (1.80); retrieve copies of documents for review (10); retrieve copies of background information in preparation for RPOO-241 hearing (70); transport of hearing materials in docket number RPOO-24
Paralegal	McLaughlin, Natalie F	5.5	99	544.5	Retrieve exhibit, marketing of affiliate information, for FERC hearing in docket number RPOO-241 (40); retrieve copies of documents (80); retrieve copies of e-mail attachments for review (20); retrieve ENNG-12 exhibit for review (30); review discovery re
Paralegal	McLaughlin, Natalie F	3.5	99	346.5	Prepare hearing exhibit for FERC hearing in docket number RPOO-241 (30); retrieve comments/protests filed in docket numbers RP99-507 and RPOO-336 for review (1.30); retrieve copies of e-mails for review (20); prepare discovery response in docket number RPOO-241 (70); retrieve copy of recent hearing transcripts for review in docket number RPOO-241 (20); retrieve FERC Form 2s (30); prepare analysis of FERC Form 2 data (50).
Paralegal	McLaughlin, Natalie F	1.7	99	168.3	Review of analysis using FERC Form 2 data (100); prepare filing of intervention (0.70); prepare hearing exhibit in docket number RPOO-241(0.50); prepare demonstrative hearing exhibit for reduction (0.50)
Paralegal	McLaughlin, Natalie F	2.7	99	267.3	Prepare and retrieve demonstrative hearing exhibit copies, docket number RPOO-241(0.70); retrieve copies of hearing exhibits in docket number RPOO-241 proceeding (0.30); prepare hearing exhibits docket number RPOO-241 (1.00).
Paralegal	McLaughlin, Natalie F	2	99	198	Prepare hearing exhibit's docket number RPOO-241 (0.30); retrieve copy of fax (0.20).
Paralegal	McLaughlin, Natalie F	0.5	99	49.5	

Paralegal	McLaughlin, Natalie F	5.9	99	584.1	Retrieve copies of e-mails and attachments for review (0.50); prepare hearing exhibit in docket number RPOO-241 (0.20); retrieve copy of workpapers (0.90); retrieve complete copy of discovery submitted in docket number RPOO-241 proceeding (0.20); retrieve
Paralegal	McLaughlin, Natalie F	2.9	99	287.1	Prepare hearing exhibits docket number RPOO-241 (2.10); retrieve copies of FERC order and SCE exhibits for review (0.60); retrieve copies of faxes for distribution (0.20)
Paralegal	McLaughlin, Natalie F	5	99	499	Retrieve copies of e-mails and attachments for review (0.50); prepare hearing exhibits docket number RPOO-241 (3.90); contact Ms. Lewis and Ms. Longo regarding additional research (0.40); retrieve faxes for review (0.10); forward materials to Mr. Wilson
Paralegal	McLaughlin, Natalie F	2.9	99	287.1	Prepare hearing exhibits in docket number RPOO-241 (1.70); prepare faxes for Mr. Lindh (0.50); retrieve hearing transcript for previous day, docket number RPOO-241, for review (0.10); retrieve e-mails and attachments for review (0.40); retrieve copies of
Paralegal	McLaughlin, Natalie F	2.5	99	247.5	Retrieve and fax copy of answer filed in docket number RPOJ-433 for review (0.70); conference regarding retrieval and organization of pleadings/orders filed/issued in various proceedings before FERC for 2000-2001(0.70); retrieve docket sheet containing al
Paralegal	McLaughlin, Natalie F	1.4	99	138.6	Retrieve copies of pleadings/orders filed/issued in docket number RPOO-241(1.10); retrieve research for review (0.10); retrieve FERC Form 2 for review (0.20).
Paralegal	McLaughlin, Natalie F	0.6	99	59.4	Prepare five sets of volumes 1-5 of pleadings/orders binders for distribution.
Paralegal	McLaughlin, Natalie F	2.5	99	247.5	Retrieve FERC hearing materials/demonstrative exhibits, docket number RPOO-241 for transport. Review of hearing transcripts in docket number RPOO-241 and check exhibits identified and received
Paralegal	McLaughlin, Natalie F	2.5	99	247.5	Review of hearing transcripts in docket number RPOO-241 and check exhibits identified and received against official exhibits list.
Paralegal	McLaughlin, Natalie F	6.4	99	633.6	Review of hearing transcripts in docket number RPOO-241 and check exhibits identified and received against official exhibits list (3.80); prepare for shipment of hearing materials to Mr. Petersen and prepare packages containing copies of exhibits for Ms.
Paralegal	McLaughlin, Natalie F	5	99	499	Preparation of complete set of hearing exhibits in docket number RPOO-241 (0.80); retrieve copies of missing exhibits in preparation of original set of hearing exhibits (4.20).
Paralegal	McLaughlin, Natalie F	1.6	99	158.4	Retrieve copies of recent Commission and ALJ orders issued in docket number RPOO-241 for review (0.30); update pleadings/orders binder, docket number RPOO-241 (0.90); review of hearing transcripts (0.30); docket number RPOO-241 (0.40).
Paralegal	McLaughlin, Natalie F	3.2	99	316.8	Review, organize and label workshop materials for RPOO-241 proceeding.
Paralegal	McLaughlin, Natalie F	2.2	99	217.8	Review, organize and label workshop materials for RPOO-241 proceeding (1.90); retrieve and insert copies of hearing exhibits index (0.30)
Paralegal	McLaughlin, Natalie F	0.3	99	29.7	Retrieve and prepare documents for Mr. Fagan.
Paralegal	McLaughlin, Natalie F	3.6	99	356.4	Review, organize and label materials for RPOO-241 proceeding (2.2); retrieve copies of requests for rehearing (0.5); retrieve copies of hearing exhibits (0.9)
Paralegal	McLaughlin, Natalie F	1.9	99	188.1	Prepare and review copies of hearing exhibits in docket number RPOO-241 for errors (1.90).
Paralegal	McLaughlin, Natalie F	0.2	99	19.8	Retrieve witness workpapers.
Paralegal	McLaughlin, Natalie F	2.3	99	227.7	Review and organize FERC hearing transcript corrections in docket number RPOO-241.
Paralegal	McLaughlin, Natalie F	1.1	99	108.9	Review and organize FERC hearing transcripts in docket number RPOO-241 (1.10).
Paralegal	McLaughlin, Natalie F	0.7	99	69.3	Conference with Mr. Mohler, Mr. Fagan, Ms. Grace, Ms. Constanine (0.6); retrieve docket sheet for 01-1288 (0.1).
Paralegal	McLaughlin, Natalie F	2.8	99	277.2	Review and prepare FERC hearing transcript corrections in docket number RPOO-241.
Paralegal	McLaughlin, Natalie F	3.3	99	326.7	Review and organize FERC hearing transcripts in docket number RPOO-241.

Paralegal	Nwosu, Nneka	3.9	113	440.7	Review organization of binders containing filings; organize filings into various categories in chronological order and prepare for copying; prepare binder tabs.
Paralegal	Nwosu, Nneka	5.8	113	655.4	Prepare binders of P&E filings.
Paralegal	Nwosu, Nneka	1	113	113	Attend conference with Ms. Leon to review database.
Paralegal	Nwosu, Nneka	6.1	113	689.3	Review hearing transcripts to record correct date of exhibit identification and receipt into evidence.
Paralegal	Nwosu, Nneka	2.2	113	248.6	Conference with Ms. Leon and Ms. Constantine re database issues.
Paralegal	Nwosu, Nneka	1.4	113	158.2	Review and organize P&E June filings.
Paralegal	Nwosu, Nneka	0.4	113	45.2	Prepare for service of July 12 filing.
Paralegal	Nwosu, Nneka	1	113	113	Conference with Ms. Leon and Ms. Constantine re database issues.
Paralegal	Nwosu, Nneka	1.2	113	139.6	Conference with Ms. Constantine re database issues.
Paralegal	Nwosu, Nneka	1	113	113	Conference with Ms. Davidson and paralegal staff re database issues.
Paralegal	Nwosu, Nneka	1	113	113	Cite check memorandum.
Paralegal	Nwosu, Nneka	2	113	226	Prepare copies of pleadings in preparation for trial (2.00).
Paralegal	Nwosu, Nneka	1.1	113	124.3	Review and print pleadings on RIMS for docket number RPOO-241.
Paralegal	Nwosu, Nneka	1.8	113	203.4	Review and page-check copies of discovery documents (1.80).
Paralegal	Nwosu, Nneka	6.1	113	689.3 (6.10)	Review, organize and prepare hard copies of discovery responses in docket number RPOO-241 for delivery
Paralegal	Nwosu, Nneka	0.7	113	79.1	Prepare CD Rom copies of attachments for discovery response 8, supplement 1.
Paralegal	Nwosu, Nneka	5	113	565	Prepare cover sheets for discovery binders, RP97-287 and RPOO-241; prepare copies of discovery documents; prepare discovery binders in preparation for hearing.
Paralegal	Nwosu, Nneka	0.8	113	90.4	Retrieve orders for docket number RPOO-241 from RIMS.
Paralegal	Nwosu, Nneka	2.7	113	305.1	Prepare copies of discovery documents; prepare discovery binders in preparation for hearing.
Paralegal	Nwosu, Nneka	1.1	113	124.3	Prepare discovery binders in preparation for hearing.
Paralegal	Nwosu, Nneka	5.6	113	632.8	Prepare binders with discovery materials in preparation for hearing at FERC.
Paralegal	Nwosu, Nneka	1.5	113	169.5	Review and add development numbers with Ms. McLaughlin; prepare copies of exhibits with Ms. McLaughlin.
Paralegal	Nwosu, Nneka	2.5	113	282.9	Review El Paso v. CPUC trial testimony notes; attend hearing at FERC; review instructions on mailing list; prepare mailing list.
Paralegal	Nwosu, Nneka	3.2	113	361.6	Review El Paso v. CPUC trial testimony notes (2.20); prepare print outs of form 2 filings (1.00).
Paralegal	Nwosu, Nneka	3.5	113	395.5 (.50)	Review binders (1.50); attend hearing at FERC to deliver original documents (1.50); review RIMS web site
Paralegal	Nwosu, Nneka	2	113	226	Review copies of exhibits in preparation for use at FERC hearing, CPUC v. El Paso (1.00); attend hearing at FERC in order to deliver exhibits (1.00).
Paralegal	Nwosu, Nneka	2	113	226	Review copies of exhibits for the hearing of CPUC v. El Paso; attend hearing at FERC in order to deliver
Paralegal	Nwosu, Nneka	2.6	113	293.8	Attend hearing at FERC, El Paso v. CPUC, to deliver filing and exhibits.
Paralegal	Nwosu, Nneka	3.7	113	418.1	Review hearing transcripts for CPUC v. El Paso for Typing errors.
Paralegal	Nwosu, Nneka	1.3	113	146.9	Attend hearing at FERC to deliver box of trial transcripts and exhibit.
Paralegal	Nwosu, Nneka	0.4	113	45.2	Review RIMS web site and print out May 17th comments and responses for RPOO-336.
Paralegal	Nwosu, Nneka	0.7	113	79.1	Attend hearing at FERC to deliver documents for hearing.
Paralegal	Nwosu, Nneka	6.6	113	745.8	Conference with Ms. Constantine and Ms. McLaughlin to discuss gathering of P&E filings; retrieve filings from RIMS web site; organize filings by docket number.
Paralegal	Nwosu, Nneka	6.6	113	745.8	Retrieve filings from RIMS web site; organize filings by docket number.

Paralegal	Nwosu, Nneka	2.2	113	248.6	Review hearing transcripts to record correct date of exhibit identification and receipt into evidence.
Paralegal	Nwosu, Nneka	4.7	113	531.1	Organize PG&E hearing materials.
Paralegal	Nwosu, Nneka	1.7	113	192.1	Organize and prepare hearing materials; review copies of exhibit binders for completeness.
Paralegal	Nwosu, Nneka	2.1	113	237.3	Review and organize pretrial testimony.
Paralegal	Nwosu, Nneka	0.7	113	79.1	Attend hearing at FERC to deliver memorandum.
Paralegal	Tempelis, Peter M.	8	90	720	Review transcripts re completeness of exhibits (7.50); gather documents to return to client (50).
Paralegal	Tempelis, Peter M.	5.8	90	522	Prepare and organize PG&E hearing materials.
Paralegal	Tempelis, Peter M.	1.4	90	126	Review and organize hearing transcripts re RPO0-241-000.
Paralegal	Tempelis, Peter M.	0.6	90	54	Review and organize hearing transcripts re RPO0-241-000.
Paralegal	Tempelis, Peter M.	5.5	90	495	Review and organize hearing transcripts re RPO0-241-000 (4.5); prepare for entry of transcripts into 495 computer database (1.0).
Paralegal	Tempelis, Peter M.	4	90	360	Organize PG&E files; prepare hearing binders; review documents for entry into PG&E database.
Paralegal	Tempelis, Peter M.	3	90	270	Prepare binders with hearing materials for PG&E and organize PG&E file.
Paralegal	Tempelis, Peter M.	2.5	90	225	Conference with Ms. Leon re PG&E database.
Paralegal	Tempelis, Peter M.	3.5	90	315	Review and organize service lists (2.5); serve documents (1.0).
Paralegal	Tempelis, Peter M.	1.5	90	139	Conference with Ms. Leon re PG&E database.
Paralegal	Tempelis, Peter M.	1.1	90	99	Obtain rehearing papers.
Paralegal	Tempelis, Peter M.	0.9	90	81	Conference with Ms. Constantine, Ms. McLaughlin, and Ms. Nwosu re document database (9).
Paralegal	Tempelis, Peter M.	1	90	90	Conference with Ms. Davidson re database issues (1.0).
Paralegal	Tempelis, Peter M.	0.5	90	45	Conference with Ms. Davidson re database issues.
Paralegal	Tempelis, Peter M.	0.8	90	72	Update PG&E database.
Paralegal	Tempelis, Peter M.	2.7	90	243	Update PG&E database.
Paralegal	Tempelis, Peter M.	1	90	90	Organize pretrial testimony for attorney use.
Paralegal	Tempelis, Peter M.	1	90	90	Organize materials for attorney use.
Paralegal	Tempelis, Peter M.	2	90	180	Prepare list of hearing transcripts for Mr. Fagan and Mr. Andrea.
Paralegal	Tempelis, Peter M.	1.1	90	99	Deliver pleading to FERC.
Paralegal	Stone, Matthew B.	0.9	90	81	Index pleadings, documents, case-related files.
Paralegal	Stone, Matthew B.	1.2	90	108	Prepare documents for attorney review.
Paralegal	Stone, Matthew B.	1.1	90	99	Conference with Mr. Luster re case status and work assignments.
Paralegal	Stone, Matthew B.	2.7	90	243	Prepare index of case files and documents.
Paralegal	Stone, Matthew B.	2.2	90	198	Index FERC and related case materials.
Paralegal	Stone, Matthew B.	1.1	90	99	Prepare index for CPUC case files.
Paralegal	Stone, Matthew B.	1.2	90	108	Prepare index of documents and CPUC materials.
Paralegal	Stone, Matthew B.	0.8	90	72	Procure recusal orders for Mr. Popofsky.
Paralegal	Stone, Matthew B.	0.2	90	18	Arrange delivery of documents for attorney review.
Paralegal	Stone, Matthew B.	1.6	90	144	Prepare documents for attorney review.
Paralegal	Stone, Matthew B.	1.9	90	171	Prepare documents for attorney review.
Paralegal	Stone, Matthew B.	2.4	90	216	Prepare documents for attorney review.
Paralegal	Stone, Matthew B.	0.3	90	27	Update legal research files.
Paralegal	Stone, Matthew B.	2.3	90	207	Prepare documents for attorney review.
Paralegal	Stone, Matthew B.	1.5	90	135	Prepare documents for attorney review.
Paralegal	Stone, Matthew B.	2	90	180	Prepare documents for attorney review.
Paralegal	Stone, Matthew B.	0.8	90	72	Prepare documents for attorney review.

Paralegal	Stone, Matthew B.	12	90	108	Organize and prepare documents for review by Ms. Gould.
Paralegal	Stone, Matthew B.	14	90	126	Prepare documents for review by Ms. Gould.
Paralegal	Williams, Mark C.	0.5	140	70	Locate copy of Judge Wilken's recusal in California v. Dynegy for Ms. C. Gould.
Paralegal	Holzer, Michele K.	0.5	99	49.5	Legal research re power marketers.
Paralegal	Holzer, Michele K.	3.7	99	366.3	Legal research re power marketers.
Paralegal	Holzer, Michele K.	1.7	99	168.3	Legal research re power marketers.
Paralegal	Holzer, Michele K.	2.5	99	247.5	Legal research re power marketers.
Paralegal	Holzer, Michele K.	0.5	99	49.5	Legal research re power marketers.
Paralegal	Holzer, Michele K.	0.6	99	59.4	Legal research re Department of Water Resources Notices and Service Agreements.
Staff	Alderman, Kate K.	0.2	126	25.2	Legal research for Mr. Cole.
Staff	Alderman, Kate K.	0.6	126	75.6	Computerized legal research for Ms. Gould.
Staff	Alderman, Kate K.	0.5	126	63	Computerized legal research for Ms. Fiala.
Staff	Alderman, Kate K.	0.4	126	50.4	Legal research for Ms. Gordon.
Staff	Alderman, Kate K.	0.1	126	12.6	Legal research for Ms. Fiala.
Staff	Alderman, Kate K.	0.2	126	25.2	Legal research for Mr. Luster.
Staff	Alderman, Kate K.	0.1	126	12.6	Legal research for Mr. Cole.
Staff	Alderman, Kate K.	0.2	126	25.2	Computerized legal research for Mr. Luster.
Staff	Alderman, Kate K.	0.2	126	25.2	Computerized legal research for Mr. Benvenutti.
Staff	Leasy, Janna L.	2	68	136	Obtain initial filings in FERC dockets for Pierce Power, LLC, Fountain Valley Power LLC, and Eron Sandhill.
Staff	Leasy, Janna L.	0.5	68	34	210(d) proceedings; forward same to attorney.
Staff	Leasy, Janna L.	1	68	68	Obtain motions to intervene and comments and emergency requests for relief filed with FERC in response to FERC notices (30); forward same to attorneys (10).
Staff	Leasy, Janna L.	0.7	68	47.6	Research re procedures for electronic filing of documents with FERC.
Staff	Leasy, Janna L.	0.5	68	34	Finalize and prepare for filing with FERC comments on section 210(d) proceedings.
Staff	Leasy, Janna L.	0.2	68	13.6	Telephone with FERC re status of Pe&E's electronic filing of comments on section 210(d) proceeding (0.10); e-mail to attorney re same (0.10).
Staff	Leasy, Janna L.	0.3	68	20.4	Research re order issued in FERC docket ELOI-49 (10); e-mail to attorney re same (10); telephone with paralegal in DC office re same (10).
Staff	Leasy, Janna L.	0.4	68	27.2	Retrieve FERC order granting emergency relief (0.20); forward same to attorney (0.10); manage docket (0.10).
Staff	Leasy, Janna L.	0.2	68	13.6	Retrieve order issuing protective order in Docket RP0-241 (10); forward same to attorney (10).
Staff	Leasy, Janna L.	0.1	68	6.8	Locate sample of motion to lodge; forward same to attorney.
Staff	Gordon, Jennifer L.	3	81	243	Update index of hearing exhibits; prepare binder of exhibits for Mr. Mohler.
Staff	Gordon, Jennifer L.	2.5	81	202.5	Update exhibit list; update exhibit binder; prepare binder of original exhibits; revise outline.
Staff	Gordon, Jennifer L.	1	81	81	Prepare exhibits for Mr. Fagan; update hearing exhibit index and binder.
Staff	Gordon, Jennifer L.	0.5	81	40.5	Update hearing exhibit index and update exhibit binders.
Staff	Gordon, Jennifer L.	0.8	81	64.8	Update exhibit index and exhibit binders.
Staff	Gordon, Jennifer L.	0.5	81	40.5	Revise exhibit index and exhibit binder.
Staff	Gordon, Jennifer L.	1.3	81	105.3	Update exhibit index and exhibit binder.
Staff	Gordon, Jennifer L.	0.3	81	24.3	Prepare exhibit for Mr. Fagan; revise exhibit for Mr. Mohler.
Staff	Gordon, Jennifer L.	4.5	81	364.5	Discussion with Mr. Mohler; prepare exhibits for Mr. Peterson.

Staff	Gordon, Jennifer L.	2	81	162	Retrieve documents from FERC's website.
Staff	Morris, Cheryl L.	2	68	136	Docketing and file management of FERC pleadings for Docket ELOO-95 (2.0)
Staff	Morris, Cheryl L.	3.5	68	238	Docketing and file management of FERC pleadings in FERC docket ELOO-95 (3.5 hrs)
Staff	Morris, Cheryl L.	4	68	272	Docketing and file management of FERC Docket ELO095 (4 hrs.)
Staff	Morris, Cheryl L.	2	68	136	Docketing and file management of FERC pleadings for docket ELOO-95.
Staff	Morris, Cheryl L.	3.5	68	238	Docketing and file management of FERC pleadings for docket ELO095 (3.5)
Staff	Morris, Cheryl L.	3	68	204	Docketing and file management of FERC pleadings for docket ELO095 (3.0)
Staff					Docketing and file management for docket ELO095 (1.0); docketing and file management for pleadings in docket ELO098 (1.0); docketing and file management re DC Circuit Court of Appeals and Ninth Circuit
Staff	Morris, Cheryl L.	6	68	408	Court of Appeals (2.0); docketing and file management
Staff	Morris, Cheryl L.	3.5	68	238	Docketing and file management of FERC pleadings; docket No. ELO095
Staff	Morris, Cheryl L.	3	68	204	Docketing and file management of pleadings for FERC docket no. ELOO-95.
Staff	Morris, Cheryl L.	2.2	68	149.6	Docketing and file management of pleadings for docket ELOO-95 (2); prepare cover letter and documents to send to Ms. Reid at PG&E (2).
Staff	Morris, Cheryl L.	2	68	136	Docketing and file management of FERC pleadings for Docket ELOO-95.
Staff					Research re new National Energy Policy and download same (8); forward designated materials to Ms. Reid at PG&E (2).
Staff	Morris, Cheryl L.	1	68	68	Review and sort newest QF pleadings (8); draft and send letter to Ms. Reid enclosing latest QF pleadings (2)
Staff	Morris, Cheryl L.	1	68	68	Docketing and file management of FERC pleadings re docket ELOO-95.
Staff	Morris, Cheryl L.	1.5	68	102	Docketing and file management of FERC pleadings in docket ELO095 (3.2)
Staff	Morris, Cheryl L.	0.4	68	27.2	Read and organize most recent documents and filings of parties re various FERC documents (4)
Staff	Morris, Cheryl L.	1.9	68	129.2	Docketing and file management for pleadings in FERC Docket ELOO-95.
Staff	Morris, Cheryl L.	2.5	68	170	Docketing and file management of FERC pleadings for dockets ELO098 (.5); ER01-1448, 1449, 1451, 1453 (2.0).
Staff					Review new pleadings received in various FERC dockets (1.5 hrs); docketing and file management of FERC pleadings in docket ELO095 (2.5 hrs.)
Staff	Morris, Cheryl L.	4	68	272	Docketing and file management of FERC pleadings for docket ELO095 (4.0)
Staff	Morris, Cheryl L.	1.9	68	129.2	Docketing and file management of FERC pleadings for Docket ELO095.
Staff	Morris, Cheryl L.	2.9	68	197.2	Docketing and file management of FERC pleadings.
Staff	Morris, Cheryl L.	3.2	68	217.6	Docketing and file management of pleadings in docket ELO095.
Staff	Morris, Cheryl L.	1.2	68	81.6	Docketing and file management of FERC pleadings for Docket No. ELO095.
Staff	Morris, Cheryl L.	2.1	68	142.8	management of pleadings for FERC Docket ELO095 (1.9 hrs); docketing and file management of
Staff	Morris, Cheryl L.	1.2	68	81.6	bankruptcy pleadings and documents (6).
Staff	Morris, Cheryl L.	3.1	68	210.8	Docketing and file management of FERC pleadings for Docket ELOO-95.
Staff					Docketing and file management for FERC docket ELO1-68 (9); docketing and file management for FERC docket ER01-1685 (5); docketing and file management for FERC docket ER01-1877 (5); docketing a
Staff	Morris, Cheryl L.	3.9	68	265.2	management for FERC docket ER01-1877 (5); docketing a
Staff	Morris, Cheryl L.	2.2	68	149.6	Docketing and file management of FERC pleadings in docket ELOO-95.
Staff	Morris, Cheryl L.	1.9	68	129.2	Docketing and file management of FERC pleadings for Docket ELOO-95.

Staff	Morris, Cheryl L.	1	68	68	Docketing and file management of FERC pleadings for Docket No. ER01-1444, 1445, 1446, and 1447 (5); management of FERC pleadings for Docket No. ER01-1686 (2)
Staff	Morris, Cheryl L.	0.4	68	27.2	Create/draft index of documents to be sent to storage.
Staff	Morris, Cheryl L.	4	68	272	Organize files and docket entries re docket ELO0-95.
Staff	Morris, Cheryl L.	2.2	68	149.6	Organize files and docket entries re docket ELO0-95.
Staff	Morris, Cheryl L.	2.9	68	197.2	Organize files and docket entries re docket ELO0-95.
Staff	Morris, Cheryl L.	2.2	68	149.6	Organize files and docket entries re docket ELO0-95.
Staff	Morris, Cheryl L.	4	68	272	Organize files and docket entries re docket ELO0-95.
Staff	Morris, Cheryl L.	2.2	68	149.6	Organize files and docket entries re docket ELO0-95.
Staff	Morris, Cheryl L.	1.7	68	115.6	Organize files and docket entries re docket ELO0-95.
Staff	Morris, Cheryl L.	1.2	68	81.6	Organize files and docket entries re docket ELO0-95.
Staff	Morris, Cheryl L.	5	68	340	Organize files and docket entries re docket ELO0-95.
Staff	Morris, Cheryl L.	1.2	68	81.6	Organize files and docket entries re docket ELO0-95.
Staff	Morris, Cheryl L.	2.2	68	149.6	Organize files and docket entries re docket ELO0-95.
Staff	Morris, Cheryl L.	0.9	68	61.2	Organize bankruptcy pleading files.
Staff	Morris, Cheryl L.	3.8	68	258.4	Organize files and enter dockets for FERC pleadings.
Staff	Morris, Cheryl L.	2	68	136	FERC order and designate list of respondents (18).
Staff	Morris, Cheryl L.	0.6	126	75.6	Legal research for Ms. Gould.
Staff	Morris, Cheryl L.	0.1	126	12.6	Computerized legal research for Ms. Fiala.
Staff	Morris, Cheryl L.	0.3	126	37.8	Legal research for Mr. Luster.
Staff	Morris, Cheryl L.	0.2	126	25.2	Computerized legal research for Mr. Cole.
Staff	Morris, Cheryl L.	0.4	126	50.4	Computerized and legal research for Mr. Luster.
Staff	Morris, Cheryl L.	0.6	126	75.6	Computerized and legal research for Mr. Luster.
Staff	Morris, Cheryl L.	0.2	126	25.2	Legal research for Ms. Fiala.
Staff	Morris, Cheryl L.	0.3	126	37.8	Computerized legal research for Mr. Luster.
Staff	Morris, Cheryl L.	0.3	126	37.8	Computerized legal research for Mr. Luster.
Staff	Morris, Cheryl L.	0.9	126	113.4	Computerized legal research for Mr. Luster.
Staff	Morris, Cheryl L.	0.3	126	37.8	Computerized legal research for Mr. Luster.
Staff	Morris, Cheryl L.	0.6	126	75.6	Computerized legal research for Mr. Luster.
Staff	Morris, Cheryl L.	0.6	126	75.6	Computerized legal research for Mr. Luster.
Staff	Morris, Cheryl L.	8	90	720	Cross-reference dockets to prepare for four filings and service on Friday.
Staff	Morris, Cheryl L.	3	90	270	Continue to cross-reference dockets to prepare for four filings and service on Friday.
Staff	Morris, Cheryl L.	3	90	270	Continue to cross-reference dockets to prepare for four filings and service on Friday.
Staff	Morris, Cheryl L.	0.5	90	45	Meeting with Ms. Kim and Ms. McLaughlin re capturing, organizing and creating binders.
Staff	Morris, Cheryl L.	4.9	90	441	Meeting with Ms. McLaughlin and Ms. Nwosu re retrieving and organizing documents (50); retrieve and organize documents (440).
Staff	Morris, Cheryl L.	6.5	90	585	Retrieve, print, organize and analyze FERC documents (600); discussions with Messrs. McLaughlin and Nwosu re same.

Staff	Constantine, Ann	4.8	90	432	Meeting re document strategy and organization (50); sort, organize and prepare documents for copying (300); begin organizing binders with documents (130).
Staff	Constantine, Ann	5.9	90	531	Check documents for accuracy, organize binders with documents and label binders and tabs (490); prepare and ship binders to client (100).
Staff	Constantine, Ann	1.3	90	117	Finish compiling binders and distributing same (130).
Staff	Constantine, Ann	1.8	90	162	Meeting re database.
Staff	Constantine, Ann	0.4	90	36	Teleconference with Ms. Leon, Ms. McLaughlin and Ms. Nwosu re database.
Staff	Constantine, Ann	0.2	90	18	E-mail to Mr. Bernman re database and proposed use of same.
Staff	Constantine, Ann	1.5	90	135	Teleconference with Ms. Leon, Messrs. Tempells, Gruhl and Scarano, Ms. McLaughlin re database.
Staff	Constantine, Ann				Teleconference with Ms. Kim re binder supplements and conference with Ms. McLaughlin re same (30); receive and respond to e-mails re database (20); analyze e-mails from Ms. Borrasca re database issues and forward e-mails to Ms. Leon and Ms. Simpson re s
Staff	Constantine, Ann	1.6	90	144	and forward e-mails to Ms. Leon and Ms. Simpson re s
Staff	Constantine, Ann	1.4	90	126	Meeting with Ms. Borrasca re database (40); cite check memorandum for Mr. Fagan (10).
Staff	Constantine, Ann				Attend meeting re database issues(2,30); meeting and email with Ms. Stewart re monitoring and printing PG&E FERC filed documents and FERC orders; email with Ms. Kim re same (110).
Staff	Constantine, Ann	3.4	90	306	Exchange emails with Ms. Kim and Ms. Stewart re June FERC documents; meeting with Ms. Stewart re Exchange emails with Ms. Kim and Ms. Stewart re
Staff	Constantine, Ann	0.8	90	72	same.
Staff	Constantine, Ann	0.4	90	36	Send and respond to emails re June Supplemental Binders (20); meeting with Ms. Borrasca re docket list and document retrieval (20).
Staff	Constantine, Ann	2.7	90	243	File and serve document for Mr. Fagan (30); meeting with Ms. Nwosu and Ms. Stewart re supplemental binders (30); analyze and sort documents (190).
Staff	Constantine, Ann	1	90	90	Exchange emails with Ms. Kim re filing (20); telephone with Ms. Leon re database (40); exchange emails with Ms. Borrasca re same (40).
Staff	Constantine, Ann	0.4	90	36	Exchange emails with Ms. Borrasca and Ms. Leon re database.
Staff	Constantine, Ann	1.8	90	162	Review emails and attachments from Ms. Borrasca (40); attend meeting re database with Mses. Leon, McLaughlin and Nwosu and Mr. Tempells (140).
Staff	Constantine, Ann	1.6	90	144	Cite check brief (130); exchange emails with Ms. McLaughlin and Mr. Fagan re same (30).
Staff	Constantine, Ann				Conference with Ms. Leon and Ms. McLaughlin re database (30); test database and email Ms. Leon re same (20); meeting with Ms. McLaughlin re appeals of June 19 FERC Order, telephone with clerk of the court and Mr. Fagan re same (70).
Staff	Constantine, Ann	1.2	90	108	Meeting with Ms. Nwosu and Mr. Tempells re maintaining database (30); telephone with Ms. Davidson re same (10); email and facsimile to Ms. Leon re documents to be downloaded (30); conference with Ms. Davidson re daily monitoring of FERC site (80); tel
Staff	Constantine, Ann	2.3	90	207	Meeting re document database (1.3); compile list of reports, users and email to Ms. Leon re same (10).
Staff	Constantine, Ann	3.6	90	324	Davidson re document management issues.
Staff	Constantine, Ann	0.1	90	9	Conference re document management issues.
Staff	Constantine, Ann	0.6	90	54	Conference with Ms. McLaughlin re transmission of documents to Ms. Leon (0.3); meeting with Ms. Davidson re project status (0.3).
Staff	Constantine, Ann	0.8	90	72	Meeting with Ms. McLaughlin re CTPs (10); telephone with Ms. Leon re database (30); send email re (10); retrieve and print orders from CTPs (40).
Staff	Constantine, Ann	0.8	90	72	Forward current email re FERC (20); assist in preparation of service lists (50); email re database (10).
Staff	Constantine, Ann	0.4	90	36	Conference with Mr. Tempells re FERC site review and RIMS numbers.
Staff	Constantine, Ann	0.7	90	63	Meeting with Mr. Mohler re post Phase I hearing tasks (50); meeting with Ms. McLaughlin re Phase I hearing exhibit check (20).

Staff	Constantine, Ann	5:2	90	468	Review exhibit lists for accuracy (4:00); review exhibit binders for completeness (1:20).
Staff	Constantine, Ann	6:3	90	567	Organize documents to be removed to the workroom (2:30); review, organize and retrieve missing exhibits for copying and mailing to client (4:00).
Staff	Constantine, Ann	3:4	90	306	Meeting with Ms. McLaughlin re organization of transcripts and exhibits (40); review exhibits for accuracy; update indices and organize same with transcripts to send to client (1:80); review binders and continue to organize documents (1:20).
Staff	Constantine, Ann	1:5	90	135	Identify, organize and label documents in workroom.
Staff	Constantine, Ann	0:7	90	63	Review and reply to emails from Mr. Mohler re retrieving documents and CD (50); telephone with Ms. McLaughlin re same (20).
Staff	Constantine, Ann	0:5	90	45	Meeting with Messrs. Mohler and Fagan, Ms. Grace and Ms. McLaughlin re strategy for upcoming deadlines.
Staff	Constantine, Ann	0:1	90	9	Telephone with Ms. McLaughlin re transcript.
Staff	Constantine, Ann	0:1	90	9	Telephone with Mr. Fagan re binders.
Staff	Leon, Daphne	8	180	1440	Set up and implement document database.
Staff	Leon, Daphne	4	180	720	Set up and implement document database.
Staff	Leon, Daphne	6	180	1080	Set up and implement document database.
Staff	Leon, Daphne	6	180	1080	Set up and implement document database.
Staff	Leon, Daphne	5	180	900	Set up and implement document database.
Staff	Leon, Daphne	6	180	1080	Set up and implement document database.
Staff	Leon, Daphne	8	180	1440	Set up and implement document database.
Staff	Leon, Daphne	8	180	1440	Set up and implement document database.
Staff	Leon, Daphne	6	180	1080	Set up and implement document database.
Staff	Leon, Daphne	7	180	1260	Set up and implement document database.
Staff	Leon, Daphne	6	180	1080	Set up and implement document database.
Staff	Leon, Daphne	12	180	2160	Conferences with team members re database issues (8:0); revise database (4:0).
Staff	Leon, Daphne	6	180	1080	Develop document database functions.
Staff	Leon, Daphne	2	180	360	Develop document database functions.
Staff	Leon, Daphne	4	180	720	Develop document database functions.
Staff	Leon, Daphne	5	180	900	Develop document database functions.
Staff	Leon, Daphne	8	180	1440	Develop document database functions (7:0); conference with Ms. Constantine re same (0:4).
Staff	Leon, Daphne	6	180	1080	Develop document database functions.
Staff	Leon, Daphne	6	180	1080	Develop document database functions.
Staff	Leon, Daphne	6	180	1080	Develop database functions.
Staff	Leon, Daphne	7	180	1260	Develop document database functions.
Staff	Leon, Daphne	3:5	180	630	Download documents from FERC website into database.
Staff	Leon, Daphne	5	180	900	Download documents from FERC website, convert format, and add to document database.
Staff	Leon, Daphne	5	180	900	Download documents from FERC website, convert format, and add to document database.
Staff	Leon, Daphne	5	180	900	Download documents from FERC website, convert format, and add to document database.
Staff	Leon, Daphne	3	180	540	Download documents from FERC website, convert format, and add to database.
Staff	Leon, Daphne	4:5	180	810	Download documents from FERC website, convert format, and add to document database.
Staff	Leon, Daphne	6:5	180	1170	Download documents from FERC website, convert format, and add to document database.
Staff	Leon, Daphne	3	180	540	Revise document database functions.
Staff	Leon, Daphne	3	180	540	Download files from FERC website, convert format, and add to document database.

Staff	Leon, Daphne	5	180	900	Download documents from FERC website, format, and add to document database.
Staff	Stewart, Shannon M.	2	90	180	Assemble June 2001 FERC filings for Ms. Constantine.
Summer Associate	Kolek, Alissa B.	0.2	149	29.8	Conference with Mr. Reiber re assignment and read background re same.
Summer Associate	Kolek, Alissa B.	1.7	149	253.3	Conference with Mr. Reiber re assignment (0.4); commence research re CPUC administrative proceeding rules (1.3).
Summer Associate	Kolek, Alissa B.	0.2	149	29.8	Research re CPUC reasonableness review issues.
Summer Associate	Kolek, Alissa B.	2.7	149	402.3	Legal research re CPUC reasonableness review issues.
Summer Associate	Kolek, Alissa B.	3.2	149	476.8	Read CPUC cases re reasonableness review issues.
Summer Associate	Kolek, Alissa B.	2.4	149	357.6	Legal research re CPUC reasonableness review issues.
Summer Associate	Kolek, Alissa B.	1.3	149	193.7	Legal research re CPUC reasonableness review issues.
Summer Associate	Kolek, Alissa B.	9.5	149	1415.5	Draft memorandum re CPUC reasonableness review issues.
Summer Associate	Kolek, Alissa B.	3.3	149	491.7	Draft memorandum re CPUC reasonableness review issues.
		1769.4		206791	

Milbank First Fee Application

Pacific Gas & Electric

April - July, 2001

Summary of Three Categories Containing Fees Related to Regulatory/Legislative Matters

The three Milbank billing categories containing fees related to regulatory and legislative energy matters are: other litigation, business analysis and business operations.

Summary of Three Billing Categories

	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Fees</u>
Regulatory	1,813.4	659,810
Non-Regulatory	838.0	373,635
Total	<u>2,651.3</u>	<u>1,033,445</u>

Milbank's Other Litigation Category

<u>Professional</u>	<u>Hrly Rate</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Fees</u>	<u>General Description of Primary Nature of Services based on UST review</u>
Kramer	470	239.7	112,659	FERC analysis re ring-fncg, creditworth., caps,qfs and filed rate doctrine
Urquhart	385	258.2	99,407	FERC Monitoring & Settlement Conference
Liles	330	7.8	2,574	FERC Settlement Conference (filled in for Urquhart)
Feo	595	31.2	18,564	Primarily review; ISO and Turn issues
Neufeld	435	19.3	8,396	Attend hearing re Turn acctg (\$3,393); Review motion/opposition to ISO (\$566)
Sorochinsky	420	18.8	7,896	PGE v. ISO, PGE v. CPUC, FERC refund proceeding, ordinary course motions
McSpadden	415	13.4	5,561	CPUC matters, inc. CPUC OII; attended en banc hrg on natural gas rulemaking
Paschal	295	7.2	2,124	Attended, summarized PUC hearing on 5/11/01
Michalchuk	295	38.7	11,417	Research re jurisdictional issues; research "takings" argument under 5th Amdnt
Jackson	385	31.5	12,128	Research re sovereign immunity defense
Kaplan	295	33.1	9,765	Research pending SCE & PGE Litigation (primarily SCE)
Johnson	420	3.6	1,512	California AG's petition to SEC
Marks	450	11.4	5,130	Various regulatory matters
Sub-total, regulatory		<u>713.9</u>	<u>297,133</u>	
<u>Primarily "non-regulatory" in this category</u>				
Diamond	595	88.4	52,598	Lead atty for interv.mttrs; attended bk ct hrs re CPUC(5/14), ISO(6/05), ? (7/16)
Gooding	385	152.0	58,520	CC Intervention in regulatory proceedings; ISO Adv Proceeding & CC Intervention
Cho	350	77.3	27,055	CC Intervention in regulatory proceedings
Aronzon	595	35.9	21,361	Primarily committee related
Moore	595	10.1	6,010	Primarily ordinary course motions
Ostrow	490	24.4	11,956	Primarily QF motions and matters
Coy	350	4.7	1,645	Posdef v. Cal ISO
Noller	135	10.8	1,451	Administrative
Sub-total, non-regulatory		<u>403.6</u>	<u>180,596</u>	
Total - "Other Litigation"		<u>1,117.5</u>	<u>477,729</u>	

EXHIBIT I

Milbank's Business Analysis Category

Professional	Hrly Rate	Hours	Fees	General Description of Primary Nature of Services based on UST review
Schwarz	185	146.9	27,177	Monitoring US congress re energy crisis developments
Sorochinsky	420	2.4	1,007	California legislative matters re energy crisis
Seja	160	7.0	1,120	Monitoring congressional activity on energy legislation
Sub-total, regulatory		156.3	29,304	
<u>Primarily "non-regulatory" in this category</u>				
Moore	595	53.2	31,654	Committee related and general case strategy
Aronzon	595	9.1	5,415	Conferences with Saybrook & Pwc re financial modeling & asset analysis
McSpadden	415	0.5	208	Review PG&E B-K filing
Sub-total, non-regulatory		62.8	37,277	
Total - "Bus. Analysis"		219.1	66,581	

Milbank's Business Operations Category

Professional	Hrly Rate	Hours	Fees	General Description of Primary Nature of Services based on UST review
Marks	450	196.4	88,380	Primarily legislative and regulatory monitoring
Feo	595	126.1	75,000	Review CPUC, FERC, CDWR, Sacramento devlpmts; committee and subcommittee.
McSpadden	415	242.0	100,430	CPUC, monitor SCE developments, attend hearings re URG, attend CPUC workshops
Renenger	160	81.5	13,040	Legislative tracking charts; research federal/state pre-emption
Mathurin	325	42.8	13,894	Primarily memo on bills proposed during assembly and senate special sessions
Kahane	160	60.2	9,632	Legislative tracking assignment
Kittiaksorn	160	50.0	8,000	Summarize procedural history for PGE; monitored DWR and MOU/SCE hearings
Hymers	160	26.0	4,160	Research re federal juris. Over disp of PU assets; CPUC workshop
Eichmann	160	17.0	2,720	On-line research re CPUC decisions re public utility assets
Ochoa	160	22.0	3,520	California legislative committee hearings and bill tracking summary log
Sikes	160	21.1	3,376	Legislative tracking and updates
Paschal	295	11.1	3,260	Attend real time pricing workshop (\$1,048); CPUC OII matter
Maghakian	160	14.2	2,272	Review and organize papers, documents and mail for Ed Feo re SDG&E/FERC case
LaPlante	160	12.7	2,032	Legislative history of pending bills; unspecified court hearing
Oliveira	240	2.3	552	California State Treasurer's call
Song	350	1.0	350	Coordinate with Renenger summarizing various pending bills
Liles	330	0.3	99	FERC jurisdiction under FPA
Lewis	160	16.6	2,656	Research re PGE's obligation to serve
Sub-total, regulatory		943.2	333,373	
<u>Primarily "non-regulatory" in this category</u>				
Moore	595	126.9	75,506	Ordinary course motions; commodities trading motion; general matters
Sorochinsky	420	142.9	60,018	Primarily commodities trading motion
Talerico	160	59.4	9,504	Commodities trading motion; CPUC workshop (\$512)
Neufeld	435	5.5	2,393	Commodities trading motion
Aronzon	595	5.1	3,035	General overview; commodities trading motion
Rossi	160	31.3	5,008	Analyzed and summarized energy contracts
Diamond	595	0.5	298	QF issues
Sub-total, non-regulatory		371.6	155,762	
Total - "Bus. Operations"		1,314.8	489,135	

TRADING MOTION (IN OPERATIONS CATEGORY PRIMARILY LAST FEW ENTRIES IN CC CATEGORY)						
04/20/01 Partner	ROBERT JAY MOORE	0.5	595	298	Conference with S. Gaultier regarding Trading Order Motion (2); Meeting with F. Neufeld regarding Qualified Facility litigation and analysis (3).	
04/23/01 Partner	ROBERT JAY MOORE	0.4	595	238	Review MLX pleadings (2); Telephone conversation with S. Gaultier regarding Trading Motion research issues (2); Telephone conversation with J. Bloom regarding qualified facility conference call and Dynegy position (2); Conference P. Avonzon regarding LA Times report comments on CDWR release regarding purported Committee support for sale of transmission lines; Revl	
04/30/01 Partner	ROBERT JAY MOORE	1.1	595	655	Review and revise trading order (0.2); review and revise trading order motion (0.4); review and revise ex parte application re trading motion (0.3)-0.9.	
05/01/01 Associate	MICHAEL I. SOROCHINSKY	0.9	420	378	Review and revise trading order (0.5); review and revise trading order motion (0.5)	
05/02/01 Associate	MICHAEL I. SOROCHINSKY	1	420	420	Review and revise trading order (1.2); review and revise trading order (0.9); e-mail to committee members re review and revise motion re trading order (0.3)	
05/03/01 Associate	MICHAEL I. SOROCHINSKY	2.2	420	924	Review and revise Ex Parte Trading Motion.	
05/04/01 Associate	FRED NEUFELD	1	435	435	Review and revise motion re order shortening time re trading order motion (1.9); tl;w/ M. Lune re changes to trading order and trading order (0.2); review and revise same (0.5); review e-mails re comments (0.2); review and revise confidentiality	
05/04/01 Associate	MICHAEL I. SOROCHINSKY	3.2	420	1,344	Review and revise trading motion (1.0); review and revise trading order (0.8); review and revise motion shortening time re same (1.3); review e-mails re same (0.3).	
05/07/01 Associate	MICHAEL I. SOROCHINSKY	3.4	420	1,428	Review and revise trading order (0.2); messages to and from K. Coleman re same (0.2); telephone conferences with B. Young re same (0.2); e-mails to PG&E team re same (0.1).	
05/09/01 Associate	MICHAEL I. SOROCHINSKY	0.7	420	294	Review and revise trading order (0.5); e-mails to and from C. Coleman and B. Young re same (0.2); review and revise trading order motion (1.0); review and revise motion for order shortening time (0.8); telephone conference with J. Nexon re hearing date (0)	
05/16/01 Associate	MICHAEL I. SOROCHINSKY	2.6	420	1,092	Review and revise trading order (0.3); finalize trading order pleadings for filing (1.0).	
05/17/01 Associate	MICHAEL I. SOROCHINSKY	1.3	420	546	E-mails to and from S. Johnson re trading motion (0.1); Telephone conferences w/ Judge Montali's law clerk re same (0.2); Review order shortening time (0.1).	
05/21/01 Associate	MICHAEL I. SOROCHINSKY	0.4	420	168	Review and revise trading order (5); telephone calls with S. Moyed regarding same (3); telephone calls and e-mails to and from committee members regarding same (1.0).	
05/29/01 Associate	MICHAEL I. SOROCHINSKY	1.8	420	756	Review and revise trading order (5); telephone calls with S. Moyed regarding same (5); review opposition of San Francisco (1.0); message to counsel for San Francisco regarding same (1.1); telephone calls with committee members regarding opposition (5).	
05/30/01 Associate	MICHAEL I. SOROCHINSKY	2.6	420	1,092	Telephone conversation with M. Sorochinsky regarding Trading Order Motion (3); Review M. Sorochinsky draft supplemental declaration for Committee members (0.4); Revision and drafting regarding same (0.4); Telephone conversation with M. Sorochinsky regard	
05/31/01 Partner	ROBERT JAY MOORE	2.1	595	1,250	Review SF's opposition to trading order (1.0); telephone calls with B. Young regarding same (3); telephone calls with E. Selki regarding trading motion (5); telephone calls with R. Lynch regarding same (2); messages from and to K. Coleman regarding same (1)	
05/31/01 Associate	MICHAEL I. SOROCHINSKY	5.4	420	2,268	Review and analysis of United States Trustee Objection to Committee Motion for Trading Order (0.5); City and County of San Francisco Objection to Committee Motion, in preparation for hearing (4); Telephone conversation with M. Sorochinsky regarding hearing	
06/01/01 Partner	ROBERT JAY MOORE	3.7	595	2,202	Prepare for hearing regarding trading order (1.0); participate in telephonic hearing regarding trading order (5); draft separate securities trading order (1.2); draft separate commodities trading order (7); e-mail to committee members regarding same (1)	
06/01/01 Associate	MICHAEL I. SOROCHINSKY	5.5	420	2,310	Prepare for and attend meeting with representatives of Enron, Dynegy, Bank of America, Morgan Guaranty, Merrill Lynch, Palo Alto at the offices of PricewaterhouseCoopers in San Francisco regarding Securities and Commodities Trading Orders, supporting Decl	
06/04/01 Partner	ROBERT JAY MOORE	5.3	595	3,154	Review and revise Trading Order (1.5); attend meeting re Trading Order (1.0); messages from and to M. Diamond re protective order for Trading Order declarations (0.1); Telephone conference with G. Coy re same (0.1)	
06/04/01 Associate	MICHAEL I. SOROCHINSKY	2.7	420	1,134	Telephone conference with A. Marks regarding Trading Order (1); Review City of San Francisco mark-up of Trading Order (2); Review and revise P. Warden draft of proposed D. Faltemaier Trading Order Declaration (Dynegy) (5); Review California Cogenerati	
06/05/01 Partner	ROBERT JAY MOORE	5.8	595	3,451		

EXHIBIT 5

06/05/01	Associate	MICHAEL I. SOROCHINSKY	7.4	420	3,108	Participate in conference call re Trading Orders (1.2); Review and revise Trading Orders (1.5); E-mails to and from Committee members re same (0.5); Review general incoming pleadings and calendar (2.5); Review San Francisco's proposed revisions to Trading
06/06/01	Partner	ROBERT JAY MOORE	1.8	595	1,071	Review numerous incoming e-mail correspondence from Committee members regarding comment on form of proposed Securities and Commodities Trading Orders and Committee Member Declarations (1.0); Telephone calls with M. Sorochinsky and Committee members regard
06/06/01	Associate	MICHAEL I. SOROCHINSKY	2.1	420	882	E-mails to and from Committee members re Trading Orders (0.5); Review and revise Trading Orders (0.7); Review and revise draft declarations re same (0.5); Telephone conferences with S. Moyed re same (0.2); E-mails to and from J. Sakai re same (0.1); E-mail
06/07/01	Associate	MICHAEL I. SOROCHINSKY	5.5	420	2,310	Review and revise draft declarations re Trading Order (1.5); Review additional suggested changes to Trading Order (0.5); Review and revise Trading Order (0.7); E-mails to and from S. Johnson re same (0.1); Message to S. Johnson re same
06/08/01	Partner	ROBERT JAY MOORE	2	595	1,190	(0.1); E-mails from Review R. Lynch of Morgan Guaranty memorandum (0.1); M. Sorochinsky memorandum regarding San Francisco issues with proposed Commodities and Securities Trading Order (0.1); Review Declaration of M. Tribolet regarding Enron trading activities (2); Telephone
06/08/01	Associate	MICHAEL I. SOROCHINSKY	4.3	420	1,806	Telephone conference with C. Baker re revisions to trading order (0.5); e-mail to Committee members re same (0.2); review e-mails from Committee members re same (0.2); review revised draft of Trading Order (0.9); edit changes to Trading Order (0.5); telep
06/10/01	Associate	MICHAEL I. SOROCHINSKY	1	420	420	Review and revise Trading Order (1.0); Telephone conversation with M. Sorochinsky regarding United States Trustee position on revised Trading Order (2); Telephone conversation with B. Leaverton and others regarding Mid-Set view regarding QF order, and discussion
06/11/01	Partner	ROBERT JAY MOORE	7.7	595	4,582	Telephone conversation with B. Leaverton draft o regarding B. Leaverton draft o
06/11/01	Associate	MICHAEL I. SOROCHINSKY	5.4	420	2,268	Review and revise Securities Trading Order (1.0); Review and revise Commodities Trading Order (1.0); conferences with R. Moore re same (0.3); prepare for hearing on Trading Orders (1.0); review objections re same (1.5); telephone conferences with B. Young
06/12/01	Partner	ROBERT JAY MOORE	0.4	595	238	Meetings with P. Atozon regarding Trading Orders, Wasserstein meeting, QF orders, coverage of hearings, plan issues. Prepare for hearing re Trading Orders (3.5); attend hearing re Trading Orders (2.4); conferences with committee members re same (1.0); review and revise Securities Trading Order (0.2).
06/12/01	Associate	MICHAEL I. SOROCHINSKY	7.1	420	2,982	Review B. Klekhter correspondence regarding Securities Order (1); Review W. Lafferty correspondence and revised proposed QF order (2); Telephone conference with F. Neufeld regarding same (1); Telephone conversations (2) with M. Diamond regarding QF he
06/13/01	Partner	ROBERT JAY MOORE	2.1	595	1,250	Review and revise Securities Trading Order (0.5); e-mail to Committee Members re same (0.1); e-mail to Sulmeyer et al. Re same (0.1); conferences with R. Moore re same (0.3); e-mails from and to Committee Members re supplemental declarations (0.3); teleph
06/13/01	Associate	MICHAEL I. SOROCHINSKY	1.5	420	630	Review J. Lopes correspondence regarding Indenture Trustee fees (2); Review correspondence and revisions to proposed Securities Trading Order (4); Telephone conversation with F. Neufeld regarding QF order (1); Telephone conversation with K. Coleman reg
06/14/01	Partner	ROBERT JAY MOORE	3.9	595	2,321	Finalize Securities Trading Order (0.3); letter to Judge Montali re same (0.1); coordinate lodging of Order (0.3); e-mails to and from C. Baker re same (0.1); calls to L. Sulmeyer, C. Baker and the UST re continuance for filing declarations (0.3); Telephone conversation with W. Lafferty regarding comment regarding proposed Mid-Set and Oldale orders (2); Telephone conversation with K. Coleman regarding Merrill Supplemental Commodities Trading Declaration (2); Telephone conversation with C. Baker
06/15/01	Associate	MICHAEL I. SOROCHINSKY	3.1	420	1,302	E-mails to and from K. Coleman re filing of supplemental declaration on trading order (0.2); telephone conference with C. Baker re continuance for Merrill (0.3); message from UST re same (0.1); review Enron supplemental declaration and exhibits (1.0); tel
06/18/01	Partner	ROBERT JAY MOORE	0.1	595	60	Telephone conference with P. Warden regarding filing of Supplemental Declarations regarding Commodities Order (1); Review memo from court clerk re Trading Order (0.1); telephone conference with Ct. Clerk re same (0.1); refile Trading Order (0.3).
06/21/01	Associate	MICHAEL I. SOROCHINSKY	0.5	420	210	
		Sub-total	98.6		46,817	

06/25/01	Associate	MICHAEL I. SOROCHINSKY	0.8	420	336	Review fax from C. Baker re trading order discovery (0.2); review e-mail from W. Klekhofer re same (0.1); review supplemental declarations re Commodities Trading Order (0.5).
06/26/01	Partner	ROBERT JAY MOORE	0.7	595	417	Telephone conversation with B. Klekhofer regarding C. Baker letter on Commodities Trading Order discovery (2); Review and analysis of City and County of San Francisco Trading Order discovery request (1); Prepare memorandum to Committee regarding same (4).
06/26/01	Summer Assn	DERRICK TALERICO	0.3	160	48	Conference with M. Sorochinsky re commodities trading order.
06/26/01	Associate	MICHAEL I. SOROCHINSKY	1.6	420	672	Telephone conference with W. Klekhofer re responses to informal discovery requests re trading order (0.2); review letter from C. Baker re same (0.4); review San Francisco's opposition to Trading Motion (1.0).
06/27/01	Partner	ROBERT JAY MOORE	4.1	595	2,440	Review C. Baker letter detailing ten areas of informal discovery requested by City and County of San Francisco regarding Commodities Trading Order, and notes regarding response (3); Conference call among counsel to Merrill Lynch, Enton, Dynegy, Bank of A.
06/27/01	Associate	MICHAEL I. SOROCHINSKY	3	420	1,260	Review discovery requests re commodities trading order (0.3); conference call with committee members and R. Moore re commodities trading order (0.7); review and revise letter from R. Moore to C. Baker re discovery on commodities trading order (0.3); revise (4).
06/28/01	Summer Assn	DERRICK TALERICO	2.6	160	416	Conference with M. Sorochinsky re commodities trading order (4); research securities trading orders (2.2); Telephone conference with Committee Members and R. Moore re Trading Order discovery (0.5); review letters from Dynegy (0.2), Enton (0.2), B of A (0.2), Morgan (0.2), and Merrill (0.2) re informal discovery responses; telephone conferences with B. Klekhofer.
06/28/01	Associate	MICHAEL I. SOROCHINSKY	3.4	420	1,428	Researching policy re entry of securities trading orders in relation to a commodities trading order (2.1); conference with M. Sorochinsky re same (4).
06/29/01	Summer Assn	DERRICK TALERICO	2.5	160	400	Researching policy re same (4).
06/29/01	Associate	MICHAEL I. SOROCHINSKY	0.2	420	84	Conference with D. Talerico re response to trading order objections (0.2).
06/30/01	Summer Assn	DERRICK TALERICO	1.6	160	256	Researching and reviewing securities trading orders in prior Ch. 11 cases.
07/02/01	Summer Assn	DERRICK TALERICO	7.2	160	1,152	Researching policy re trading orders (3.6); conference with M. Sorochinsky re brief in support of commodities trading order (4); draft policy section for brief (3.2).
07/02/01	Associate	MICHAEL I. SOROCHINSKY	4.5	420	1,890	Review SF's opposition to entry of Commodities Trading Order (1.0); review UST's opposition to entry of Commodities Trading Order (0.8); research re same (0.5); begin drafting reply brief re commodities trading order (1.9).
07/03/01	Partner	ROBERT JAY MOORE	4.6	595	2,737	Review and analysis of City and County of San Francisco Memorandum of Points and Authorities in Support of Opposition to Commodities Trading Order (0.4); United States Trustee's Opposition to Committee Motion (5); Telephone conversation with M. Sorochinsky.
07/03/01	Summer Assn	DERRICK TALERICO	7.7	160	1,232	Draft policy section for brief in support of commodities trading order (2.4); conference with M. Sorochinsky re same (4); conference with P. Greengross re access to Webpacer documents (5); review opposition of US Trustee and City of San Francisco (1.3).
07/03/01	Associate	MICHAEL I. SOROCHINSKY	5	420	2,100	Draft reply brief re Commodities Trading Order (3.7); telephone conference with committee members and R. Moore re Trading Order (1.0); review and revise/blackline commodities trading order (0.3).
07/05/01	Associate	MICHAEL I. SOROCHINSKY	9.1	420	3,822	Draft reply brief re Commodities Trading Order (3.9); review and revise same (3.5); review research re same (1.0); telephone conference with W. Klekhofer re same (0.2); conferences with D. Talerico re same (0.5).
07/05/01	Summer Assn	DERRICK TALERICO	10.8	160	1,728	Drafting policy section for brief in support of commodities trading order (2.2); conference with M. Sorochinsky re constitution of Commodities Trading Order (0.1); revise T. Patterson correspondence re Bank of America Declaration (5); drafting re Committee Response to San Fra.
07/06/01	Partner	ROBERT JAY MOORE	2.8	595	1,666	Committee Response to San Fra.
07/06/01	Partner	ROBERT JAY MOORE	0.1	595	60	Telephone conversation with M. Cohen regarding Commodities Trading Order.
07/06/01	Summer Assn	DERRICK TALERICO	9.5	160	1,520	Researching case law in briefs by US Trustee and City of San Francisco, (3.2); conference with M. Sorochinsky re same (3); drafting rebuttal section re same (1.1); researching section re case or controversy (8); research collateral estoppel and issue pr.
07/06/01	Associate	MICHAEL I. SOROCHINSKY	7.2	420	3,024	Review and revise reply brief re commodities trading order (3.2); review research re same (2.5); conferences with R. Moore re same (0.2); conferences with D. Talerico re same (0.3).
07/08/01	Partner	ROBERT JAY MOORE	1.2	595	714	Drafting and revisions re Committee Reply to San Francisco and United States Trustee objections to Commodities Order motion (0.3); prepare correspondence to Committee re same (0.3); review and reply to T. Patterson correspondence (0.3); prepare correspond
07/09/01	Partner	ROBERT JAY MOORE	4.4	595	2,618	Telephone conversation with J. Lopes regarding Calpine stipulation, Rogers & Assoc. Retention hearing, Trading Order hearing, Plan meeting, Wasserstein hearing (3); Conference with P. Aronzon regarding all of above, planning for week (3); Prepare extens

07/09/01	Partner	ROBERT JAY MOORE	2.5	595	1,488	Telephone conversation with B. Young regarding Enron comments on Committee Reply regarding Commodities Trading Order Oppositions (4); Drafting and revision regarding same (3); Review B. Klekhofer, P. Warden, R. Lynch, M. Sorochinsky correspondence re: same
07/10/01	Summer Assn	DERRICK TALERICO	3.2	160	512	Summarize case law cited in oppositions Committee's reply re Commodities Order. Review Morgan's binder re commodities order brief (0.1); review research re res judicata issues (0.8); conferences with D. Talento re same (0.3); telephone conference with R. Moore re same (0.2).
07/10/01	Associate	MICHAEL I. SOROCHINSKY	1.5	420	630	Meeting with M. Sorochinsky regarding preparation for Commodities Trading Order hearing, and all pleadings (7); Review with M. Sorochinsky Declaration and review records (3).
07/11/01	Partner	ROBERT JAY MOORE	1	595	595	Finish summarizing case law cited in opposition to Committee's Reply re Commodities Order (2.6); assemble and review binder of same (1.4); conference with M. Sorochinsky re same (2); conference with R. Moore re same (1); Review supplemental declaration of Irving Sumeray (0.2); conferences with R. Moore re same (0.2); prepare for hearing on Commodities Trading Motion (1.0); review UST's RJN re same (0.3); review research re reply brief re commodities trading order (0.5).
07/11/01	Associate	MICHAEL I. SOROCHINSKY	2.4	420	1,008	Conference with M. Sorochinsky re drafting a statement in Errata re Reply to Commodities Order (0.2); continued research on issue preclusion (2.6).
07/12/01	Summer Assn	DERRICK TALERICO	2.8	160	448	Telephone conversation with B. Young and L. Mellencamp regarding modification of proposed Commodities Trading Order (3); Prepare for and attend hearing before Judge Montali regarding Committee's Motion for Order Permitting Trading in Hearing re Commodities Trading Order (1.2).
07/13/01	Partner	ROBERT JAY MOORE	2.8	595	1,666	Telephone conversation with L. Mellencamp regarding report on Commodities Trading Order and Rogers & Assoc. retention hearing, and strategy (4); Telephone conversations (2) with T. Patterson regarding same (3); Telephone conversation with P. Warden re: same (0.2).
07/13/01	Associate	MICHAEL I. SOROCHINSKY	1.2	420	504	Hearing re Commodities Trading Order (1.2).
07/16/01	Partner	ROBERT JAY MOORE	0.9	595	536	Telephone conversations with F. Neufeld (0.2); Telephone conversations with M. Sorochinsky regarding report on Commodities Trading Order decision (0.2).
07/26/01	Partner	ROBERT JAY MOORE	0.4	595	238	Telephone conversation with B. Krakauer regarding Commodities Trading Order decision (0.1); Telephone conversation with T. Patterson regarding same (0.1); Telephone conversation with E. Baird regarding same (1); Telephone conversation with M. Sorochinsky (0.2).
07/26/01	Partner	ROBERT JAY MOORE	1.4	595	833	Review Court's opinion re Commodities Trading Order (0.5); telephone conference with R. Moore re same (0.2); correspondence to T. Lumsden re same (0.1); correspondence to Committee re same (0.2).
07/26/01	Associate	MICHAEL I. SOROCHINSKY	1	420	420	Research fiduciary duty to estate issues regarding Judge Montali memo decision on commodities trading (1.9) and 1,131 committee conference call regarding same (7)
07/27/01	Associate	FRED NEUFELD	2.6	435	1,190	Conference with Official Creditors Committee members regarding Trading Order (4.17)
07/27/01	Partner	PAUL S. ARONZON	0.7	595	417	Review and analysis of Judge Montali's Memorandum Decision regarding Motion for Approval of Ethical Wall Procedures for Commodities Trading and Publications (6); Telephone conversation with M. Diamond, and prepare correspondence to same, regarding Commit
07/27/01	Partner	ROBERT JAY MOORE	1.3	595	774	Work on memo to Committee regarding fiduciary duty issues
07/30/01	Associate	FRED NEUFELD	1.9	435	827	Conference with P. Aronzon regarding discussions with Bank of America on Committee membership status (1); Telephone conversation with E. Baird regarding Bank of America position on Committee membership in view of Commodities Trading Order decision, re: same
07/30/01	Partner	ROBERT JAY MOORE	0.6	595	357	Review memo re Commodities Trading Order (3); draft memo re background facts on case (0.5).
07/30/01	Associate	MICHAEL I. SOROCHINSKY	0.8	420	336	Conference call among representatives, internal and external counsel for Bank of America, Enron, Morgan, Dynegy and Merrill regarding Judge Montali's ruling on Commodities Trading Order, Committee and member options, strategy, Bylaws, July 31, 2001 Commit
07/27/01	Partner	ROBERT JAY MOORE	1.5	595	893	Prepare for conference call with committee members re commodities trading order (0.5); participate in conference call with committee members re commodities trading order (1.0).
07/27/01	Associate	MICHAEL I. SOROCHINSKY	1.5	420	630	Review materials re 7/31 committee call
07/30/01	Associate	MICHAEL I. SOROCHINSKY	0.5	420	210	Participate in Committee telephone call re plan issues.
07/31/01	Associate	MICHAEL I. SOROCHINSKY	1.3	420	546	Conference call with Committee re: Plan.
07/31/01	Partner	EDWIN F. FEO	1.3	595	774	Prepare for and attend full Committee meeting by telephone conference call regarding Commodities Trading Order, SacramentolMOU legislation, DWR update, Plan Working Group update.
07/31/01	Partner	ROBERT JAY MOORE	1.3	595	774	Sub-total
			151.2		57,447	

THOMAS R. KRELLER	4/17/01	1.8	420	756	PG&E-CASE ADMINISTRATION	Confer with R. Moore, P. Aronzon regarding case staffing issues, committee organizational issues, case administration (1.0); assess and establish office protocol for case management issues and pleadings review and analysis (8).
THOMAS R. KRELLER	4/18/01	0.5	420	210	PG&E-CASE ADMINISTRATION	Confer with F. Neufeld regarding miscellaneous pleading review.
THOMAS R. KRELLER	4/19/01	2.6	420	1092	PG&E-CASE ADMINISTRATION	Attend working group meeting regarding miscellaneous pleadings, analysis of debtor proposals, scheduling and staffing issues regarding same (1.0); attention to case administration and file control (1.3); review and analyze correspondence from debtor regarding same (1.0);
THOMAS R. KRELLER	4/20/01	3.5	420	1470	PG&E-CASE ADMINISTRATION	Review and assign miscellaneous pleadings for analysis (1.0); confer with R. Moore regarding miscellaneous motions and case administration (3); confer with R. Moore regarding cash collateral and related pleadings (3); confer with F. Neufeld regarding review (3);
THOMAS R. KRELLER	4/21/01	2.5	420	1050	PG&E-CASE ADMINISTRATION	Attention to case administration (0.2); review and analyze incoming pleadings and correspondence and distribute same (0.5); confer with R. Moore regarding case administration status and procedures for committee distribution of documents and correspondence (0.5);
THOMAS R. KRELLER	4/23/01	1.5	420	630	PG&E-CASE ADMINISTRATION	recommendation
THOMAS R. KRELLER	4/24/01	0.5	420	210	PG&E-CASE ADMINISTRATION	Confer with F. Neufeld, M. Sorochinsky regarding case status and review and analysis of incoming pleadings.
THOMAS R. KRELLER	4/25/01	1.2	420	504	PG&E-CASE ADMINISTRATION	Attention to case administration and initial pleading review (6); review and summarize proposed stipulation regarding creditor safef rights (6)
THOMAS R. KRELLER	4/26/01	0.6	420	252	PG&E-CASE ADMINISTRATION	Confer with R. Moore regarding pleading status and committee communications (2); attention to incoming case correspondence and pleadings (4);
THOMAS R. KRELLER	4/27/01	0.3	420	128	PG&E-CASE ADMINISTRATION	Confer with P. Neagey regarding case administration issues.
THOMAS R. KRELLER	4/30/01	2.5	420	1050	PG&E-CASE ADMINISTRATION	Confer with F. Neufeld, R. Moore, P. Aronzon regarding case administration and pleading review issues (5); review and analyze miscellaneous pleadings and case correspondence (5); review and analyze pending motions, attention to calendar and file control (7350)
THOMAS R. KRELLER	5/1/01	1.8	420	756	PG&E-CASE ADMINISTRATION	Attention to case administration and pleading review (0.3); prepare correspondence to working group regarding same (1.5);
THOMAS R. KRELLER	5/2/01	0.3	420	128	PG&E-CASE ADMINISTRATION	Telephone call with R. Moore regarding case administration and pleading review and analysis.
THOMAS R. KRELLER	5/3/01	0.5	420	210	PG&E-CASE ADMINISTRATION	Confer with F. Neufeld regarding open issues and case administration.
THOMAS R. KRELLER	5/4/01	0.5	420	210	PG&E-CASE ADMINISTRATION	Confer with F. Neufeld regarding open issues and tasks to complete regarding case administration and pleading review.
THOMAS R. KRELLER	5/6/01	5	420	2100	PG&E-CASE ADMINISTRATION	Review, analyze and summarize pleadings (4.0); attention to case administration and work allocation (0.4); attention to file control and calendaring issues (0.4); prepare correspondence to working group regarding same (0.2);
THOMAS R. KRELLER	5/7/01	1.6	420	672	PG&E-CASE ADMINISTRATION	Prepare documents for hearing regarding employment applications (5); prepare and review documents for hearing regarding cash collateral matters (5); review and analyze documents regarding hearing on OI motions (6);
THOMAS R. KRELLER	5/8/01	0.5	420	210	PG&E-CASE ADMINISTRATION	Attention to case administration and bankruptcy case pleading intake.
THOMAS R. KRELLER	5/9/01	2.3	420	966	PG&E-CASE ADMINISTRATION	Review, analyze, summarize and distribute incoming pleadings and case correspondence (2.0); telephone calls with R. Moore, confer with F. Neufeld, A. Marks regarding same (0.3);
THOMAS R. KRELLER	5/10/01	0.6	420	252	PG&E-CASE ADMINISTRATION	attention to file control issues.
THOMAS R. KRELLER	5/14/01	1.8	420	756	PG&E-CASE ADMINISTRATION	Review, analyze and distribute incoming pleadings (1.5); correspondence to working group regarding same (0.3);
THOMAS R. KRELLER	5/15/01	1.9	420	798	PG&E-CASE ADMINISTRATION	Miscellaneous case correspondence and file control (0.5); review and analyze incoming pleadings (1.4);
THOMAS R. KRELLER	5/16/01	3.8	420	1596	PG&E-CASE ADMINISTRATION	Confer with P. Aronzon regarding case status, open issues and staffing issues (2); confer with M. Sorochinsky regarding case administration and pleading review and analysis issues (4); meeting with Millbank working group regarding open issues and tasks to (8778)
THOMAS R. KRELLER	5/17/01	0.3	420	126	PG&E-CASE ADMINISTRATION	Attention to pleading review and distribution.
THOMAS R. KRELLER	6/7/01	1.7	420	714	PG&E-CASE ADMINISTRATION	Review case correspondence and incoming pleadings (1.5); attention to file control, calendar, case status issues, confer with P. Aronzon, M. Sorochinsky regarding same (2);
THOMAS R. KRELLER	6/8/01	1.8	420	756	PG&E-CASE ADMINISTRATION	Attention to case administration, pleadings review and distribution, file control and calendar issues.
THOMAS R. KRELLER	6/11/01	1.2	420	504	PG&E-CASE ADMINISTRATION	Review and analyze incoming pleadings and correspondence (0.9); Attention to open issues, tasks to complete that distribution of same (0.3);
THOMAS R. KRELLER	6/12/01	2.5	420	1050	PG&E-CASE ADMINISTRATION	Review and analyze incoming pleadings and attention to distribution of same (2.0); Confer with working group re staffing and calendaring issues (5);
THOMAS R. KRELLER	6/14/01	0.8	420	336	PG&E-CASE ADMINISTRATION	Attention to incoming pleadings, case administration, calendar issues, correspondence to working group re same
THOMAS R. KRELLER	6/18/01	1.5	420	630	PG&E-CASE ADMINISTRATION	Attention to incoming pleadings and case correspondence (1.3); correspondence with working group regarding same (2);

EXHIBIT 2

THOMAS R. KRELLER	6/21/01	2	420	840	PG&E-CASE ADMINISTRATION, Attention to incoming pleadings and correspondence (1.8); correspondence with working group regarding same (2); Review and analyze incoming pleadings and correspondence to working group regarding same (1.1); attention to calendar
THOMAS R. KRELLER	6/22/01	1.3	420	548	PG&E-CASE ADMINISTRATION, Issues (2)
THOMAS R. KRELLER	6/25/01	0.8	420	398	PG&E-CASE ADMINISTRATION, administration open issues and tasks to complete (2); case
THOMAS R. KRELLER	6/27/01	1.5	420	630	PG&E-CASE ADMINISTRATION, Attention to incoming pleadings and case correspondence (1.3); correspondence to working group regarding same (2);
		15.1		8342	
THOMAS R. KRELLER	7/20/01	1.3	420	548	PG&E-CASE ADMINISTRATION, Review and analyze incoming bankruptcy court pleadings (1.0) and correspondence with working group regarding same (0.3); Attention to incoming pleadings and miscellaneous case correspondence (0.6); correspondence with working group regarding
THOMAS R. KRELLER	7/30/01	0.7	420	294	PG&E-CASE ADMINISTRATION, same (0.1).
THOMAS R. KRELLER	7/30/01	0.8	420	336	PG&E-CASE ADMINISTRATION, Attention to incoming pleadings and distributions to working group regarding same.
THOMAS R. KRELLER	7/10/01	1	420	420	PG&E-CASE ADMINISTRATION, Review and analyze incoming pleadings and attention to distribution to working group regarding same.
THOMAS R. KRELLER	7/16/01	0.7	420	294	PG&E-CASE ADMINISTRATION, Attention to incoming pleadings and case correspondence (0.4); correspondence to working group regarding same (0.3).
THOMAS R. KRELLER	7/18/01	0.5	420	210	PG&E-CASE ADMINISTRATION, Review and analyze incoming pleadings and case correspondence and correspondence to working group regarding same.
THOMAS R. KRELLER	7/19/01	0.4	420	168	PG&E-CASE ADMINISTRATION, regarding same (0.1)
					Review and analyze incoming pleadings and case correspondence (0.4); attention to correspondence to working group
THOMAS R. KRELLER	7/20/01	0.7	420	294	PG&E-CASE ADMINISTRATION, regarding same (0.3).
THOMAS R. KRELLER	7/23/01	0.5	420	210	PG&E-CASE ADMINISTRATION, Review and analyze incoming pleadings and correspondence to working group regarding same.
THOMAS R. KRELLER	7/24/01	0.7	420	294	PG&E-CASE ADMINISTRATION, Review and analyze incoming pleadings and attention to correspondence to working group regarding same.
THOMAS R. KRELLER	7/25/01	0.8	420	336	PG&E-CASE ADMINISTRATION, Review and analyze incoming pleadings and attention to correspondence to working group regarding same.
THOMAS R. KRELLER	7/26/01	0.4	420	168	PG&E-CASE ADMINISTRATION, Review and analyze incoming pleadings and attention to correspondence to working group regarding same.
					Review and analyze incoming pleadings and attention to correspondence to working group regarding same (0.6); confer with
THOMAS R. KRELLER	7/27/01	1	420	420	PG&E-CASE ADMINISTRATION, working group regarding fee application preparation (0.4).
THOMAS R. KRELLER	7/30/01	0.5	420	210	PG&E-FEE/EMPLOYMENT APPL Correspondence and telephone calls with working group regarding fee application preparation.
THOMAS R. KRELLER	7/31/01	1	420	420	PG&E-CASE ADMINISTRATION, Review and analyze incoming pleadings and attention to correspondence to working group regarding same.
		11		4620	
		64.5		27090	

EXPENSE ITEMS	06/20/01	12,833.16	175740	TELEPHONE - VENDOR: PACIFIC BELL - CONFERENCE CALL EXPENSES RE PG&E WITH ROBERT MOORE ON 04-23-01, 04-25-01, 04-27-01, 04-30-01 (2), 05-01-01 (2), 05-07-01, 05-15-01 & 05-18-01
EXPENSE ITEMS	07/30/01	6,726.58	175741	TELEPHONE - VENDOR: PACIFIC BELL - CONFERENCE CALL CHARGES THROUGH AT&T FOR APRIL/MAY 2001.
EXPENSE ITEMS	07/31/01	3,700.60	175741	DOCUMENT RETRIEVAL/REPRODUCTION - VENDOR: PUBLIC UTILITIES COMMISSION - TRANSCRIPT CHARGES A.00-11-038; HEARINGS 46773.76, 77.79, 80, 82
EXPENSE ITEMS	05/21/01	3,275.03	175739	MISCELLANEOUS - VENDOR: BOISE CASCADE OFFICE PRODUCTS - PRINTER EXPENSE (HP9100C) FOR PG&E BRUP MATTER ORDERED BY TOM HURD ON 04-20-01
EXPENSE ITEMS	05/22/01	3,272.80	175739	
EXPENSE ITEMS	07/31/01	3,109.30	175744	TRAVEL (H) - VENDOR: KEVIN MCSPADDEN - TRAVEL TO SAN FRANCISCO TO ATTEND HEARINGS AT CPUC (JULY 22-27, 2001) - EXPENSES FOR: AIRFARE (EQUIVALENT), LODGING, MEALS, AND TAXI FARES
EXPENSE ITEMS	06/11/01	2,293.61	175740	DOCUMENT RETRIEVAL/REPRODUCTION - VENDOR: APPLIED SOLUTIONS, INC - DOCUMENT REPRODUCTION EXPENSE REGARDING PG&E REQUESTED BY KEVIN MCSPADDEN ON 05-07-01
EXPENSE ITEMS	05/22/01	2,290.00	175739	
EXPENSE ITEMS	07/31/01	2,190.09	175741	DOCUMENT RETRIEVAL/REPRODUCTION - VENDOR: PUBLIC UTILITIES COMMISSION - TRANSCRIPT CHARGES A.00-11-038; HEARING 46728.32, 35, 43, 44, 45, 47, 48
EXPENSE ITEMS	05/16/01	1,701.40	175739	TELEPHONE - VENDOR: PACIFIC BELL - CONFERENCE CALL EXPENSES RE PG&E WITH EDWIN FEO ON 05-21-01 & 05-24-01
EXPENSE ITEMS	06/20/01	1,671.36	175740	
EXPENSE ITEMS	04/21/01	1,606.11	175620	WESTLAW
EXPENSE ITEMS	06/21/01	1,567.88	175740	TRAVEL (H) - VENDOR: ROBERT J. MOORE - TRAVEL EXPENSES FOR R. MOORE TO ATTEND HEARINGS RE CASH COLLATERAL STIPULATIONS AND MID-SET LIFT STAY MOTION IN SAN FRANCISCO, CA FROM 06-08-01 TO 06-10-01, INCLUDING R/T AIRFARE, HOTEL ACCOMMODATIONS, MEALS AND TAXI
EXPENSE ITEMS	05/22/01	1,521.08	175739	FEES - VENDOR: SHERMAN ALEXANDER & ASSOCIATES - FEE ADVANCE & CHECK CHARGE EXPENSES FOR THE MESSENGER SENT TO MTHM L.A. FROM THE L.A. SUPERIOR COURT IN L.A., CA ON 04-25-01
EXPENSE ITEMS	07/31/01	1,471.10	175741	TRAVEL (H) - VENDOR: EDWIN FEO - TRAVEL EXPENSES FOR E. FEO TO ATTEND MEETING IN SAN FRANCISCO FROM 7/18/01 TO 7/19/01 INCLUDING R/T AIRFARE, HOTEL AND TAXIS.
EXPENSE ITEMS	07/31/01	1,400.60	175741	TRAVEL (H) - VENDOR: ROBERT J. MOORE - TRAVEL EXPENSES FOR R. MOORE TO ATTEND A COMMITTEE MEETING IN SAN FRANCISCO, CA FROM 04-24-01 TO 04-25-01, INCLUDING R/T AIRFARE, A SERVICE CHARGE, HOTEL ACCOMMODATIONS, TAXI FARES AND AN ENTERTAINMENT DINNER EXPENSE
EXPENSE ITEMS	05/10/01	1,327.72	175739	TRAVEL (H) - VENDOR: PAUL ARONZON - TRAVEL EXPENSES FOR P. ARONZON TO ATTEND PLAN WORKING GROUP MEETINGS IN SAN FRANCISCO FROM 7/25/01 TO 7/28/01 INCLUDING AIRFARE, HOTEL, MEALS AND PARKING.
EXPENSE ITEMS	07/31/01	1,283.87	175741	TRAVEL (H) - VENDOR: GABRIEL K. COY - TRAVEL EXPENSES FOR G. COY TO ATTEND THE DEPOSITIONS OF KELLI LUCAS, JAMES ROSS & WILLIAM COLLIERE AND TO PARTICIPATE IN A SETTLEMENT CONFERENCE/EVIDENTIARY HEARING IN SAN FRANCISCO, CA FROM 05-22-01 TO 05-25-01, INCL
EXPENSE ITEMS	07/06/01	1,238.62	175741	WESTLAW
EXPENSE ITEMS	06/13/01	1,208.94	175740	TRAVEL (H) - VENDOR: SHERMAN ALEXANDER & ASSOCIATES - FEE ADVANCE & CHECK CHARGE EXPENSES FOR THE MESSENGER SENT TO MTHM L.A. FROM THE SAN FRANCISCO SUPERIOR COURT IN SAN FRANCISCO, CA ON 04-25-01
EXPENSE ITEMS	06/15/01	1,147.38	175740	FEES - VENDOR: NATIONAL NARROWCAST NETWORK - FEE FOR COVERAGE OF CONGRESSIONAL HEARINGS DURING MAY 2001
EXPENSE ITEMS	05/22/01	1,107.70	175739	FEES - VENDOR: SHERMAN ALEXANDER & ASSOCIATES - FEE ADVANCE & CHECK CHARGE EXPENSES FOR THE MESSENGER SENT TO MTHM L.A. FROM THE SAN FRANCISCO SUPERIOR COURT IN SAN FRANCISCO, CA ON 04-25-01
EXPENSE ITEMS	05/22/01	1,096.70	175739	FEES - VENDOR: SHERMAN ALEXANDER & ASSOCIATES - FEE ADVANCE & CHECK CHARGE EXPENSES FOR THE MESSENGER SENT TO MTHM L.A. FROM THE SAN FRANCISCO SUPERIOR COURT IN SAN FRANCISCO, CA ON 04-25-01
EXPENSE ITEMS	05/23/01	1,023.45	175739	TRAVEL (H) - VENDOR: PAUL ARONZON - TRAVEL EXPENSE FOR P. ARONZON TO ATTEND A CREDITORS COMMITTEE MEETING IN SAN FRANCISCO, CA FROM 05-14-01 TO 05-15-01, INCLUDING HOTEL ACCOMMODATIONS, R/T AIRFARE, TAXI FARES AND LAX PARKING
EXPENSE ITEMS	05/31/01	1,020.88	175739	TRAVEL (H) - VENDOR: ALAN MARKS - TRAVEL EXPENSES FOR A. MARKS TO ATTEND A PG&E CREDITOR COMMITTEE MEETING IN SAN FRANCISCO, CA FROM 05-14-01 TO 05-15-01, INCLUDING R/T AIRFARE, HOTEL ACCOMMODATIONS, TAXI FARES AND MISC. TIPS

EXHIBIT M

EXPENSE ITEMS	06/18/01	1,003.00	175740		COURT SEARCH - VENDOR: CT CORPORATION SYSTEM - UCC SEARCH EXPENSE REGARDING PG&E IN CALIFORNIA REQUESTED BY KYLE OLSON ON 05-22-01
EXPENSE ITEMS	05/03/01	970.01	175739	TR AR	TRAVEL (H) - VENDOR: PAUL ARONZON - TRAVEL EXPENSES FOR P. ARONZON TO ATTEND AN OFFICIAL CREDITORS COMMITTEE MEETING AND A MEETING WITH PROFESSIONALS FROM 04-24-01 TO 04-25-01, INCLUDING RT AIRFARE, HOTEL ACCOMMODATIONS, MEALS, TAXI FARES AND PARKING
EXPENSE ITEMS	06/21/01	962.75	175740	TR MO	TRAVEL (H) - VENDOR: ROBERT J. MOORE - TRAVEL EXPENSES FOR R. MOORE TO ATTEND A HEARING RE DEBTOR'S MOTION TO VACATE APPOINTMENT OF RATEPAYERS COMMITTEE IN SAN FRANCISCO, CA FROM 05-17-01 TO 05-18-01, INCLUDING RT AIRFARE, HOTEL ACCOMMODATIONS, A MEAL AND
EXPENSE ITEMS	07/31/01	949.57	175741	TR FEO	TRAVEL (H) - VENDOR: EDWIN FEO - TRAVEL EXPENSES FOR E. FEO TO ATTEND MEETING IN SAN FRANCISCO FROM 7/29/01 TO 7/29/01 INCLUDING RT AIRFARE, HOTEL, TAXIS AND AIRPORT PARKING.
EXPENSE ITEMS	07/20/01	904.46	175741	TR AR	TRAVEL (H) - VENDOR: PAUL ARONZON - TRAVEL EXPENSES FOR P. ARONZON TO ATTEND PLAN WORKING GROUP MEETING IN SAN FRANCISCO FROM 7/18/01 TO 7/19/01 INCLUDING AIRFARE, HOTEL, MEALS, TAXIS AND AIRPORT PARKING.
EXPENSE ITEMS	07/20/01	899.75	175741		LEXIS
EXPENSE ITEMS	05/16/01	899.20	175739		TRAVEL (H) - VENDOR: EDWIN FEO - TRAVEL EXPENSES FOR E. FEO TO ATTEND MEETINGS IN SAN FRANCISCO, CA FROM 05-14-01 TO 05-15-01, INCLUDING RT AIRFARE, HOTEL ACCOMMODATIONS, TAXI FARES AND LAX PARKING
EXPENSE ITEMS	05/24/01	898.92	175739	TR FEO	TRAVEL (H) - VENDOR: EDWIN FEO - TRAVEL EXPENSES FOR E. FEO TO ATTEND MEETINGS IN SAN FRANCISCO, CA FROM 05-14-01 TO 05-15-01, INCLUDING RT AIRFARE, HOTEL ACCOMMODATIONS, TAXI FARES AND LAX PARKING
EXPENSE ITEMS	07/09/01	897.83	175741		TRAVEL (H) - VENDOR: ROBERT J. MOORE - TRAVEL EXPENSES FOR R. MOORE TO ATTEND A MEETING WITH DEBTOR'S COUNSEL AND A MEETING OF THE CREDITORS' COMMITTEE IN SAN FRANCISCO, CA FROM 05-14-01 TO 05-15-01, INCLUDING RT AIRFARE, HOTEL ACCOMMODATIONS, A MEAL, TA
EXPENSE ITEMS	06/21/01	877.98	175740	TR MO	TRAVEL (H) - VENDOR: PAUL ARONZON - TRAVEL EXPENSES FOR P. ARONZON TO ATTEND MEETING WITH CREDITORS' COMMITTEE, PROFESSIONALS & THE COMPANY FROM 06-14-01 TO 06-15-01, INCLUDING RT AIRFARE, HOTEL ACCOMMODATIONS, TAXI FARES AND LAX PARKING
EXPENSE ITEMS	06/30/01	868.75	175740	TR AR	TRAVEL (H) - VENDOR: MICHAEL H. DIAMOND - TRAVEL EXPENSES FOR M. DIAMOND TO ATTEND A PG&E HEARING IN SAN FRANCISCO, CA FROM 06-04-01 TO 06-05-01, INCLUDING RT AIRFARE, HOTEL ACCOMMODATIONS, TAXI FARES AND LAX PARKING
EXPENSE ITEMS	06/28/01	828.82	175740	TR DI	TRAVEL (H) - VENDOR: ROBERT J. MOORE - TRAVEL EXPENSES FOR R. MOORE TO ATTEND MEETINGS OF PLAN WORKING GROUP AND DEBTOR AT OFFICES OF PRICEWATERHOUSECOOPERS AND PG&E ON 7/12/01 AND HEARINGS ON ROGERS & ASSOCIATES, COMMUNITIES TRADING ORDER AND OF SETTLEMENT
EXPENSE ITEMS	07/31/01	818.57	175741	TR MO	TRAVEL (H) - VENDOR: ROBERT J. MOORE - TRAVEL EXPENSES FOR R. MOORE TO ATTEND A BANKRUPTCY CODE HEARING AND PRE-MEETINGS IN SAN FRANCISCO, CA FROM 06-06-01 TO 06-07-01, INCLUDING RT AIRFARE, HOTEL ACCOMMODATIONS, MEALS, TAXI FARES AND LAX PARKING
EXPENSE ITEMS	06/28/01	818.42	175740	TR MO	TRAVEL (H) - VENDOR: ROBERT J. MOORE - TRAVEL EXPENSES FOR R. MOORE TO ATTEND A SETTLEMENT MEETING WITH MID-SET, A HEARING RE MID-SET OFS LIFT STAY MOTION AND A HEARING RE PUGET SOUND LIFT STAY MOTION IN SAN FRANCISCO, CA FROM 05-24-01 TO 05-25-01, INLOUD
EXPENSE ITEMS	06/21/01	814.58	175740	TR MO	TRAVEL (H) - VENDOR: ALLAN MARKS - TRAVEL EXPENSES FOR ALLAN MARKS TO ATTEND A PG&E CREDITOR COMMITTEE MEETING IN SAN FRANCISCO, CA FROM 06-04-01 TO 06-05-01, INCLUDING RT AIRFARE, HOTEL ACCOMMODATIONS, TAXI FARES, MISC. TIP AND LAX PARKING
EXPENSE ITEMS	05/14/01	793.02	175740	TR MA	TRAVEL (H) - VENDOR: EDWIN FEO - TRAVEL EXPENSES FOR E. FEO TO ATTEND MEETINGS IN SAN FRANCISCO, CA FROM 06-04-01 TO 06-05-01, INCLUDING RT AIRFARE, HOTEL ACCOMMODATIONS, TAXI FARES AND LAX PARKING
EXPENSE ITEMS	07/10/01	780.50	175741	TR FEO	TRAVEL (H) - VENDOR: ALLAN MARKS - TRAVEL EXPENSES FOR A. MARKS TO ATTEND A PG&E MEETING IN SAN FRANCISCO, CA ON 05-21-01, INCLUDING RT AIRFARE (388.50 X 2/AIRFARE PURCHASED FOR R. MOORE), MEALS AND LAX PARKING
EXPENSE ITEMS	05/31/01	776.91	175739	TR MA	WESTLAW
EXPENSE ITEMS	06/21/01	774.92	175740		WESTLAW
EXPENSE ITEMS	05/30/01	726.75	175739		LEXIS
EXPENSE ITEMS	06/08/01	652.50	175740		FEES - VENDOR: CVK GROUP, INC. -- SERVICES RE: LINE PLACE HOLDER FOR BARTON BILL, PER E. FEOS REQUEST.
EXPENSE ITEMS	07/05/01	642.20	175741		WESTLAW

EXPENSE ITEMS	06/18/01	616.30	175740		DOCUMENT RETRIEVAL/REPRODUCTION - VENDOR: AIKEN & WELCH, INC. - DOCUMENT REPRODUCTION
EXPENSE ITEMS	07/09/01	615.00	175741		EXPENSE FOR THE DEPOSITION TRANSCRIPT OF KELLY LUCAS TAKEN ON 05-22-01
EXPENSE ITEMS	06/20/01	608.97	175740		WESTLAW TELEPHONE - VENDOR: PACIFIC BELL - CONFERENCE CALL EXPENSES RE PG&E WITH R. MOORE ON 05-01-01 & 05-07-01
EXPENSE ITEMS	05/18/01	607.20	175739		TELEPHONE - VENDOR: PACIFIC BELL - CONFERENCE CALL EXPENSE INCURRED ON 04-18-01 FOR ROBERT MOORE
EXPENSE ITEMS	07/18/01	597.18	175741	TR MO	TRAVEL (H) - VENDOR: ROBERT J. MOORE - TRAVEL EXPENSES FOR R. MOORE TO ATTEND HEARINGS RE MOTIONS TO RECONSIDER RATEPAYER COMMITTEE VACATION, CALPINE LIFT STAY, ETC. IN SAN FRANCISCO FROM 7/04/01 TO 7/05/01 INCLUDING RT AIRFARE, HOTEL, MEALS AND TAXIS.
EXPENSE ITEMS	05/22/01	593.60	175739		
EXPENSE ITEMS	07/31/01	577.20	175741		
EXPENSE ITEMS	04/22/01	565.58	175620		WESTLAW
EXPENSE ITEMS	07/31/01	560.20	175741	TR MO	TRAVEL (H) - VENDOR: ROBERT J. MOORE - TRAVEL EXPENSES FOR R. MOORE TO ATTEND MEETINGS AT OFFICES OF PRICEWATERHOUSECOOPERS AND PG&E RE PLAN NEGOTIATIONS FROM 7/18/01 TO 7/19/01 IN SAN FRANCISCO INCLUDING RT AIRFARE, HOTEL, MEALS, TAXIS AND AIRPORT PARKI
EXPENSE ITEMS	05/16/01	552.28	175739		TELEPHONE - VENDOR: PACIFIC BELL - CONFERENCE CALL EXPENSES INCURRED ON 04-08-01 AND 04-17-01 FOR EDWIN FEO
EXPENSE ITEMS	04/25/01	548.97	175620		WESTLAW
EXPENSE ITEMS	04/21/01	533.32	175620		WESTLAW
EXPENSE ITEMS	04/20/01	530.59	175620		WESTLAW
EXPENSE ITEMS	05/31/01	510.15	175739		DOCUMENT RETRIEVAL/REPRODUCTION - VENDOR: COMBS & GREENLEY - DOCUMENT REPRODUCTION EXPENSE FOR THE DEPOSITION TRANSCRIPTS OF RICHARD PATTERSON & ANDREW VAN HORN INCURRED ON 05-21-01
EXPENSE ITEMS	06/30/01	510.15	175740		DOCUMENT RETRIEVAL/REPRODUCTION - VENDOR: COMBS & GREENLEY INC. - DOCUMENT REPRODUCTION EXPENSE RE PG&E FOR THE DEPOSITION TRANSCRIPTS OF RICHARD PATTERSON AND ANDREW VAN HORN REQUESTED BY UTTAM DHILLON ON 05-21-01
EXPENSE ITEMS	07/17/01	502.50	175741	TR DI	TRAVEL (H) - VENDOR: MICHAEL H. DIAMOND - TRAVEL EXPENSES FOR M. DIAMOND TO ATTEND PG&E HEARING IN SAN FRANCISCO ON 7/02/01 INCLUDING RT AIRFARE, TAXIS AND AIRPORT PARKING.

Pricewaterhouse Multiple Professionals						
Date	# of Profs.	Hours Charged	Fees Charged	Event	Proposed Adjustment	
04/16/2001	6	39.6	22,003	Creditors Committee Meeting	2/3	-14,669
04/25/2001	6	41.8	23,389	Creditors Committee Meeting	2/3	-15,593
05/15/2001	6	41.8	22,615	Creditors Committee Meeting	2/3	-15,077
06/04/2001	5	29	15,702	Creditors Committee Meeting	3/5	-9,421
06/04/2001	2	12.3	6,065	Creditors Committee Meeting	ok	
		164.5	89,774			-54,759
04/17/2001	4	4.4	2,508	PwC Meetings/Calls		
04/17/2001	3	2.7	1,477	PwC Meetings/Calls		
04/18/2001	7	12.2	3,611	PwC Meetings/Calls		
04/29/2001	2	2.2	1,309	PwC Meetings/Calls		
04/30/2001	5	5.5	1,815	PwC Meetings/Calls		
05/04/2001	3	1.8	600	PwC Meetings/Calls		
05/31/2001	3	2.4	1,455	PwC Meetings/Calls		
06/01/2001	3	2.7	1,450	PwC Meetings/Calls		
06/20/2001	2	2.8	1,526	PwC Meetings/Calls		
				PwC Meetings/Calls		
07/03/2001	6	5.4	2,457	PwC Meetings/Calls		
07/06/2001	2	0.4	238	PwC Meetings/Calls		
07/09/2001	2	1	595	PwC Meetings/Calls		
07/10/2001	3	13.2	4,584	PwC Meetings/Calls		
07/10/2001	2	2.6	1,164	PwC Meetings/Calls		
07/11/2001	2	2.2	1,199	PwC Meetings/Calls		
07/11/2001	2	6.6	4,076	PwC Meetings/Calls		
07/12/2001	3	7.5	4,575	PwC Meetings/Calls		
07/27/2001	2	1.2	552	PwC Meetings/Calls		
		76.8	35,191			-35,191
04/17/2001	4	4.2	2,581	Committee Conference Call	1/2	-1,291
04/19/2001	2	2.4	1,482	Committee Conference Call		0
04/23/2001	2	2.4	1,482	Committee Conference Call		0
04/27/2001	7	13.4	6,578	Committee Conference Call	5/7	-4,699
05/01/2001	2	5.8	3,161	Committee Conference Call		0
05/01/2001	2	1.2	714	Committee Conference Call		0
05/04/2001	2	3	1,050	Committee Conference Call		0
05/07/2001	4	6	3,705	Committee Conference Call	1/2	-1,853
05/16/2001	3	3.4	1,809	Committee Conference Call	1/3	-603
05/18/2001	2	6.8	3,785	Regulation Subcommittee		0
05/21/2001	3	4.2	2,114	Finance Subcommittee	1/3	-705
05/24/2001	5	11	5,566	Committee Conference Call	3/5	-3,340
05/30/2001	2	2.6	910	Working Call		
05/31/2001	3	4.5	2,745	Committee Conference Call	1/3	-915
06/04/2001	2	5.2	2,639	Finance Subcommittee		0
06/05/2001	4	7.2	3,602	Committee Conference Call	1/2	-1,801
06/08/2001	2	1.6	560	Working Call		
06/11/2001	2	1.6	952	Committee Conference Call		0
06/16/2001	6	14.3	7,143	Creditors Committee Meeting	2/3	-4,762
06/19/2001	2	0.8	494	Committee Conference Call		0
06/20/2001	2	2.6	1,606	Committee Conference Call		0
06/20/2001	5	9.6	4,876	Finance Subcommittee Call	3/5	-2,926
06/22/2001	4	7.3	3,849	Finance Subcommittee Call	1/2	-1,925
06/22/2001	3	7.3	4,420	Subcommittee	1/3	-1,473
06/25/2001	3	3.6	1,888	Committee Conference Call	1/3	-629
06/28/2001	3	4.6	2,235	Finance Subcommittee Call	1/3	-745
06/28/2001	2	1.6	772	Committee Conference Call		0
07/06/2001	5	8.1	4,302	Finance Subcommittee Call	3/5	-2,581
07/10/2001	4	10.2	5,805	Committee Conference Call	1/2	-2,903
07/12/2001	2	3.3	1,964	Committee Conference Call		0
07/15/2001	5	14.5	6,799	Committee Conference Call	3/5	-4,079
07/17/2001	6	7.8	3,990	Committee Conference Call	2/3	-2,660
07/18/2001	4	8.2	4,266	Committee Conference Call		0
07/18/2001	2	2.4	1,496	Committee Conference Call		0
07/18/2001	2	3.3	1,746	Subcommittee Call		0
07/19/2001	2	4.7	2,507	Subcommittee Meeting		0
07/25/2001	4	12.1	5,857	Committee Conference Call		0
07/26/2001	3	4.1	1,980	Committee Conference Call		0

EXHIBIT N

07/31/2001	5	8.9	4,582	Committee Conference Call		0
		225.8	118,012			-39,888
04/18/2001	3	6.6	3,707	CC Professionals Call	1/3	-1,236
04/30/2001	3	5.7	3,202	CC Professionals Call	1/3	-1,067
04/30/2001	2	2.2	1,309	CC Professionals Call		0
05/04/2001	3	8.1	4,941	CC Professionals Call	1/3	-1,647
06/15/2001	2	1.2	714	CC Professionals Meeting		0
06/22/2001	2	1.2	582	Working Meeting		0
06/28/2001	3	3.7	2,133	CC Professionals Call	1/3	-711
07/03/2001	2	2.6	1,261	CC Professionals Call		0
07/05/2001	2	1.6	776	CC Professionals		0
07/16/2001	3	1.5	820	CC Professionals Call	1/3	-273
07/17/2001	2	5.3	3,154	CC Professionals Meeting		0
07/24/2001	4	4.1	1,986	CC Professionals Call	1/2	-993
07/31/2001	2	0.6	357	CC Professionals Call		0
		44.4	24,942			-5,927
05/09/2001	3	4.2	1,610	Meeting with PGE	1/3	-537
05/14/2001	5	16	8,880	Meeting with PGE	3/5	-5,328
05/18/2001	3	3.3	2,013	Conf Call with PGE	1/3	-671
05/22/2001	2	4.9	2,983	Meeting with PGE		0
07/24/2001	2	2.4	1,269	Call with PGE Invest. Bankers		0
07/26/2001	3	1.2	568	Call with PGE's Fin. Advisor	1/3	-189
04/24/2001	5	15.5	8,603	Meeting with PGE	3/5	-5,162
06/11/2001	2	2.4	990	Meeting with PGE		0
06/15/2001	2	6.2	3,689	Meeting with PGE		0
06/25/2001	2	3	1,839	Call with PGE		0
07/02/2001	2	5.1	3,035	Meeting with PGE		0
07/03/2001	3	9.9	5,313	Meeting with PGE	1/3	-1,771
07/05/2001	3	6.8	3,763	Meeting with PGE	1/3	-1,254
07/12/2001	3	13.2	8,174	Meeting with PGE	1/3	-2,725
07/17/2001	3	3	1,420	Meeting with PGE	1/3	-473
07/17/2001	2	2.4	930	Meeting with PGE		0
07/19/2001	2	7.1	4,225	Meeting with PGE		0
07/20/2001	2	3.6	1,395	Meeting with PGE		0
07/26/2001	2	6.2	3,225	Meeting with PGE		0
07/27/2001	2	3	1,238	Meeting with PGE		0
07/30/2001	4	6.4	3,528	Call with PGE & Advisors	1/2	-1,764
07/30/2001	4	5.7	2,955	Call with PGE & Advisors	1/2	-1,478
05/24/2001	2	4.4	2,270	Settlement Discussion		0
		135.9	73,915			-21,352
05/08/2001	3	4.2	2,296	Attend Court Hearing	2/3	-1,531
05/24/2001	2	11	5,545	Attend Court Hearing	1/2	-2,773
06/05/2001	3	7.3	4,452	Attend Court Hearing	2/3	-2,968
06/07/2001	2	5.7	3,073	Attend 341 Meeting	1/2	-1,537
07/13/2001	2	4.7	2,860	Attend Court Hearing	1/2	-1,430
07/23/2001	2	4.8	1,173	Attend CPUC Hearing	1/2	-587
		37.7	19,399			-10,824
		685.1	361233	TOTALS		-167,941
						46.49%

Case matter	Date of service	Name	Hours	Rate	Fee	Description of services
Committee Matters	04/16/01	Dzrmiecki, James	8.2	495	4,059	Attended Creditor Committee Meeting and presented materials and analysis of PG&E
Committee Matters	04/16/01	Reiss, Freddie	8.2	595	4,879	Meeting with Official Creditors Committee assist in review of counsel presentations and background on PG&E
Committee Matters	04/16/01	Ho, Rocky	8.2	450	3,690	Participate in OCC meeting held at Pillsbury, re PG&E background, formation issues, PwC workshop.
Committee Matters	04/16/01	Hamilton, Mike	4.0	640	2,560	PG&E Unsecured Creditors- Listen to Company presentations and filing of Counsel (took part in only 4 hours of meeting)
Committee Matters	04/16/01	Keenan, Gerald	6.0	640	3,840	Attended Creditors Committee meeting at Pillsbury. (Partial Attendance)
Committee Matters	04/16/01	Lumsden, Tom	1.8	595	1,071	Attend Creditors Committee meeting and participate in Debtor presentation to Committee
Committee Matters	04/16/01	Lumsden, Tom	3.2	595	1,904	Attend Creditors Committee meeting and participate in discussion and review of selection for legal counsel.
			39.6		22,003	
Committee Matters	04/17/01	Hamilton, Mike	1.1	640	704	PwC Conference Call among professional to begin work on work plan, time reporting, etc. (Ho, Lumsden, Reiss)
Committee Matters	04/17/01	Ho, Rocky	1.1	450	495	Internal working committee (Lumsden, Hamilton, Reiss) conference call with co-chairs and committee counsel to discuss strategy for engaging a PR firm on behalf of the OCC.
Committee Matters	04/17/01	Lumsden, Tom	1.1	595	655	Internal working committee (Ho, Hamilton, Reiss) conference call with co-chairs and committee counsel to discuss strategy for engaging a PR firm on behalf of the OCC.
Committee Matters	04/17/01	Reiss, Freddie	1.1	595	655	Internal working committee (Ho, Hamilton, Lumsden) conference call with co-chairs and committee counsel to discuss strategy.
		Sub-total	4.4		2,508	
Committee Matters	04/17/01	Hamilton, Mike	0.9	640	576	Committee Conference Call PwC (F. Reiss, T. Lumsden, R. Ho, G. Keenan) K. Smith (Delta Power) and the Milbank Lawyers to discuss kick off.
Committee Matters	04/17/01	Keenan, Gerald	0.9	640	576	Conference call w/ (T. Lumsden, F. Reiss, R. Ho, M. Hamilton) and chair and other committee members to discuss engagement.
Financial Statement	04/17/01	Lumsden, Tom	0.9	595	536	Participate in PG&E conference call with investors noting disclosure and plans in bankruptcy.
Committee Matters	04/17/01	Reiss, Freddie	1.5	595	893	Conference call with chair and other committee members to discuss engagement.
			4.2		2,580	
Committee Matters	04/17/01	Ho, Rocky	0.9	450	405	Internal PwC discussion on work plan development - breakdown of work among the different partners: (T. Lumsden, F. Reiss, G. Keenan, M. Hamilton)
Committee Matters	04/17/01	Lumsden, Tom	0.9	595	536	Participate in PwC call with F. Reiss, G. Keenan, M. Hamilton, R. Ho to address work tasks and requirements for Committee requests: Develop work plan and assignments for PwC team.
Committee Matters	04/17/01	Reiss, Freddie	0.9	595	536	Call PwC Team (Ho, Lumsden, Hamilton, Keenan) re: work plan, cash collateral and Company
			2.7		1,476	
						Cont. Call with Unsecured Creditors Professionals and PwC team (Ho, Lumsden) to focus and prioritize on PG&E issues
Committee Matters	04/18/01	Hamilton, Mike	2.2	640	1,408	Teleconference call with committee counsel and PwC member (Hamilton, Lumsden) to discuss short-term strategic issues to be addressed by the OCC.
Committee Matters	04/18/01	Ho, Rocky	2.2	450	990	Participate in Conference call with w/ PwC (Hamilton, Ho) and Committee re Strategy issues to be addressed for Case resolution. Develop list for research and analysis with Milbank.
Committee Matters	04/18/01	Lumsden, Tom	2.2	595	1,309	
			6.6		3,707	
Other	04/18/01	Huang, Theodore	1.9	300	570	Meeting with the PwC BRS professional team to discuss: project scope, external, web sites and time reporting. In attendance: T. Huang, T. Lumsden, M. Nels, D. Orwein, R. Perfl, King A. Young
Other	04/18/01	King, Floris	1.9	250	475	Meeting with the PwC BRS professional team to discuss: project scope, external, web sites and time reporting. In attendance: T. Huang, T. Lumsden, M. Nels, D. Orwein, R. Perfl, King A. Young
Other	04/18/01	Lumsden, Tom	0.8	595	476	Spoke at meeting with PwC staff re relationship check, independence, timekeeping, development of external for Committee, research requests (partial attendance)
Other	04/18/01	Nels, Margery	1.9	325	618	Meeting with the PwC BRS professional team to discuss: project scope, external, web sites and time reporting. In attendance: T. Huang, T. Lumsden, M. Nels, D. Orwein, R. Perfl, King A. Young
Other	04/18/01	Orwein, David	1.9	200	380	Meeting with the PwC BRS professional team to discuss: project scope, external, web sites and time reporting. In attendance: T. Huang, T. Lumsden, M. Nels, D. Orwein, R. Perfl, King A. Young
Other	04/18/01	Perfl, Ryan	1.9	200	380	Meeting with the PwC BRS professional team to discuss: project scope, external, web sites and time reporting. In attendance: T. Huang, T. Lumsden, M. Nels, D. Orwein, R. Perfl, King A. Young
Other	04/18/01	Young, Allison	1.9	375	713	Meeting with the PwC BRS professional team to discuss: project scope, external, web sites and time reporting. In attendance: T. Huang, T. Lumsden, M. Nels, D. Orwein, R. Perfl, King A. Young
			12.2		3,671	
						Cont. Call with bank group and PwC (Lumsden) re status of bankruptcy case and to answer questions re binders that will be sent to them
Committee Matters	04/19/01	Hamilton, Mike	1.2	640	768	Participate in call with Committee Co-Chairs and counsel to outline strategy points and work places for Milbank, Saybrook and PwC (Hamilton).
Committee Matters	04/19/01	Lumsden, Tom	1.2	595	714	

		2.4		1,482	
Committee Matters	04/23/01 Hamilton, Mike	1.2	640	788	Call w/ professionals and committee chairs to prepare for full creditor committee meeting on Wednesday
Committee Matters	04/23/01 Lumsden, Tom	1.2	595	714	Participate in conference call with Committee re planning and agenda for Meeting on April 25.
		2.4		1,482	
Coordinating w/Debt	04/24/01 Dzirniecki, James	3.1	495	1,535	Attendance at meeting with PG&E regarding updated cash flows (Reiss, Lumsden, Keenan, Ho)
Coordinating w/Debt	04/24/01 Ho, Rocky	3.1	450	1,395	Meeting w/debtor to discuss back-up support for cash flows through Sept 2001 (Reiss, Lumsden, Keenan, Dzirniecki, Ho)
Coordinating w/Debt	04/24/01 Keenan, Gerald	3.1	640	1,984	Meeting w/ debtor re: cash flow projections. (T. Lumsden, J. Dzirniecki, F. Reiss, R. Ho)
Coordinating w/Debt	04/24/01 Lumsden, Tom	3.1	595	1,845	Meal with K. Henry, R. Patterson, R. Kuja, Saybrook, Committee Chairs, (Ho, Reiss, Keenan, Dzirniecki) by phone, and EV representatives to review cash projection details, mainline deposit issues, bilateral contracts, QF issues.
Coordinating w/Debt	04/24/01 Reiss, Freddie	3.1	595	1,845	Meeting with debtor re: cash flow projections. (T. Lumsden, G. Keenan, J. Dzirniecki, R. Ho)
		15.5		8,603	
Committee Matters	04/25/01 Hamilton, Mike	7.8	640	4,992	Unsecured Creditors Committee meeting (by phone) respond to inquiries on regulation issues and background of PG&E
Committee Matters	04/25/01 Ho, Rocky	7.8	450	3,510	Full committee meeting in San Francisco to discuss various issues.
Committee Matters	04/25/01 Keenan, Gerald	8.1	640	5,184	Participated in Full committee meeting in San Francisco to discuss large range of issues concerning PG&E bankruptcy.
Committee Matters	04/25/01 Lumsden, Tom	1.6	595	952	Creditors Committee: Participate in DWR presentation to Creditors Committee.
Committee Matters	04/25/01 Lumsden, Tom	6.0	595	3,570	Participate in Creditors Committee Meeting with full Committee and PG&E representatives.
Committee Matters	04/25/01 Parfit, Ryan	2.7	200	540	Prepared and delivered PowerPoint presentations to creditors committee meeting.
Committee Matters	04/25/01 Reiss, Freddie	7.8	595	4,641	Full Creditors Committee Meeting, participate in strategy issues and presentations
		41.8		23,389	
Subcommittee Matters	04/27/01 Dzirniecki, James	2.1	495	1,040	Participation in QF litigation conference call
Committee Matters	04/27/01 Hamilton, Mike	2.1	640	1,344	OCC Cont Call to discuss committee position on motion to free QF's from PG&E contractual obligations
Executive Contracts	04/27/01 Ho, Rocky	2.1	450	945	Committee conference call to discuss committee response to Crockett QF.
Executive Contracts	04/27/01 Lumsden, Tom	1.9	595	595	Participate in Committee conference call to address QF motions to vacate stay and obtain Committee views.
Executive Contracts	04/27/01 Neis, Margery	1.9	325	618	Conference Call relating to the QF's motion to suspend assumption or rejection of contracts
Executive Contracts	04/27/01 Reiss, Freddie	2.1	595	1,250	Call Re: QF issues & pending motions.
Executive Contracts	04/27/01 Young, Allison	2.1	375	788	Participated in conference call regarding QF request to receive market rates for energy supplied in lieu of rates provided by contracts or the Wood agreement.
		13.4		6,578	
Committee Matters	04/29/01 Lumsden, Tom	1.1	595	655	Spoke with Freddie Reiss concerning upcoming PG&E engagement meetings.
Committee Matters	04/29/01 Reiss, Freddie	1.1	595	655	Call w/ Tom Lumsden re: meetings schedule etc.
		2.2		1,309	

Committee Matters	04/30/01	Hamilton, Mike	1.9	640	1,216	Conference call w/Milbank and Saybrook, to discuss global modeling issues as it relates to settlement - economic impact of alternatives. (R, Ho, Lumsden)
Committee Matters	04/30/01	Lumsden, Tom	1.9	595	1,131	Participate in conference call with PwC (Ho, Hamilton) and Milbank re restructuring strategy and financial modeling for same.
Committee Matters	04/30/01	Ho, Rocky	1.9	450	855	Conference call w/Milbank and Saybrook, et al. to discuss global modeling issues as it relates to settlement - economic impact of alternatives. (Hamilton, Lumsden)
DWR Contracts/Amc Committee Matters	04/30/01	Lumsden, Tom	1.1	595	655	Conference call with Sabre Partners and PwC (Reiss) re SCE MOU and DWR numbers to assess impact on net short to PG&E and application to PG&E undercollation
	04/30/01	Reiss, Freddie	1.1	595	655	Call w/ Tom Lumsden re meeting net short to PG&E and application to PG&E undercollation. W/Saber
			2.2		1,309	
Financial Grid Load	04/30/01	Ho, Rocky	1.1	450	495	Team meeting with (Young, Loughney, Neis, Perfit) to discuss the creation of net short model and then follow up discussion with team members.
Financial Grid Load	04/30/01	Loughney, Kathryn	1.1	300	330	Team meeting with (Young, Ho, Neis, Perfit) to discuss the creation of the Statewide net short model and then follow up discussion with team members.
Financial Grid Load	04/30/01	Neis, Margery	1.1	325	358	Meeting with Young, Ho, Neis, and Perfit to design new model to calculate entire net short of the State of California and assign tasks to team members.
Financial Grid Load	04/30/01	Perfit, Ryan	1.1	200	220	Meeting to discuss model with Allison Young, Margery Neis and Katie Loughney, Rocky Ho.
Financial Grid Load	04/30/01	Young, Allison	1.1	375	413	Meeting to discuss model with Margery Neis and Katie Loughney Rocky Ho, Ryan Perfit.
			5.3		1,815	
Committee Matters	05/01/01	Hamilton, Mike	2.9	640	1,856	Cont. Call discussion of meeting with Hertzburg, PR firm, status of model and discussion of QF motion to void (R, Ho)
Committee Matters	05/01/01	Ho, Rocky	2.9	450	1,305	Teleconference meeting of the Committee members and PwC team (Hamilton) to further discuss the response of the Committee on various suspension of QF contracts, also discussed Hertzberg meeting, Edison MOU, agenda for PR firm
Executive Contracts	05/01/01	Lumsden, Tom	0.6	595	357	Participate in Creditors Committee call and w/ F. Reiss on QF issue for response to Debtor motion.
Executive Contracts	05/01/01	Reiss, Freddie	0.6	595	357	Participate in Creditors Committee call and w/ T. Lumsden on QF issue for response to Debtor motion.
			1.2		714	
Committee Matters	05/04/01	Hamilton, Mike	2.7	640	1,728	Cont. Call w/ Saybrook and Milbank and PwC (Lumsden, Reiss) to discuss QF contracts, info how bolt-on assets at PG&E, (discussors of financial model, net value of underlying assets, Reviewed of committee websites
Committee Matters	05/04/01	Lumsden, Tom	2.7	595	1,607	Participate in strategy discussion with Saybrook, Milbank and PwC (Hamilton, Reiss) re next steps in case
Committee Matters	05/04/01	Reiss, Freddie	2.7	595	1,607	Strategy Session w/ other committee members and PwC members (Hamilton, Lumsden)
			8.1		4,941	
Financial Grid Load	05/04/01	Loughney, Kathryn	0.6	300	180	Conference Call with Young, and Neis regarding a new model that will be built next week. Discussed what type of data we would need and what I would have to obtain from RDI PowerDat.
Financial Grid Load	05/04/01	Young, Allison	0.6	375	225	Conference call with K. Loughney and Margery Neis to discuss development of financial forecasting model for PG&E
Financial Grid Load	05/04/01	Neis, Margery	0.6	325	195	Conference call with K. Loughney and Margery Neis to discuss development of financial forecasting model for PG&E
			1.8		600	
Committee Matters	05/04/01	Neis, Margery	1.5	325	488	Participate in meetings and teleconferences with the Unsecured Creditors Committee and/or its representatives. Reviewed model of 3 California IOUs with T. Lumsden, A. Young and Saybrook.
Committee Matters	05/04/01	Young, Allison	1.5	375	563	Conference call with attorneys, Saybrook Capital, Tom Lumsden and Margery Neis to and UCC to review three CA IOUs.
			3.0		1,050	
Committee Matters	05/07/01	Hamilton, Mike	1.5	640	960	Cont. Call w/ committee members and PwC Team (Reiss, Keenan, Lumsden)
Committee Matters	05/07/01	Keenan, Gerald	1.5	640	960	Cont. Call w/ Unsecured Committee (f. Reiss, T. Lumsden, M. Hamilton)
Committee Matters	05/07/01	Lumsden, Tom	1.5	595	893	Participate in Committee Meeting conference call w/ (Reiss, Keenan, Hamilton) re subcommittee selection, ratepayer committee, and CPUC Turn accounting case.
Committee Matters	05/07/01	Reiss, Freddie	1.5	595	893	Committee Conf. Call with committee members and PwC Team (Hamilton, Keenan, Lumsden)
			6.0		3,705	
Professional Compe	05/08/01	Ho, Rocky	1.4	450	630	Attend court hearing w/ (Reiss, Lumsden) ordered by Judge Moraiti to provide a status update to the application for employment for professionals.
Professional Compe	05/08/01	Lumsden, Tom	1.4	595	833	Attend hearing on retention of professionals w/ PwC team (R, Ho, F. Reiss)
Professional Compe	05/08/01	Reiss, Freddie	1.4	595	833	Attend Hearing on Professionals w/ (Ho and Lumsden)
			4.2		2,295	

Coordinating w/Debt	05/09/01 Ho, Rocky	1.4	450	630		Meeting with PwC team (A. Young, M. Neis) and PGE representative (D Patterson, Dir of Finance) to discuss projected energy procurements with a particular focus on QFs and bilateral contracts.
Coordinating w/Debt	05/09/01 Neis, Margery	1.4	325	465		Meeting w/ PwC team (Ho, Young, PG&E and E&Y personnel regarding cash flow assumptions
Coordinating w/Debt	05/09/01 Young, Allison	1.4	375	525		Meeting with Rocky Ho and Margery Neis, met with PG&E personnel to discuss data submitted for our request on QF's status and for support of net short call.
		4.2		1,610		
Coordinating w/Debt	05/14/01 Lumsden, Tom	3.2	595	1,904		Attendance w/ PwC team (Ho, Lumsden, Reiss, Hamilton) at PG&E meeting on the Omnibus Requests in the areas of Capital Expenditures, Post-Petition Claims Settlements, Environmental Redemption Activities and Labor Issues
Coordinating w/Debt	05/14/01 Reiss, Freddie	3.2	595	1,904		PG&E Creditors' Comm meeting w/ PG&E (Reiss, Dzirznecki, Ho, Lumsden)
		16.0		8,880		Meeting with PwC team (Dzirznecki, Reiss, Lumsden, Hamilton) the Debtor and Debtor's counsel Debtor's financial advisors and Committee professionals to discuss Debtor's position.
						Participate in meeting with PG&E and advisors & Committee representatives and PwC (Dzirznecki, Hamilton Ho, Reiss) re various motions filed or to be filed, including Tom Accounting, Omnibus Motion, Schedules & SOFA, and various other issues.
						Meeting w/ PG&E CFO & counsel and PwC team (Dzirznecki, Ho, Lumsden, Hamilton)
Committee Matters	05/15/01 Dzirznecki, James	8.2	495	4,059		Attendance at Creditors Committee Meeting, and presented valuation analysis and addressed gas supply issues.
Committee Matters	05/15/01 Hamilton, Mike	8.2	640	5,248		PG&E Unsecured Creditors Meeting (Participated by Telephone)
Committee Matters	05/15/01 Ho, Rocky	8.2	450	3,690		Meeting with the creditors committee to discuss financial, legislative/regulatory matters, extra-net and other issues.
Committee Matters	05/15/01 Lumsden, Tom	6.4	595	3,808		Participate in creditors committee at PwC in SF including presentation by PG&E representatives and by Milbank, Saybrook and PwC on various topics.
Committee Matters	05/15/01 Reiss, Freddie	8.0	595	4,760		Creditors Committee meeting
Committee Matters	05/15/01 Young, Allison	2.6	375	1,050		Participate in UCC meeting
		41.8		22,615		
Subcommittee Matter	05/16/01 Hamilton, Mike	1.1	640	704		PG&E Unsecured Creditors Committee- Conference call w/ PwC team (Ho, Lumsden) and the financial sub-committee.
Subcommittee Matter	05/16/01 Lumsden, Tom	1.1	595	655		Participate in meeting of financial subcommittee w/ PwC Team (Ho, Hamilton)
Subcommittee Matter	05/16/01 Young, Allison	1.2	375	450		UCC finance committee conference call
				1,809		
Committee Matters	05/18/01 Hamilton, Mike	1.1	640	704		Conference Call PG&E w/ PwC (Lumsden, Reiss) and Unsecured Creditors' Committee
Committee Matters	05/18/01 Lumsden, Tom	0.4	595	238		Telephone call with C. Strand re Governors call and ratepayer committee ruling.
Committee Matters	05/18/01 Lumsden, Tom	0.7	595	417		Participate in UCC and PG&E conference call w/ PwC (Reiss, Hamilton) (partial call)
Committee Matters	05/18/01 Reiss, Freddie	1.1	595	695		Call w/ PwC (Lumsden, Hamilton) and committee chair re meeting w/ CFO
		3.3		2,013		
Subcommittee Matter	05/18/01 Keenan, Gerald	5.0	640	3,200		Preparation and meeting of Regulation Subcommittee in Los Angeles.
Subcommittee Matter	05/18/01 Neis, Margery	1.8	325	395		Conference call with regulatory subcommittee of creditors committee - look notes.
		6.8		3,795		
Subcommittee Matter	05/21/01 Dzirznecki, James	1.4	495	693		Finance Subcommittee call w/ PwC (Young, Hamilton)
Subcommittee Matter	05/21/01 Young, Allison	1.4	375	525		Participate in conference call with UCC Finance subcommittee and PwC (Dzirznecki, Hamilton)
Subcommittee Matter	05/21/01 Hamilton, Mike	1.4	640	896		Cont. Call re Financial sub-Committee and PwC (Dzirznecki, Young)
		4.2		2,114		
Coordinating w/Debt	05/22/01 Hamilton, Mike	1.5	640	960		Met with PG&E Corp. and CFO & Gen. Counsel and PwC (Reiss)
Coordinating w/Debt	05/22/01 Reiss, Freddie	1.5	595	893		Meeting with PG&E Corp. CFO & Gen. Counsel and PwC (Hamilton)
Committee Matters	05/22/01 Reiss, Freddie	1.9	595	1,131		Meeting with PG&E Corp. Chairman, CFO & CFO
		4.9		2,983		
Subcommittee Matter	05/24/01 Hamilton, Mike	2.2	640	1,409		Committee conference call with finance and regulatory subcommittees and PwC (Lumsden, Neis, Reiss, Young).
Subcommittee Matter	05/24/01 Lumsden, Tom	2.2	695	1,309		Committee conference call with regulatory subcommittee and PwC (Hamilton, Neis, Reiss, Young).
Subcommittee Matter	05/24/01 Neis, Margery	2.2	325	715		Regulatory subcommittee conference call - joint call with financial subcommittee and PwC (Hamilton, Lumsden, Reiss, Young). Take notes.
Subcommittee Matter	05/24/01 Reiss, Freddie	2.2	595	1,309		Regulatory sub-committee call. (Hamilton, Lumsden, Neis, Young)
Subcommittee Matter	05/24/01 Young, Allison	2.2	375	825		Participate in Regulatory subcommittee conference call w/ PwC (Hamilton, Lumsden, Neis, Reiss)
		11.0		5,561		
Executive Contracts	05/24/01 Ho, Rocky	6.9	450	3,105		Participated in court hearings - closed session regarding Mid Set.

Executive Contracts	05/24/01	Lumsden, Tom	4.1	595	2,440		Hearing on Midses/Westside Cogen testimony by T. Lumsden on stand, testimony by K. Lucas, Judge request for TEL to file declaration by Tussery with modified market prices for April and May
Executive Contracts	05/24/01	Ho, Rocky	2.4	450	1,080		Participated in Mid Set settlement discussions with Debtor, OCC and Mid Set representatives.
Executive Contracts	05/24/01	Lumsden, Tom	1.2	595	714		Meeting at Howard Rice offices with Midses representatives for settlement discussion before hearing
Executive Contracts	05/24/01	Lumsden, Tom	0.8	595	476		Midses settlement discussion with K. Lucas, R. Moore and W. Lafferty at Court awaiting hearing
			4.4		2,270		
Financial Grid Lead	05/30/01	Neis, Margery	1.3	325	423		Conference call with Mike Tribolet (Enron) D. Falkemeier (Dynegy), Allison Young, re refinements to the Net Short model and PG&E model for the financial subcommittee
Financial Grid Lead	05/30/01	Young, Allison	1.3	375	488		Conference call with Margery Neis, Michael Tribolet (Enron) and Dan Faltemeyer (Dynegy) to discuss financial model.
			2.6		910		
Committee Matters	05/31/01	Hamilton, Mike	1.5	640	960		Conf. Call re: preparing for upcoming meeting with leg. Committee (T. Lumsden, F. Reiss)
Committee Matters	05/31/01	Lumsden, Tom	1.5	595	893		Conference call with C. Strand, F. Reiss and M. Hamilton re Plan proposal questions and structure to address open items.
Committee Matters	05/31/01	Reiss, Freddie	1.5	595	893		Call with Clara Strand, T. Lumsden & M. Hamilton re: PG&E meeting
Plan of Reorganization	05/31/01	Hamilton, Mike	0.6	640	384		Conf Call w/ T. Lumsden and F. Reiss to come up w/ Plan of Reorganization to prepare for meeting w/ PG&E tomorrow to discuss their preliminary POR Concepts
Plan of Reorganization	05/31/01	Lumsden, Tom	0.6	595	387		Conf Call w/ F. Reiss and M. Hamilton to come up w/ Plan of Reorganization to prepare for meeting w/ PG&E tomorrow to discuss their preliminary POR Concepts
Plan of Reorganization	05/31/01	Reiss, Freddie	0.6	595	357		Conf Call w/ T. Lumsden and M. Hamilton to come up w/ Plan of Reorganization to prepare for meeting w/ PG&E tomorrow to discuss their preliminary POR Concepts
Plan of Reorganization	05/31/01	Reiss, Freddie	0.6	595	357		Call w/ Tom Lumsden & Mike Hamilton re: plan ideas
			2.4		1,495		
Committee Matters	06/01/01	Hamilton, Mike	0.9	640	576		PwC call to discuss status of projects (T. Lumsden, A. Young, J. Drzemnicki, M. Neis)
Committee Matters	06/01/01	Lumsden, Tom	0.9	595	536		Meeting and Conference call with (M. Hamilton, A. Young, J. Drzemnicki and M. Neis) re PwC work plan and data requirements to assemble memo for the Debtor.
Committee Matters	06/01/01	Young, Allison	0.9	375	398		Conference call on status of various projects with (J. Drzemnicki, M. Hamilton, T. Lumsden and M. Neis.)
			2.7		1,449		
Committee Matters	06/04/01	Drzemnicki, James	7.1	495	3,515		Attendance at creditors committee meeting.
Committee Matters	06/04/01	Hamilton, Mike	6.4	640	4,096		PG&E Creditors Committee meeting
Committee Matters	06/04/01	Ho, Rocky	7.8	450	3,510		OCC meeting; participation in finance committee presentation.
Committee Matters	06/04/01	Lumsden, Tom	0.6	595	387		Participate in discussions on Trading Order for Committee members
Committee Matters	06/04/01	Reiss, Freddie	7.1	595	4,225		Creditors Committee meeting
			29.0		15,702		
Subcommittee Matters	06/04/01	Young, Allison	2.6	375	975		Participate in finance subcommittee meeting to interview forward price consultants.
Subcommittee Matters	06/04/01	Hamilton, Mike	2.6	640	1,684		Finance Sub-committee- Interview of energy forecasting firm.
			5.2		2,659		
Committee Matters	06/04/01	Lumsden, Tom	2.1	595	1,250		Participate in meeting with C. Strand of BofA and M. Tribolet of Enron re plan fundamentals and modeling of PG&E net open position and financial structure.
Subcommittee Matters	06/04/01	Lumsden, Tom	4.5	595	2,678		Participate in Committee Meeting with the Debtor and presentations for financial subcommittee by PwC.
Subcommittee Matters	06/04/01	Young, Allison	5.7	375	2,198		Participate in presentation at Finance sub committee meeting.
			12.3		6,065		
Bankruptcy Reporting	06/05/01	Hamilton, Mike	2.4	640	1,536		Listen to the bankruptcy hearing on ISO purchase for PG&E
Claims Analysis	06/05/01	Reiss, Freddie	1.8	595	1,071		Attend Court hearing and arguments concerning PG&E vs ISO and claim amounts.
Claims Analysis	06/05/01	Lumsden, Tom	3.1	595	1,945		Attend Court hearing and arguments concerning PG&E vs ISO and claim amounts after 1/17/01. Review ISO and PG&E materials in Court.
			7.3		4,452		
Plan of Reorganization	06/05/01	Hamilton, Mike	2.6	640	1,664		Conference Call responding to legislature's FOR points.
Plan of Reorganization	06/05/01	Lumsden, Tom	3.5	595	2,083		Meeting with Plan working group for development of Plan Principles and pro-forma plan discussions and templates.
			7.2		3,602		
Committee Matters	06/05/01	Reiss, Freddie	4.1	595	2,440		Conference call w/creditors committee re: plan strategy.
Committee Matters	06/05/01	Young, Allison	3.1	375	1,163		Creditors committee meeting to discuss over riding principles of reorg. plan.

Bankruptcy Reportin	06/07/01	Ho, Rocky	2.2	450	990		Participated in section 341 meeting at Hastings College.
Bankruptcy Reportin	06/07/01	Lumsden, Tom	3.5	595	2,083		Attend Sec 341 meeting of Creditors at Hastings Law School and presentation by Debtor and inquiry by US Trustee.
			5.7		3,073		
Financial Grd Load	06/08/01	Neis, Margery	0.8	325	260		Conference call with Ed Feo and Kevin McFadden of Milbank, Michael Tribol of Enron, and Allison Young of PwC re: calculation of the CPA.
Financial Grd Load	06/08/01	Young, Allison	0.8	375	300		Discuss CPA calculation and the DWR "set aside" with Ed Feo and Kevin McSpadden of Milbank, Margery Neis, PwC, and Michael Tribol of Enron.
			1.6		560		
Asset Sales/Valuatc	06/11/01	Ho, Rocky	1.2	450	540		Real Estate meeting with P. Vandervoort (PwC), the Debtor regarding SBE, SAP, and other databases available to begin understanding the real estate holdings of Debtor.
Asset Sales/Valuatc	06/11/01	Vandervoort, Paier	1.2	375	450		Real Estate meeting with R. Ho (PwC), the Debtor regarding SBE, SAP, and other databases available to begin understanding the real estate holdings of Debtor.
Plan of Reorganizati	06/11/01	Lumsden, Tom	2.4	595	990		Conference call with P. Aronzon, F. Reiss and C. Strand re committee strategy and plan process.
Plan of Reorganizati	06/11/01	Reiss, Freddie	0.8	595	476		Conference call with T. Lumsden (PwC), P. Aronzon and C. Strand regarding committee strategy and plan process.
			1.6		952		
Plan of Reorganizati	06/15/01	Lumsden, Tom	3.8	595	2,261		Participate in meeting with PG&E management and Creditors Committee on Plan proposals and outline
Plan of Reorganizati	06/15/01	Reiss, Freddie	2.4	595	1,428		Meeting at PG&E
			6.2		3,689		
Plan of Reorganizati	06/15/01	Lumsden, Tom	0.6	595	357		Meet with F. Reiss and P. Aronzon re Wasserstein comments on plan formation from prior evening.
Plan of Reorganizati	06/15/01	Reiss, Freddie	0.6	595	357		Meet with T. Lumsden and P. Aronzon re Wasserstein comments on plan issues from prior evening.
			1.2		714		
Plan of Reorganizati	06/19/01	Hamilton, Mike	0.4	640	256		Telephone call with C. Strand and T. Lumsden re alternative plan options
Plan of Reorganizati	06/19/01	Lumsden, Tom	0.4	595	238		Telephone call with C. Strand regarding plan options (M. Hamilton)
			0.8		494		
Financial Grd Load	06/20/01	Dzimecki, James	1.4	495	893		Conference call with T. Lumsden to develop model for net short for 2002-4 including DRG.
Financial Grd Load	06/20/01	Lumsden, Tom	1.4	595	833		Conference call with J. Dzimecki to develop model for net short for 2002-4 including DRG.
			2.8		1,326		
Plan of Reorganizati	06/20/01	Hamilton, Mike	1.3	640	832		Conference call of the POR committee w/ (T. Lumsden) discussing plan alternatives and DWR numbers.
Plan of Reorganizati	06/20/01	Lumsden, Tom	1.3	595	774		Participate in conference call with C. Strand, E. Fed, A. Marks, M. Hamilton re plan alternatives and DWR numbers.
			2.6		1,606		
Subcommittee Matc	06/20/01	Dzimecki, James	2.6	495	1,287		Participation in financial subcommittee call: preparation of Net Short Model analysis
Subcommittee Matc	06/20/01	Hamilton, Mike	1.8	640	1,152		PG&E Unsecured Creditors Committee: Finance Committee Conference Call
Subcommittee Matc	06/20/01	Ho, Rocky	1.8	450	810		Finance subcommittee teleconference to discuss and review state financial model.
Subcommittee Matc	06/20/01	Lumsden, Tom	1.6	595	952		Participate in Financial subcommittee conference call re revenue requirement impacts (Partial Attendance)
Subcommittee Matc	06/20/01	Young, Allison	1.8	375	675		Participate in finance subcommittee conference call.
			9.6		4,876		
Subcommittee Matc	06/22/01	Dzimecki, James	1.8	495	891		Participation in Financial Subcommittee call
Subcommittee Matc	06/22/01	Hamilton, Mike	1.8	640	1,152		Finance Committee Conference Call
Subcommittee Matc	06/22/01	Young, Allison	1.8	375	675		Finance subcommittee conference call
Subcommittee Matc	06/22/01	Lumsden, Tom	1.9	595	1,131		Participate in conference call with Finance subcommittee re modeling of load and resources and dollar impact
			7.3		3,849		
Subcommittee Matc	06/22/01	Hamilton, Mike	1.7	640	1,088		Legislative Committee interview of lobbyists.
Plan of Reorganizati	06/22/01	Lumsden, Tom	1.7	595	1,012		Conference call with C. Strand and Milbank, Seybrock re work plan and plan developments. DWR issues.
Subcommittee Matc	06/22/01	Reiss, Freddie	3.9	595	2,321		Meeting and conference calls by sub-committees.
			7.3		4,420		
Executive Contracts	06/22/01	Young, Allison	0.6	375	225		Meet with Tom Lumsden and Terry Ponsford of Sheppard Mullin to discuss CF issues and potential settlement with Creditors Committee, CF's, PG&E and court.
Executive Contracts	06/22/01	Lumsden, Tom	0.6	595	357		Meet with M. Ahrens and T. Ponsford and A. Young (PwC) re CF contract assumptions and terms and potential settlement
			1.2		582		

Plan of Reorganization	06/25/01	Hamilton, Mike	1.2	640	788		Conference Call with PG&E to discuss POR
Coordinating w/Debt	06/25/01	Lumsden, Tom	1.8	595	1,071		Conference call with Debtor and Plan working group re developments and exclusively extension
			3.0		1,839		
Plan of Reorganization	06/25/01	Hamilton, Mike	0.8	640	512		Participate in conference call with C. Strand and Milbank counsel, and separate call with C. Strand and T. Lumsden re POR issues.
Committee Matters	06/25/01	Ho, Rocky	2.0	450	900		Prepare for and participate in meetings and teleconferences with the Unsecured Creditors' Committee and/or its representatives.
Plan of Reorganization	06/25/01	Lumsden, Tom	0.8	595	476		Participate in conference call with C. Strand and Milbank counsel, and separate call with C. Strand and M. Hamilton re plan issues
			3.6		1,898		
Committee Matters	06/26/01	Dzrzemcki, James	3.0	495	1,485		Participate in conference call with PG&E Creditors Committee re plan process, exclusively, ordinary course motion, legislation
Committee Matters	06/26/01	Hamilton, Mike	2.2	640	1,408		PG&E Unsecured Creditors Committee- Committee Conference Call
Committee Matters	06/26/01	Ho, Rocky	2.6	450	1,170		Teleconference meeting - full OCC members - status update of the plan process and other current legislative, financial and litigation subcommittee groups.
Committee Matters	06/26/01	Ho, Rocky	2.6	450	1,170		Participate in conference call with PG&E Creditors Committee re plan process, exclusively, ordinary course motion, legislation
Committee Matters	06/26/01	Lumsden, Tom	2.9	595	1,726		Telephone call with C. Strand re addition of members to Plan working group.
Plan of Reorganization	06/26/01	Lumsden, Tom	0.2	595	119		Committee Conference call - sign off early to work on other tasks
Subcommittee Matters	06/26/01	Neis, Margery	0.8	325	280		Participate in UCC conference call.
Committee Matters	06/26/01	Young, Allison	2.6	375	975		
			14.3		7,143		
Subcommittee Matters	06/28/01	Dzrzemcki, James	1.1	495	545		Participation in Financial Subcommittee call
Subcommittee Matters	06/28/01	Dzrzemcki, James	1.5	495	743		Prepare for and participate in finance subcommittee conference call.
Subcommittee Matters	06/28/01	Lumsden, Tom	0.9	595	536		Participate in Finance subcommittee call re financial model and CPUC issues.
Subcommittee Matters	06/28/01	Young, Allison	1.1	375	413		Prepare for and participate in finance subcommittee conference call.
Committee Matters	06/28/01	Hamilton, Mike	4.6	640	2,235		
Subcommittee Matters	06/28/01	Neis, Margery	0.8	325	280		PG&E Unsecured Creditors Committee Conf. Call to discuss intervention at CPUC
			1.6		772		UCC Conference call - signed off early to work on QF Claims analysis
Plan of Reorganization	06/28/01	Hamilton, Mike	0.7	640	448		Conference Call with Saybrook and PwC to discuss preparing a financial model to begin the POR process
Plan of Reorganization	06/28/01	Hamilton, Mike	1.0	640	640		Conference call with Saybrook representatives and R. Ho and T. Lumsden re plan developments and data requirements.
Plan of Reorganization	06/28/01	Ho, Rocky	1.0	450	450		Conference call with Saybrook representatives and M. Hamilton and T. Lumsden re plan developments and data requirements.
Plan of Reorganization	06/28/01	Lumsden, Tom	1.0	595	595		Conference call with Saybrook representatives and M. Hamilton and R. Ho re current issues and data requirements.
			3.7		2,133		
CPUC Review	07/02/01	Lumsden, Tom	2.0	595	1,190		Participate in meeting via conference call with PG&E regarding CPUC/DWR set aside calculations
Committee Matters	07/02/01	Reiss, Freddie	3.1	595	1,845		Meeting at PG&E regarding net short/DWR issues.
			5.1		3,035		
Other	07/03/01	Dzrzemcki, James	0.9	495	446		Meeting with PwC Team (A. Young, T. Lumsden, M. Hamilton, W. Smythe, M. Neis) concerning current status of PG&E case.
Other	07/03/01	Hamilton, Mike	0.9	640	576		Meeting with PwC Team (A. Young, T. Lumsden, J. Dzrzemcki, W. Smythe, M. Neis) concerning current status of PG&E case.
Other	07/03/01	Lumsden, Tom	0.9	595	536		Meet with A. Young, J. Dzrzemcki, M. Hamilton, M. Neis, and W. Smythe on project status.
Other	07/03/01	Neis, Margery	0.9	325	293		Meeting with Tom Lumsden, Mike Hamilton, Alison Young, Wesley Smyth regarding tasks to be performed subsequent to meeting with debtor.
Other	07/03/01	Smyth, Wesley	0.9	300	270		Meeting with PwC Team (A. Young, T. Lumsden, M. Hamilton, J. Dzrzemcki, M. Neis) concerning current status of PG&E case.
Other	07/03/01	Young, Allison	0.9	375	338		Meet with T. Lumsden, J. Dzrzemcki, M. Hamilton, M. Neis, and W. Smythe on project status.
			5.4		2,457		
Coordinating w/Debt	07/03/01	Hamilton, Mike	3.3	640	2,112		Coordination and meetings with the Debtor, and PwC team (A. Young, T. Lumsden) to discuss PG&E's revenue requirements.
Coordinating w/Debt	07/03/01	Lumsden, Tom	3.3	595	1,964		Participate in meeting with M. Hamilton, A. Young (PwC) with PG&E representatives responsible for net short calculation, UCC filing, and DWR contacts analysis to share data and obtain information for analysis
Coordinating w/Debt	07/03/01	Young, Allison	3.3	375	1,238		Coordination and meetings with the Debtor, Tom Lumsden and Mike Hamilton to discuss PG&E's revenue requirements.

Asset Sales/Valuat	07/03/01	Lumsden, Tom	1.3	595	774		Meeting and conference call with J. Rosenthal and P. Vandervoort re real estate files analysis and development of joint work plan to identify and value real estate for sale or finance.
Asset Sales/Valuat	07/03/01	Vandervoort, Peter	1.3	375	488		Conference call with J. Rosenthal and T. Lumsden re joint analysis to identify real estate sales or finance.
			2.6		1,281		
Coordinating w/Debt	07/05/01	Hamilton, Mike	1.1	640	704		Meeting with PG&E personnel to discuss their calculation of the URG
Financial Grid Load	07/05/01	Hamilton, Mike	1.9	640	1,216		Meetings with the Debtor, A. Young and T. Lumsden M. Neis (PwC) and Dix Patterson and team at PG&E re revenue requirement and net short models.
Financial Grid Load	07/05/01	Lumsden, Tom	1.9	595	1,131		Meetings with the Debtor, M. Neis, Mike Hamilton and Tom Lumsden to discuss the debtor's revenue requirements.
Financial Grid Load	07/05/01	Young, Allison	1.9	375	3,763		
CPUC Review	07/05/01	Lumsden, Tom	0.8	595	476		Telephone call with E. Fao and A. Young re CPUC regulatory requirements and PG&E filings.
CPUC Review	07/05/01	Young, Allison	0.8	375	300		Meeting with Milbank, Tom Lumsden, to discuss CPUC regulatory requirements and PG&E filings
			1.5		776		
Subcommittee Matter	07/06/01	Dzimecki, James	1.8	495	891		Finance Sub-Committee Meeting
Subcommittee Matter	07/06/01	Hamilton, Mike	1.3	640	832		PG&E finance subcommittee conference call- re work to date on PG&E and DWR revenue requirements
Subcommittee Matter	07/06/01	Lumsden, Tom	2.0	595	1,190		Participate in conference call with Finance Subcommittee re Revenue Requirements, URG filing, PwC assessment and plans for Committee presentations
Subcommittee Matter	07/06/01	Reiss, Freddie	1.2	595	714		Call with UCC subcommittee.
Subcommittee Matter	07/06/01	Young, Allison	1.8	375	675		Participate in Finance subcommittee meeting.
Committee Matters	07/06/01	Lumsden, Tom	0.2	595	4,302		Call with F. Reiss-PwC.
Committee Matters	07/06/01	Reiss, Freddie	0.2	595	119		Call with Tom Lumsden-PwC.
			0.4		238		
Committee Matters	07/09/01	Lumsden, Tom	0.5	595	298		Call w/ F. Reiss regarding status & update to retained revenue required.
Committee Matters	07/09/01	Reiss, Freddie	0.5	595	585		Call with Tom Lumsden regarding status & update to retained revenue required.
			1.0		885		
Committee Matters	07/10/01	Reiss, Freddie	2.9	595	1,726		Conference call w/committee.
Committee Matters	07/10/01	Ho, Rocky	2.6	450	1,170		OCC full member status call - PG&E URG Revenue Requirements, DWR, Financing Issues, Plan working group, etc.
Committee Matters	07/10/01	Keenan, Gerald	2.2	640	1,500		Attended PG&E Creditor Committee meeting.
Committee Matters	07/10/01	Lumsden, Tom	2.2	595	1,309		Participated in Creditors Committee conference call re PG&E and DWR revenue requirements
			10.2		5,805		
DWR Contracts/Ana	07/10/01	Smyth, Wesley	5.0	300	300		Met with E. Stortz concerning DWR Contract model.
DWR Contracts/Ana	07/10/01	Dzimecki, James	3.2	495	1,584		Participated in meeting w. Smyth and E. Stortz reviewing DWR contract and model. (partial attendance)
DWR Contracts/Ana	07/10/01	Stortz, Elizabeth	5.0	300	1,500		Participated in meeting with J. Dzimecki and W. Smyth discussing development of DWR contracts and model.
			13.2		4,584		
DWR Contracts/Ana	07/10/01	Lumsden, Tom	1.3	595	774		Met with W. Smyth to review DWR energy purchases, contracts, data releases and CPUC filings to assess financial impact and revenue requirement as it applies to PG&E
DWR Contracts/Ana	07/10/01	Smyth, Wesley	1.3	300	390		Met with T. Lumsden to review DWR energy purchases, contracts, data releases and CPUC filings.
			2.6		1,164		
DWR Contracts/Ana	07/11/01	Dzimecki, James	1.1	495	545		Meet with T. Lumsden to go over DWR contract data base and types of information to capture.
DWR Contracts/Ana	07/11/01	Lumsden, Tom	1.1	595	555		Meet with Jim Dzimecki to go over DWR contract data base and types of information to capture.
			2.2		1,109		
Plan of Reorganizati	07/11/01	Hamilton, Mike	3.3	640	2,112		Work with T. Lumsden, (PwC) on plan to develop framework.
Plan of Reorganizati	07/11/01	Lumsden, Tom	3.3	595	1,964		Working group meeting with M. Hamilton to develop plan framework.
			6.6		4,076		
Plan of Reorganizati	07/12/01	Hamilton, Mike	2.5	640	1,600		Work on creditors plan of reorganization with T. Lumsden, R. Reiss, (PwC)
Plan of Reorganizati	07/12/01	Lumsden, Tom	2.5	595	1,488		Meet with Plan working group members and F. Reiss and M. Hamilton review plan concepts and structures.
Plan of Reorganizati	07/12/01	Reiss, Freddie	2.5	595	1,488		Meeting with working group regarding debtor plan issues. (T. Lumsden, M. Hamilton)
			7.5		4,575		
Plan of Reorganizati	07/12/01	Hamilton, Mike	3.5	640	2,240		Meeting of the POR working group with PG&E to listen to PG&E describe the current status of the POR
Plan of Reorganizati	07/12/01	Hamilton, Mike	3.6	640	2,304		Review and prepare for POR working group to prepare for meeting with PG&E
Plan of Reorganizati	07/12/01	Lumsden, Tom	3.0	595	1,785		Meet at PG&E with plan working group for presentation by PG&E of plan outlines
Plan of Reorganizati	07/12/01	Reiss, Freddie	3.1	595	1,845		Meeting w/Debtor regarding plan issues.
Coordinating w/Debt			13.2		8,174		

Plan of Reorganizati	07/12/01	Lumsden, Tom	1.4	595	893		Followup working group meeting at PwC with Plan working group to review PG&E materials and address plan outline
Plan of Reorganizati	07/12/01	Reiss, Freddie	1.9	595	1,131		Meeting w/committee regarding plan issues & prior presentations by debtor.
			3.3		1,964		
Executive Contracts	07/13/01	Hamilton, Mike	1.4	640	896		Attended Bankruptcy Court Hearing on QF motions
Executive Contracts	07/13/01	Lumsden, Tom	3.3	595	1,964		Attend hearing on Trading order and prepare for QF hearing. Review contract provisions with R. Moore. Participate in hearing on QF settlements covering 15-20 contracts.
			4.7		2,860		
Committee Matters	07/16/01	Ho, Rocky	0.5	450	225		Call with F. Reiss, T. Lumsden & Paul Aronzon regarding exclusivity, etc.
Committee Matters	07/16/01	Lumsden, Tom	0.5	595	298		Meeting with R. Ho, F. Reiss (PwC) and P. Aronzon in regards to exclusivity
Committee Matters	07/16/01	Reiss, Freddie	1.5	595	298		Call with R. Ho, T. Lumsden & Paul Aronzon regarding exclusivity, etc.
Committee Matters	07/16/01	Ho, Rocky	3.0	450	820		OCC status call - update on scenario 4. QF Settlement issues and plan scenarios.
Plan of Reorganizati	07/16/01	Lumsden, Tom	3.0	595	1,350		Participate in Committee Conference call re DWIR-CPUC issues, DWIR contracts, legislative issues. QF issues, exclusivity, scheduling matters, plan discussions.
Committee Matters	07/16/01	Neis, Margery	2.8	325	910		Conference call of the Official Unsecured Creditors' Committee.
Committee Matters	07/16/01	Reiss, Freddie	2.8	595	1,666		Call with committee.
Plan of Reorganizati	07/16/01	Young, Allison	2.9	375	1,098		Participate in teleconferences with the Unsecured Creditors' Committee and its representatives.
			14.5		6,799		
Plan of Reorganizati	07/17/01	Dzmitrecki, James	0.8	495	396		Participation in Conference Call with Planning subgroup. (partial participation)
Plan of Reorganizati	07/17/01	Hamilton, Mike	1.1	640	704		Conference call with POR working group to prepare for meeting with PG&E on Thursday.
Plan of Reorganizati	07/17/01	Ho, Rocky	1.4	450	630		OCC subcommittee call - plan call on principles in response to the debtor's presentation.
Plan of Reorganizati	07/17/01	Lumsden, Tom	1.3	595	774		Participate in Working Group call to develop points list for PG&E
Plan of Reorganizati	07/17/01	Reiss, Freddie	1.3	595	774		Conference call regarding working group.
Plan of Reorganizati	07/17/01	Young, Allison	1.9	375	713		Participate in teleconference with the Unsecured Creditors' Committee's plan subgroup.
			7.8		3,990		
Coordinating w/Debt	07/17/01	Lumsden, Tom	1.0	595	596		Call with Debtor and PwC team (T. Lumsden, A. Young) re: discuss assumptions behind their scenario analysis and cash flow forecast.
Coordinating w/Debt	07/17/01	Ho, Rocky	1.0	450	450		Call with Debtor and PwC team (T. Lumsden, A. Young) re: discuss assumptions behind their scenario analysis and cash flow forecast.
Coordinating w/Debt	07/17/01	Young, Allison	1.0	375	375		Meet with debtor to discuss the assumptions behind their scenario analyses and their cash flow forecasts. (Rocky Ho, Tom Lumsden).
			3.0		1,420		
Coordinating w/Debt	07/17/01	Ho, Rocky	1.2	450	640		Meeting with debtor (D Patterson, J O-Flanigan) and M. Neis (PwC) - to discuss assumptions to debtor's URG filed revenue requirements - emphasis on nuclear cost of service.
Coordinating w/Debt	07/17/01	Neis, Margery	1.2	325	390		Meet with debtor regarding revenue requirements analysis, Dick Patterson and Joe O'Flanagan from PG&E and Rocky Ho.
			2.4		930		
FERC Review	07/17/01	Lumsden, Tom	2.1	595	1,280		Participate in meeting of Milbank and Weil Gotschal regulatory counsel re FERC issues on Plan development
Plan of Reorganizati	07/17/01	Reiss, Freddie	3.2	595	1,904		Meeting at Milbank regarding legal & plan issues.
			5.3		3,154		
Committee Matters	07/18/01	Hamilton, Mike	2.1	610	1,344		Committee conference call
Committee Matters	07/18/01	Ho, Rocky	2.0	450	900		Full OCC teleconference meeting - discuss plan concerns, legislative update, exclusivity issues and other issues.
Committee Matters	07/18/01	Lumsden, Tom	2.2	595	1,309		Participate in committee conference call to address exclusivity extension, scenario 4, legislative update and points list for debtor response.
Committee Matters	07/18/01	Young, Allison	1.9	375	713		Participate in teleconferences with the Unsecured Creditors' Committee and its representatives.
			8.2		4,266		
Plan of Reorganizati	07/18/01	Hamilton, Mike	1.5	640	960		PG&E Unsecured Creditors Committee-Pre Creditors Committee call to prepare for that call to discuss POR points for tomorrow's meeting
Plan of Reorganizati	07/18/01	Reiss, Freddie	0.9	595	536		Conference call regarding PG&E Planning Meeting.
			2.4		1,496		
Subcommittee Matle	07/18/01	Ho, Rocky	1.5	450	675		Subcommittee regulatory teleconference to discuss debtor's plan concerns - regulatory concerns with proposed structure.
FERC Review	07/18/01	Lumsden, Tom	1.8	595	1,071		Participate in regulatory conference call with E. Fedo to discuss Weil Gotschal analysis and bills in Sacramento.
			3.3		1,746		

Plan of Reorganization	07/19/01	Ho, Rocky	2.0	450	900		Meeting with Plan subcommittee to discuss next steps with regards to working with the debtor - legislative and finance subcommittee.
Plan of Reorganization	07/19/01	Lumsden, Tom	2.7	595	1,607		Meet with Committee working group at PwC to discuss net short models, scenario 4, establish teams and projects.
Plan of Reorganization	07/19/01	Lumsden, Tom	4.7		2,507		
Plan of Reorganization	07/19/01	Lumsden, Tom	3.3	595	1,964		Participate in Plan meeting at PG&E with Working Group
Coordinating w/Debt	07/19/01	Reiss, Freddie	3.8	595	2,261		Meeting with debtor
			7.1		4,225		
Coordinating w/Debt	07/20/01	Ho, Rocky	1.8	450	810		Meeting with M. Neis and debtor (Trisia Berkovitz, Director of Gas Procurement) to discuss business issues for increasing gas suppliers to the security agreement.
Coordinating w/Debt	07/20/01	Neis, Margery	1.8	325	585		Meeting with R. Ho (PwC) director of gas procurement, Trisia Berkovitz regarding debtor's motion to add suppliers to security agreement. Preparation (read motion), meeting.
			3.6		1,395		
CPUC Review	07/23/01	Neis, Margery	1.7	325	553		Attend evidentiary hearings for SCE URG revenue requirements.
CPUC Review	07/23/01	Orwein, David	3.1	200	620		Attend CPUC Hearing for Rate increase and documented relevant information.
			4.8		1,173		
Plan of Reorganization	07/24/01	Hamilton, Mike	0.8	640	512		Conference call with committee professionals to prepare for tomorrow's meeting of the POR working group, then discussion with R. Ho and A. Young and T. Lumsden about our presentation.
Plan of Reorganization	07/24/01	Ho, Rocky	0.8	450	360		OCC professionals call to discuss deliverables and agenda items for tomorrow's plan subcommittee meeting. (M. Hamilton, A. Young, T. Lumsden)
Plan of Reorganization	07/24/01	Lumsden, Tom	0.6	595	476		Participate in planning conference call with Milbank and Saybrook and PwC team (M. Hamilton, R. Ho, A. Young)
Plan of Reorganization	07/24/01	Young, Allison	0.9	375	336		OCC professionals and PwC (Ho, Hamilton) call to discuss deliverables and agenda items for tomorrow's plan subcommittee meeting.
Plan of Reorganization	07/24/01	Young, Allison	0.8	375	300		Prepare for meeting with the Unsecured Creditors Committee's plan subcommittee by participating in planning conference call with Milbank and Saybrook. (M. Hamilton, R. Ho, T. Lumsden)
Plan of Reorganization	07/24/01	Ho, Rocky	4.1	450	1,985		Discussion with the debtor's investment bankers on various debt restructuring issues.
Plan of Reorganization	07/24/01	Lumsden, Tom	1.3	595	774		Participate in conference call with Lehman re plan structures
			2.4		1,269		
Plan of Reorganization	07/25/01	Hamilton, Mike	0.8	640	512		Unsecured Creditors Call of POR working group to prepare for tomorrow's meeting with PG&E
Plan of Reorganization	07/25/01	Ho, Rocky	4.5	450	2,025		OCC plan meeting at PwC to review legislative, regulatory and financial summary of the debtor's plan.
Plan of Reorganization	07/25/01	Lumsden, Tom	3.5	595	2,083		Working group meeting at PwC to address regulatory, legal, cash flow, CF and DWR revenue requirement issues.
Plan of Reorganization	07/25/01	Young, Allison	3.3	375	1,238		Participate in plan working group meeting. Gave presentation on updated cash flow forecasts to the working group, also discussed aspects of the DWR revenue requirements.
			12.1		5,987		
Plan of Reorganization	07/26/01	Ho, Rocky	1.5	450	675		OCC plan group meeting after discussions with the debtor - review subcommittee actions and follow up work plan.
Plan of Reorganization	07/26/01	Young, Allison	1.1	375	413		Participate in plan working group meeting to follow up on issues raised in the subcommittee's meeting with the debtor.
Plan of Reorganization	07/26/01	Lumsden, Tom	1.5	595	883		Discussion with working group at PwC to review materials and issues.
			4.1		1,980		
Plan of Reorganization	07/26/01	Ho, Rocky	3.2	450	1,440		Plan meeting with the company to discuss various strategic and financial issues of a plan.
Plan of Reorganization	07/26/01	Lumsden, Tom	3.0	595	1,795		Participate in meeting with PG&E and plan working group of Committee.
			6.2		3,225		
Plan of Reorganization	07/26/01	Ho, Rocky	0.4	450	180		Participate in call with E&Y, Tom Lumsden and A. Young regarding the financial projections of PG&E's business.
Plan of Reorganization	07/26/01	Lumsden, Tom	0.4	595	238		Conf. Call with E&Y and PwC team (A. Young, R. Ho) regarding the financial projections of PG&E's.
Plan of Reorganization	07/26/01	Young, Allison	0.2	375	150		Participate in call with E&Y, Tom Lumsden and Rocky Ho regarding the financial projections of PG&E's business.
			1.2		568		
Coordinating w/Debt	07/27/01	Ho, Rocky	1.5	450	675		Meeting with the debtor and PwC (A. Young) to discuss assumptions used in the plan's pro forma financial statements.
Coordinating w/Debt	07/27/01	Young, Allison	1.5	375	583		Meeting with Rocky Ho and debtor to go over the projections for the generating portion of the business under the proposed reorganization plan.
			3.0		1,238		
DWR Contracts/Ana	07/27/01	Lumsden, Tom	0.6	595	357		Meet with M. Neis to review modeling impact of DWR revenue requirement adjustments in assumptions.
DWR Contracts/Ana	07/27/01	Neis, Margery	0.6	325	195		Meet with T. Lumsden to review modeling impact of DWR revenue requirement adjustments in assumptions.
			1.2		552		

Plan of Reorganization	07/30/01	Hamilton, Mike	1.6	640	1,024		PG&E UCC Conference Call with T. Lumsden, A. Pellerio, A. Young, PG&E and their tax counsel to discuss tax issues related to their tentative POR.
Plan of Reorganization	07/30/01	Lumsden, Tom	1.6	595	952		Conference call with Weil Gottschal, PG&E, Milbank and P. Pellerio A. Young, M. Hamilton on tax issues in plan proposal.
Plan of Reorganization	07/30/01	Pellerio, Pat	1.6	595	952		Discussion with PG&E, PG&E's advisors, Milbank, Saybrook, T. Lumsden, M. Hamilton, A. Young, and to discuss the potential tax implications of PG&E's proposed reorg plan.
Plan of Reorganization	07/30/01	Young, Allison	1.6	375	600		Discussion with PG&E, PG&E's advisors, Milbank, Saybrook, T. Lumsden, M. Hamilton, P. Pellerio to discuss the potential tax implications of PG&E's proposed reorg plan.
Plan of Reorganization	07/30/01	Hamilton, Mike	6.4	640	950		Conference Call with Lehman, Saybrook and others (T. Lumsden, A. Young), to discuss plan
Plan of Reorganization	07/30/01	Ho, Rocky	1.2	450	540		Teleconference with the debtor and its professionals regarding status of plan.
Plan of Reorganization	07/30/01	Lumsden, Tom	1.5	595	893		Participate in conference call with Saybrook and Lehman and PwC (M. Hamilton, A. Young) re alternative finance structures.
Plan of Reorganization	07/30/01	Young, Allison	1.5	375	563		Participate in conference call with T. Lumsden, M. Hamilton PG&E and its advisors regarding the plan and financial structure.
			5.7		2,955		
Committee Matters	07/31/01	Dzmitiecki, James	1.6	495	792		Unsecured Creditors conference call
Committee Matters	07/31/01	Hamilton, Mike	1.8	640	1,152		PG&E UCC Full Committee conference call to discuss, Recent courtroom developments (Commodities trading), Sacramento Development's alternative Edison MOU legislation), DWR update, Plan working group update.
Committee Matters	07/31/01	Ho, Rocky	1.8	450	810		Full committee update on plan developments, trading order issues, and others.
Committee Matters	07/31/01	Lumsden, Tom	2.0	595	1,190		Full committee call on DWR updates, legislative update, commodities trading order, reports from subcommittees.
Plan of Reorganization	07/31/01	Young, Allison	1.7	375	638		Participate in teleconferences with the OCC and its representatives to update committee on recent developments including discussions with the company on potential reorg plans.
			8.9		4,592		
Committee Matters	07/31/01	Lumsden, Tom	0.3	595	179		Telephone call with Milbank & Saybrook and F. Reiss re 1pm call with committee and discussion points.
Committee Matters	07/31/01	Reiss, Freddie	0.3	595	179		Call with Milbank & Saybrook regarding full committee call agenda (T. Lumsden)
			0.6		357		

Fee Application	06/14/01	Buck, Darren	1.3	200	260	Compiled records of time spent on the PG&E engagement for the relevant time period and entered the information into the reporting system.
Fee Application	05/23/01	Drzniecki, James	0.9	495	446	Preparation of Time report
Fee Application	07/02/01	Ho, Rocky	0.5	450	225	Review Knudsen draft motion regarding interim professional compensation matters.
Fee Application	07/27/01	Ho, Rocky	0.5	450	225	Review order establishing interim fee application and expense reimbursement procedure.
Fee Application	07/30/01	Ho, Rocky	4	450	1,800	Review draft of PwC's initial fee application - time detail.
Fee Application	07/31/01	Ho, Rocky	3.1	450	1,399	Review final draft of PwC's initial fee application.
Fee Application			8.1		3,643	
Fee Application	07/09/01	King, Floris	3.3	250	825	Assisted D.Ortwein with fee application database construction
Fee Application	04/27/01	Loughney, Kathryn	0.9	300	270	Completing time reporting tasks relating to the project.
Fee Application	07/26/01	Lumsden, Tom	0.8	595	476	Review time detail for billing assessment
Fee Application	07/26/01	Lumsden, Tom	1.7	595	1,012	Review of time detail for fee application.
Fee Application	07/30/01	Lumsden, Tom	0.4	595	238	Review monthly billing detail for April and May
Fee Application	07/31/01	Lumsden, Tom	1	595	595	Review order on interim compensation, review monthly billing statement, and approve for filing.
			3.9		2,321	
Fee Application	07/02/01	Montalbano, Sal	0.5	425	213	Billing/Admin issues- pc with Jeff Rudolph on charge code and update on progress as well as follow up on administrative procedures for submitting timesheets
Fee Application	06/07/01	Ortwein, David	1.4	200	280	Started developing PwC Access database for PG&E engagement.
Fee Application	06/18/01	Ortwein, David	6.1	200	1,220	Developed Access Data Base for Time and Expense reporting. In order to better stream line process in the future.
Fee Application	06/19/01	Ortwein, David	4.8	200	960	Developed Access Data Base for Time and Expense reporting.
Fee Application	06/21/01	Ortwein, David	0.3	200	60	Met with R. Perfit to discuss the detail database.
Fee Application	06/22/01	Ortwein, David	3.9	200	780	Developed Access Data Base for Time and Expense reporting.
Fee Application	06/25/01	Ortwein, David	5.2	200	1,040	Continued development of Time Detail Database.
Fee Application	06/26/01	Ortwein, David	4.6	200	920	Continued development of Access Time Detail Database.
Fee Application	06/27/01	Ortwein, David	5.2	200	1,040	Review Time Detail and continued development of time detail database
Fee Application	06/28/01	Ortwein, David	5.4	200	1,080	Organized time Detail and Time Detail Database
Fee Application	07/09/01	Ortwein, David	3.3	200	660	Continued updating time detail database for PG&E work with F. King.
Fee Application	07/17/01	Ortwein, David	4.8	200	960	Worked on Time Detail and Build data base.
Fee Application	07/18/01	Ortwein, David	5.2	200	1,040	Build time Detail data base.
Fee Application	07/23/01	Ortwein, David	1.8	200	360	Go over fee application guideline as outlined by US trustees.
Fee Application	07/24/01	Ortwein, David	6.1	200	1,220	Worked on Time Detail and Build Access data base.
Fee Application	07/25/01	Ortwein, David	4.3	200	860	Worked on Time Detail and Build data base.
Fee Application	07/26/01	Ortwein, David	5.6	200	1,120	Assisted in writing legal documentation for Fee Application
Fee Application	07/30/01	Ortwein, David	9.9	200	1,980	Prepared and developed final fee application and QC time detail to WIPs.
Fee Application	07/30/01	Ortwein, David	2.2	200	440	Work with Ryan Perfit going over Fee Application guideline as outlined by US trustee
Fee Application	07/31/01	Ortwein, David	3	200	600	Produced and prepared mailing of Fee Application to be sent to 400 recipients and US Bankruptcy Court.
Fee Application	07/31/01	Ortwein, David	8.9	200	1,780	Developed and prepared final fee application and report. QC time detail to WIPs to insure correct billing.
			92		18,400	
Fee Application	04/30/01	Perfit, Ryan	1.9	200	380	Document the nature of time charged to the PG&E Bankruptcy engagement
Fee Application	05/16/01	Perfit, Ryan	0.7	200	140	Organized and Reviewed PwC professional's time detail.
Fee Application	05/18/01	Perfit, Ryan	1.8	200	360	Created a worksheet to analyze the PwC time incurred for the bankruptcy engagement in order to establish an interim compensation procedure
Fee Application	05/21/01	Perfit, Ryan	4.1	200	820	Modified the worksheet created to analyze the PwC time incurred for the bankruptcy engagement.
Fee Application	05/23/01	Perfit, Ryan	2.8	200	660	Obtained PwC team's detail time reporting templates and Time and Expense submissions and Reviewed for accuracy and completeness.
Fee Application	05/30/01	Perfit, Ryan	0.3	200	60	Coordinated w/A. Young of PwC regarding formatting fee information for submission to the Bankruptcy court.
Fee Application	06/05/01	Perfit, Ryan	1.8	200	360	Assembly of the PG&E timekeeping database for interim compensation.

Fee Application	06/06/01	Perft, Ryan	1.4	200	280	Assembly of the PG&E timekeeping database for Interim compensation.
Fee Application	06/18/01	Perft, Ryan	0.9	200	180	Acquisition, consolidation, and review of PwC team's time detail for the time reporting database
Fee Application	06/20/01	Perft, Ryan	1.1	200	220	Contacting members of PG&E team to obtain time reporting details
Fee Application	06/21/01	Perft, Ryan	0.3	200	60	Met with David Ortwain to discuss the time detail database. Preparation of Fee Applications and monthly statements in accordance with Order Establishing Procedure for Interim Compensation
Fee Application	06/21/01	Perft, Ryan	1.3	200	260	Coordinate with David Ortwain and help customize the time detail database in accordance with Order Establishing Procedure for Interim Compensation.
Fee Application	06/22/01	Perft, Ryan	2.4	200	340	Preparation of Fee Applications for Interim Compensation.
Fee Application	06/28/01	Perft, Ryan	0.9	200	180	Preparation of Fee Applications for Interim Compensation.
Fee Application	07/02/01	Perft, Ryan	5.1	200	1,020	Collation and review of PwC professional time detail for fee application
Fee Application	07/05/01	Perft, Ryan	1.9	200	380	Creation of access database to catalogue PwC professional's time detail and create reports appropriate for US bankruptcy court fee application
Fee Application	07/05/01	Perft, Ryan	1.2	200	240	Contacted PwC professionals regarding collection of time detail for PwC fee application
Fee Application	07/09/01	Perft, Ryan	1.2	200	240	Creation and maintenance of access database that catalogues PwC professional's time detail and creates reports appropriate for US bankruptcy court fee application
Fee Application	07/09/01	Perft, Ryan	1.3	200	260	Complete administrative tasks inherent to the employment application of PwC. Personal time reporting.
Fee Application	07/09/01	Perft, Ryan	2.4	200	480	Created binder to catalogue detail and internal time reports submitted by members of the PwC PG&E team
Fee Application	07/09/01	Perft, Ryan	3.3	200	660	Collation and review of PwC professional Expense detail for fee application.
Fee Application	07/09/01	Perft, Ryan	0.3	200	60	Contacted PwC professionals regarding collection of time detail for PwC fee application
Fee Application	07/10/01	Perft, Ryan	1.9	200	380	Contacted PwC professionals regarding collection of time detail for PwC fee application
Fee Application	07/10/01	Perft, Ryan	0.8	200	160	Collation and review of PwC professional Time detail for fee application
Fee Application	07/10/01	Perft, Ryan	2.3	200	460	Collation and review of PwC professional Expense detail for fee application
Fee Application	07/11/01	Perft, Ryan	0.7	200	140	Collation and review of PwC professional Expense detail for fee application
Fee Application	07/11/01	Perft, Ryan	1.1	200	220	Contacted PwC professionals regarding collection of time detail for PwC fee application
Fee Application	07/11/01	Perft, Ryan	3.1	200	620	Collation and review of PwC professional Expense detail for fee application
Fee Application	07/17/01	Perft, Ryan	2.8	200	560	Creation and maintenance of access database that catalogues PwC professional's time detail and creates reports appropriate for US bankruptcy court fee application
Fee Application	07/17/01	Perft, Ryan	0.2	200	40	Collation and review of PwC professional Time detail for fee application
Fee Application	07/18/01	Perft, Ryan	6.2	200	1,240	Collation and review of PwC professional Time detail for fee application
Fee Application	07/19/01	Perft, Ryan	3.1	200	620	Creation and maintenance of access database that catalogues PwC professional's time detail and creates reports appropriate for US bankruptcy court fee application
Fee Application	07/20/01	Perft, Ryan	0.9	200	180	Collation and review of PwC professional Expense detail for fee application
Fee Application	07/20/01	Perft, Ryan	2.7	200	540	Creation and maintenance of access database that catalogues PwC professional's time detail and creates reports appropriate for US bankruptcy court fee application
Fee Application	07/23/01	Perft, Ryan	4.7	200	940	Collation and review of PwC professional Time detail for fee application
Fee Application	07/23/01	Perft, Ryan	2.1	200	420	Creation and maintenance of access database that catalogues PwC professional's time detail and creates reports appropriate for US bankruptcy court fee application
Fee Application	07/23/01	Perft, Ryan	1.6	200	320	Collation and review of PwC professional Expense detail for fee application
Fee Application	07/24/01	Perft, Ryan	6.8	200	1,360	Collation and review of PwC professional Expense detail for fee application
Fee Application	07/25/01	Perft, Ryan	7.1	200	1,420	Organized and QC time detail and properly inputted and classified into database
Fee Application	07/26/01	Perft, Ryan	9.1	200	1,820	Organized and QC time detail and properly inputted and classified into database
Fee Application	07/27/01	Perft, Ryan	7.3	200	1,460	Organized and QC time detail and properly inputted and classified into database
Fee Application	07/30/01	Perft, Ryan	2.2	200	440	Work with D. Ortwain going over fee Application guideline as outlined by trustee.
Fee Application	07/30/01	Perft, Ryan	8.8	200	1,760	Organized and QC time detail and properly inputted and classified into database.
Fee Application	07/31/01	Perft, Ryan	8.1	200	1,620	Organized and QC time detail and properly inputted and classified into database.
Fee Application	07/31/01	Perft, Ryan	2.9	200	580	Formatting PwC time detail into ASCII format as to comply with U.S. Trustee's fee application procedures
			126.6		25,320	
Fee Application	04/30/01	Young, Allison	2.1	375	788	Document the nature of time charged to the PG&E Bankruptcy engagement.
Fee Application	05/15/01	Young, Allison	0.7	375	263	Prepare email requesting all personnel assigned to the PG&E bankruptcy submit their time details.
Fee Application	05/16/01	Young, Allison	0.6	375	226	Reviewed time details submitted by team for compliance with bankruptcy reporting
Fee Application	05/17/01	Young, Allison	0.4	375	150	Reviewed time details of other team members to Reviewed for compliance with bankruptcy court filing.
Fee Application	05/21/01	Young, Allison	0.6	375	226	Preparation of Fee Applications and monthly statements in accordance with Order Establishing Procedure for Interim Compensation. Document tasks performed and time charged for tasks.

Fee Application	05/30/01	Young, Allison	0.6	375	225	Find an electronic database for tracking time and sorting time details for the fee application with the bankruptcy court.
Fee Application	05/30/01	Young, Allison	0.3	375	113	Discussed w/ R. Perff of PwC concerning formatting the Fee information for submission to the court.
Fee Application	05/31/01	Young, Allison	0.3	375	113	Follow-up with interim PwC staff on fee application electronic template.
Fee Application	06/05/01	Young, Allison	0.6	375	225	Review steps in fee application process with staff and discuss means to summarize fees and expenses for the filing of the Fee Application.
Fee Application	06/05/01	Young, Allison	0.2	375	75	Review time details submitted by other PwC employees for adequate disclosure of tasks performed.
Fee Application	06/22/01	Young, Allison	0.5	375	188	Review time details submitted by PwC personnel to insure adequate disclosure of activities performed.
Fee Application	07/10/01	Young, Allison	0.9	375	338	Review and respond to emails regarding the fee application process and obtaining time details from all engagement participants.
Fee Application	07/17/01	Young, Allison	3.9	375	1,463	Review time details submitted by team members and available formatting options of time and expense details for submission of the fee application with the court.
Fee Application	07/18/01	Young, Allison	0.2	375	75	Review and respond to emails regarding the fee application process, and our status for filing by July 31.
Fee Application	07/18/01	Young, Allison	1.2	375	450	Discuss fee application requirements with Milbank, then follow-up with various team members on the status of their time details. Requested further clarification on time details from certain team members when necessary.
Fee Application	07/19/01	Young, Allison	0.5	375	188	Review of Knudsen order for fee application process.
Fee Application	07/19/01	Young, Allison	1.9	375	713	Draft cover letter for July 31st interim fee application filing.
Fee Application	07/20/01	Young, Allison	1.9	375	713	Review emails from Milbank regarding US Trustee fee guidelines, and respond with follow-up questions on the process.
Fee Application	07/20/01	Young, Allison	0.4	375	150	Forward guidelines with instructions to the staff who are working on summarizing the time details.
Fee Application	07/23/01	Young, Allison	0.7	375	263	Track down information regarding UST guidelines for the fee application.
Fee Application	07/24/01	Young, Allison	0.2	375	75	Review detail of submitted expenses for PG&E engagement to determine whether they can be recovered from the debtor.
Fee Application	07/24/01	Young, Allison	0.2	375	75	Discuss fee application reporting requirements and status of the application with the staff working on compiling the data.
Fee Application	07/25/01	Young, Allison	0.2	375	75	Discuss fee application process and allowable charges with Steve Johnson of the US Trustee's.
Fee Application	07/26/01	Young, Allison	0.3	375	113	Send and respond to emails regarding missing time details from professionals working on the engagement.
Fee Application	07/27/01	Young, Allison	0.5	375	188	Review status of fee application and the completion of time details.
Fee Application	07/27/01	Young, Allison	0.7	375	263	Review final version of order for interim fee applications to insure PwC is still in compliance.
Fee Application	07/27/01	Young, Allison	4.6	375	1,725	Review revised fee and expense details for appropriate disclosure.
Fee Application	07/30/01	Young, Allison	1.2	375	450	Review current draft of July 31, 2001 fee application to insure it meets bankruptcy court reporting requirements.
Fee Application	07/30/01	Young, Allison	0.4	375	150	Review updated draft of the fee application time and expense details, and begin draft of interim fee application cover letter.
Fee Application	07/31/01	Young, Allison	3.9	375	1,463	Proof changes to the fee application time and expense details.
Fee Application	07/31/01	Young, Allison	1.3	375	488	Follow-up on final changes to fee application, and coordinate submission of all required material with the court and to those on the special notice list.
Fee Application	07/31/01	Young, Allison	0.6	375	225	Update fee application cover letter for revised time and expense details.
Fee Application	07/31/01	Young, Allison	32.4	375	12,150	
			289.9		63,849	