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subsection does not restrict the discre-
tion of the panel to expand the scope of 
cross-examination or redirect examina-
tion. 

(k) Documents that have not been ex-
changed in advance may be shown to a 
witness on cross-examination. How-
ever, copies of such documents must be 
distributed to the CARP and to other 
participants or their counsel at hearing 
before being shown to the witness at 
the time of cross-examination, unless 
the panel directs otherwise. If the doc-
ument is not, or will not be, supported 
by a witness for the cross-examining 
party, that document can be used sole-
ly to impeach the witness’s direct tes-
timony and cannot itself be relied upon 
in findings of fact as rebutting the 
witness’s direct testimony. However, 
upon leave from the panel, the docu-
ment may be admitted as evidence 
without a sponsoring witness if official 
notice is proper, or if, in the panel’s 
view, the cross-examined witness is the 
proper sponsoring witness. 

(l) A CARP will encourage individ-
uals or groups with the same or similar 
interests in a proceeding to select a 
single representative to conduct their 
examination and cross-examination of 
any given witness. However, if there is 
no agreement on the selection of a rep-
resentative, each individual or group 
will be allowed to conduct its own ex-
amination and cross-examination of 
any given witness, but only on issues 
affecting its particular interests, pro-
vided that the questioning is not rep-
etitious or cumulative of the ques-
tioning of other parties within the 
group. 

[59 FR 23981, May 9, 1994, as amended at 59 
FR 63041, Dec. 7, 1994; 63 FR 30635, June 5, 
1998]

§ 251.48 Rules of evidence. 
(a) Admissibility. In any public hear-

ing before a Copyright Arbitration 
Royalty Panel, evidence that is not un-
duly repetitious or cumulative and is 
relevant and material shall be admis-
sible. The testimony of any witness 
will not be considered evidence in a 
proceeding unless the witness has been 
sworn. 

(b) Documentary evidence. Evidence 
that is submitted in the form of docu-
ments or detailed data and information 

shall be presented as exhibits. Relevant 
and material matter embraced in a 
document containing other matter not 
material or relevant or not intended as 
evidence must be plainly designated as 
the matter offered in evidence, and the 
immaterial or irrelevant parts shall be 
marked clearly so as to show they are 
not intended as evidence. In cases 
where a document in which material 
and relevant matter occurs is of such 
bulk that it would unnecessarily en-
cumber the record, it may be marked 
for identification and the relevant and 
material parts, once properly authenti-
cated, may be read into the record. If 
the CARP desires, a true copy of the 
material and relevant matter may be 
presented in extract form, and sub-
mitted as evidence. Anyone presenting 
documents as evidence must present 
copies to all other participants at the 
hearing or their attorneys, and afford 
them an opportunity to examine the 
documents in their entirety and offer 
into evidence any other portion that 
may be considered material and rel-
evant. 

(c) Documents filed with a Copyright 
Arbitration Royalty Panel or Copyright 
Office. If the matter offered in evidence 
is contained in documents already on 
file with a Copyright Arbitration Roy-
alty Panel or the Copyright Office, the 
documents themselves need not be pro-
duced, but may instead be referred to 
according to how they have been filed. 

(d) Public documents. If a public docu-
ment such as an official report, deci-
sion, opinion, or published scientific or 
economic data, is offered in evidence 
either in whole or in part, and if the 
document has been issued by an Execu-
tive Department, a legislative agency 
or committee, or a Federal administra-
tive agency (Government-owned cor-
porations included), and is proved by 
the party offering it to be reasonably 
available to the public, the document 
need not be produced physically, but 
may be offered instead by identifying 
the document and signaling the rel-
evant parts. 

(e) Introduction of studies and anal-
yses. If studies or analyses are offered 
in evidence, they shall state clearly the 
study plan, all relevant assumptions, 
the techniques of data collection, and 
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the techniques of estimation and test-
ing. The facts and judgments upon 
which conclusions are based shall be 
stated clearly, together with any alter-
native courses of action considered. If 
requested, tabulations of input data 
shall be made available to the Copy-
right Arbitration Royalty Panel. 

(f) Statistical studies. Statistical stud-
ies offered in evidence shall be accom-
panied by a summary of their assump-
tions, their study plans, and their pro-
cedures. Supplementary details shall 
be included in appendices. For each of 
the following types of statistical stud-
ies the following should be furnished: 

(1) Sample surveys. (i) A clear descrip-
tion of the survey design, the defini-
tion of the universe under consider-
ation, the sampling frame and units, 
the validity and confidence limits on 
major estimates; and 

(ii) An explanation of the method of 
selecting the sample and of the charac-
teristics which were measured and 
counted. 

(2) Econometric investigations. (i) A 
complete description of the econo-
metric model, the reasons for each as-
sumption, and the reasons for the sta-
tistical specification; 

(ii) A clear statement of how any 
changes in the assumptions might af-
fect the final result; and 

(iii) Any available alternative studies 
that employ alternative models and 
variables, if requested. 

(3) Experimental analysis. (i) A com-
plete description of the design, the con-
trolled conditions, and the implemen-
tation of controls; and 

(ii) A complete description of the 
methods of observation and adjustment 
of observation. 

(4) Studies involving statistical method-
ology. (i) The formula used for statis-
tical estimates; 

(ii) The standard error for each com-
ponent; 

(iii) The test statistics, the descrip-
tion of how the tests were conducted, 
related computations, computer pro-
grams, and all final results; and 

(iv) Summarized descriptions of 
input data and, if requested, the input 
data themselves. 

[59 FR 23981, May 9, 1994, as amended at 60 
FR 8197, Feb. 13, 1995; 63 FR 30635, June 5, 
1998]

§ 251.49 Transcript and record. 

(a) An official reporter for the re-
cording and transcribing of hearings 
shall be designated by the Librarian of 
Congress. Anyone wishing to inspect or 
copy the transcript of a hearing may 
do so at a location specified by the 
chairperson of the Copyright Arbitra-
tion Royalty Panel conducting the 
hearing. 

(b) The transcript of testimony and 
all exhibits, papers, and requests filed 
in the proceeding, shall constitute the 
official written record. Such record 
shall accompany the report of the de-
termination of the CARP to the Librar-
ian of Congress required by 17 U.S.C. 
802(e). 

(c) The record, including the report 
of the determination of a CARP, shall 
be available at the Copyright Office for 
public inspection and copying in ac-
cordance with § 251.22.

§ 251.50 Rulings and orders. 

In accordance with 5 U.S.C., sub-
chapter II, a Copyright Arbitration 
Royalty Panel may issue rulings or or-
ders, either on its own motion or that 
of an interested party, necessary to the 
resolution of issues contained in the 
proceeding before it; Provided, that no 
such rules or orders shall amend, sup-
plement or supersede the rules and reg-
ulations contained in this subchapter. 
See § 251.7. 

[59 FR 23981, May 9, 1994, as amended at 60 
FR 8197, Feb. 13, 1995]

§ 251.51 Closing the record. 

To close the record of hearing, the 
chairperson of a Copyright Arbitration 
Royalty Panel shall make an an-
nouncement that the taking of testi-
mony has concluded. In its discretion 
the panel may close the record as of a 
future specified date, and allow time 
for exhibits yet to be prepared to be ad-
mitted, provided that the parties to the 
proceeding stipulate on the record that 
they waive the opportunity to cross-ex-
amine or present evidence with respect 
to such exhibits. The record in any 
hearing that has been recessed may not 
be closed by the chairperson before the 
day on which the hearing is to resume, 
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