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The Consent Decree may be examined 
at: (1) The offices of the United States 
Attorney, 517 E. Wisconsin Avenue, 
Room 530, Milwaukee, Wisconsin; and 
(2) the offices of EPA Region 5, 77 West 
Jackson Boulevard, 14th Floor, Chicago, 
Illinois. During the public comment 
period, the Consent Decree may also be 
examined on the following Department 
of Justice Web site, http://
www.usdoj.gov/enrd/open.htm. A copy 
of the Consent Decree may also be 
obtained by mail from the Consent 
Decree Library, P.O. Box 7611, U.S. 
Department of Justice, Washington, DC 
20044–7611 or by faxing or e-mailing a 
request to Tonia Fleetwood 
(tonia.fleetwood@usdoj.gov), fax no. 
(202) 514–0097, phone confirmation 
number (202) 514–1547. In requesting a 
copy from the Consent Decree Library, 
please enclose a check in the amount of 
$77.00 (308 pages at 25 cents per page 
reproduction cost) payable to the U.S. 
Treasury. For a copy of the Consent 
Decree alone, without appendices, 
please enclose a check a check in the 
amount of $27.50 (110 pages at 25 cents 
per page reproduction cost) payable to 
the U.S. Treasury.

William D. Brighton, 
Assistant Chief, Environmental Enforcement 
Section, Environment and Natural Resources 
Division.
[FR Doc. 03–26244 Filed 10–16–03; 8:45 am] 
BILLING CODE 4410–15–M

DEPARTMENT OF JUSTICE

Notice of Lodging of Consent Decree 
Pursuant to the Comprehensive 
Environmental Response, 
Compensation, and Liability Act 

In accordance with Departmental 
policy, 28 CFR 50.7, notice is hereby 
given that a proposed consent decree in 
United States v. State of Washington 
Through The Washington Department of 
Natural Resources, Civil Action No. 
C03–5543RBL was lodged on October 6, 
2003, with the United States District 
Court for the Western District of 
Washington. The consent decree 
requires the defendant to perform 
injunctive relief, requiring two groups of 
performing parties to perform the 
cleanup of the Thea Foss and Wheeler 
Osgood Waterway Problem Areas of the 
Commencement Bay/Nearshore 
Tideflats Superfund Site and the 
funding parties to pay a total of 
$13,000,000 to fund cleanup activities at 
the Site. 

The Department of Justice will 
receive, for a period of thirty (30) days 
from the date of this publication, 
comments relating to the proposed 

consent decrees. Comments should be 
addressed to the Assistant Attorney 
General, Environmental and Natural 
Resources Division, P.O. Box 7611, U.S. 
Department of Justice, Washington, DC 
20044–7611, and should refer to United 
States v. State of Washington Through 
The Washington Department of Natural 
Resources, DOJ Ref. #90–11–2–1049/1. 

The proposed consent decrees may be 
examined at the office of the United 
States Attorney, 601 Union Street, Suite 
5100, Seattle, WA 98101 and at U.S. 
EPA Region 10, 1200 Sixth Avenue, 
Seattle, WA 98101. During the comment 
period, the consent decrees may be 
examined on the following Department 
of Justice Web site, http://
www.usdoj.gov/enrd/open.html. Copies 
of the consent decrees also may be 
obtained by mail from the Consent 
Decree Library, P.O. Box 7611, U.S. 
Department of Justice, Washington, DC 
20044–7611 or by faxing or e-mailing a 
request to Tonia Fleetwood 
(tonia.fleetwood@usdoj.gov), fax no. 
(202) 514–0097, phone confirmation 
number (202) 514–1547. In requesting a 
copy, please enclose a check in the 
amount of $11.25, (25 cents per page 
reproduction cost) payable to the U.S. 
Treasury.

Robert Maher, 
Assistant Section Chief, Environmental 
Enforcement Section.
[FR Doc. 03–26242 Filed 10–16–03; 8:45 am] 
BILLING CODE 4410–15–M

DEPARTMENT OF LABOR

Employment Standards 
Administration, Wage and Hour 
Division 

Minimum Wages for Federal and 
Federally Assisted Construction; 
General Wage Determination Decisions 

General wage determination decisions 
of the Secretary of Labor are issued in 
accordance with applicable law and are 
based on the information obtained by 
the Department of Labor from its study 
of local wage conditions and data made 
available from other sources. They 
specify the basic hourly wage rates and 
fringe benefits which are determined to 
be prevailing for the described classes of 
laborers and mechanics employed on 
construction projects of a similar 
character and in the localities specified 
therein. 

The determinations in these decisions 
of prevailing rates and fringe benefits 
have been made in accordance with 29 
CFR Part 1, by authority of the Secretary 
of Labor pursuant to the provisions of 
the Davis-Bacon Act of March 3, 1931, 

as amended (46 Stat. 1494, as amended, 
40 U.S.C. 276a) and of other Federal 
statutes referred to in 29 CFR Part 1, 
Appendix, as well as such additional 
statutes as may from time to time be 
enacted containing provisions for the 
payment of wages determined to be 
prevailing by the Secretary of Labor in 
accordance with the Davis-Bacon Act. 
The prevailing rates and fringe benefits 
determined in these decisions shall, in 
accordance with the provisions of the 
foregoing statutes, constitute the 
minimum wages payable on Federal and 
federally assisted construction projects 
to laborers and mechanics of the 
specified classes engaged on contract 
work of the character and in the 
localities described therein. 

Good cause is hereby found for not 
utilizing notice and public comment 
procedure thereon prior to the issuance 
of these determinations as prescribed in 
5 U.S.C. 553 and not providing for delay 
in the effective date as prescribed in that 
section, because the necessity to issue 
current construction industry wage 
determinations frequently and in large 
volume causes procedures to be 
impractical and contrary to the public 
interest. 

General wage determination 
decisions, and modifications and 
supersedes decisions thereto, contain no 
expiration dates and are effective from 
their date of notice in the Federal 
Register, or on the date written notice 
is received by the agency, whichever is 
earlier. These decisions are to be used 
in accordance with the provisions of 29 
CFR Parts 1 and 5. Accordingly, the 
applicable decision, together with any 
modifications issued, must be made a 
part of ever contract for performance of 
the described work within the 
geographic area indicated as required by 
an applicable Federal prevailing wage 
law and 29 CFR part 5. The wage rates 
and fringe benefits, notice of which is 
published herein, and which are 
contained in the Government Printing 
Office (GPO) document entitled 
‘‘General Wage Determinations Issued 
Under The Davis-Bacon And Related 
Acts,’’ shall be the minimum paid by 
contractors and subcontractors to 
laborers and mechanics. 

Any person, organization, or 
governmental agency having an interest 
in the rates determined as prevailing is 
encouraged to submit wage rate and 
fringe benefit information for 
consideration by the Department.

Further information and self-
explanatory forms for the purpose of 
submitting this data may be obtained by 
writing to the U.S. Department of Labor, 
Employment Standards Administration, 
Wage and Hour Division, Division of 
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Wage Determinations, 200 Constitution 
Avenue, NW., Room S–3014, 
Washington, DC 20210. 

Modification to General Wage 
Determination Decisions 

The number of the decisions listed to 
the Government Printing Office 
document entitled ‘‘General Wage 
Determinations Issued Under the Davis-
Bacon and Related Acts’’ being modified 
are listed by Volume and State. Dates of 
publication in the Federal Register are 
in parentheses following the decisions 
being modified.

Volume I 

Rhode Island 
RI030001 (Jun. 13, 2003) 

Volume II 

None 

Volume III 

None 

Volume IV 

None 

Volume V 

None 

Volume VI 

Wyoming 
WY030005 (Jun. 13, 2003) 
WY030006 (Jun. 13, 2003) 
WY030007 (Jun. 13, 2003) 
WY030008 (Jun. 13, 2003) 
WY030009 (Jun. 13, 2003) 

Volume VII 

None

General Wage Determination 
Publication 

General wage determinations issued 
under the Davis-Bacon and related Acts, 
including those noted above, may be 
found in the Government Printing Office 
(GPO) document entitled ‘‘General Wage 
determinations Issued Under the Davis-
Bacon and Related Acts’’. This 
publication is available at each of the 50 
Regional Government Depository 
Libraries and many of the 1,400 
Government Depository Libraries across 
the country. 

General wage determinations issued 
under the Davis-Bacon and related Acts 
are available electronically at no cost on 
the Government Printing Office site at 
www.access.gpo.gov/davisbacon. They 
are also available electronically by 
subscription to the Davis-Bacon Online 
Service (http://
davisbacon.fedworld.gov) of the 
National Technical Information Service 
(NTIS) of the U.S. Department of 
Commerce at 1–800–363–2068. This 
subscription offers value-added features 
such as electronic delivery of modified 
wage decisions directly to the user’s 

desktop, the ability to access prior wage 
decisions issued during the year, 
extensive Help desk Support, etc. 

Hard-copy subscriptions may be 
purchased from: Superintendent of 
Documents, U.S. Government Printing 
Office, Washington, DC 20402, (202) 
512–1800. 

When ordering hard-copy 
subscription(s), be sure to specify the 
State(s) of interest, since subscriptions 
may be ordered for any or all of the six 
separate Volumes, arranged by State. 
Subscriptions include an annual edition 
(issued in January or February) which 
includes all current general wage 
determinations for the States covered by 
each volume. Throughout the remainder 
of the year, regular weekly updates will 
be distributed to subscribers.

Signed at Washington, DC this 9th day of 
October 2003. 
Terry Sullivan, 
Acting Chief, Branch of Construction Wage 
Determinations.
[FR Doc. 03–26045 Filed 10–16–03; 8:45 am] 
BILLING CODE 4510–27–M

NATIONAL FOUNDATION ON THE 
ARTS AND THE HUMANITIES 

National Endowment for the Arts; 
President’s Committee on the Arts and 
the Humanities: Meeting #54 

Pursuant to section 10 (a)(2) of the 
Federal Advisory Committee Act (Public 
Law 92–463), as amended, notice is 
hereby given that a meeting of the 
President’s Committee on the Arts and 
the Humanities will be held on 
Thursday, November 6, 2003 from 9 
a.m. to approximately 12 p.m. The 
meeting will be held in the Potomac 
Room at the St. Regis Hotel, 923 16th 
Street, NW., Washington, DC. 

The Committee meeting will begin at 
9 a.m. with a welcome, introduction of 
new staff members, announcements, 
and remarks by Adair Margo, Committee 
Chairman. The meeting will include 
updates on Youth Orchestra of the 
Americas and Save America’s Treasures. 
The remainder of the meeting will focus 
on PCAH support for After School 
Youth Arts and Humanities programs, 
including a discussion on the Coming 
Up Taller assessment developed by the 
National Assembly of State Arts 
Agencies. The meeting will adjourn 
following Closing Remarks. 

The President’s Committee on the 
Arts and the Humanities was created by 
Executive Order in 1982 to advise the 
President, the two Endowments, and the 
Institute of Museum and Library 
Services on measures to encourage 
private sector support for the nation’s 

cultural institutions and to promote 
public understanding of the arts and the 
humanities. 

Any interested persons may attend as 
observers, on a space available basis, but 
seating is limited. Therefore, for this 
meeting, individuals wishing to attend 
must contact Georgiana Paul of the 
President’s Committee seven days in 
advance at (202) 682–5409 or write to 
the Committee at 1100 Pennsylvania 
Avenue, NW., Suite 526, Washington, 
DC 20506. Further information with 
reference to this meeting can also be 
obtained from Ms. Paul. 

If you need special accommodations 
due to a disability, please contact Ms. 
Hoffman through the Office of 
AccessAbility, National Endowment for 
the Arts, 1100 Pennsylvania Avenue, 
NW., Washington, DC 20506, 202/682–
5532, TDY–TDD 202/682–5496, at least 
seven (7) days prior to the meeting.

Dated: October 14, 2003. 
Kathy Plowitz-Worden, 
Panel Coordinator, Panel Operations, 
National Endowment for the Arts.
[FR Doc. 03–26354 Filed 10–16–03; 8:45 am] 
BILLING CODE 7537–01–P

NATIONAL FOUNDATION ON THE 
ARTS AND THE HUMANITIES 

National Endowment for the Arts; 
Combined Arts Advisory Panel 

Pursuant to section 10(a)(2) of the 
Federal Advisory Committee Act (Public 
Law 92–463), as amended, notice is 
hereby given that a meeting of the 
Combined Arts Advisory Panel, Arts 
Education section (Learning in the Arts 
for Children and Youth category, Music, 
Musical Theater, Opera, & Theater) to 
the National Council on the Arts will be 
held on November 3–7, 2003 in Room 
714 at the Nancy Hanks Center, 1100 
Pennsylvania Avenue, NW., 
Washington, DC 20506. 

A portion of this meeting, from 12:30 
p.m. to 1:30 p.m. on November 7th, will 
be open to the public for policy 
discussion. The remaining portions of 
this meeting, from 9 a.m. to 6 p.m. on 
November 3rd, 5th, and 6th, from 9:30 
a.m. to 6 p.m. on November 4th, and 
from 9 a.m. to 12:30 p.m. and 1:30 p.m. 
to 3:45 p.m. on November 7th, will be 
closed. 

The closed portions of these meetings 
are for the purpose of Panel review, 
discussion, evaluation, and 
recommendation on applications for 
financial assistance under the National 
Foundation on the Arts and the 
Humanities Act of 1965, as amended, 
including information given in 
confidence to the agency by grant 
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